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Meth/Sawed-off Shotgun 
Nets Prison Time 

EUGENE, Ore.—Theron Gilbert Geber, 
36, a resident of Coos Bay, Oregon, was 
sentenced to five years in federal prison 
followed by a four-year term of super-
vised release for distributing metham-
phetamine and unlawfully possessing 
sawed-off shotguns.  According to court 
documents, in March 2019, agents from 
the Bureau of Alcohol, Tobacco, Fire-
arms, and Explosives (ATF) learned that 
Gerber, who had prior state felony con-
victions, was selling firearms and meth-
amphetamine in the Coos Bay area.  On 
April 4, 2019, an undercover ATF agent 
met with Gerber for a firearms purchase. 
Upon entering Gerber’s home, the agent 
saw drug paraphernalia and approxi-
mately 20 to 25 firearms displayed for 
sale. During the meeting, Gerber stated, 
“everything’s for sale for the right 
price.” Gerber then sold the agent a short
-barreled shotgun, a Glock pistol, three 
magazines, three drum magazines, and 
91 rounds of ammunition—all for $600.  
The agent arranged a second purchase 
the following week. On April 11, 2019, 
the agent again met with Gerber inside 
his residence. This time, the agent pur-
chased an AK-style rifle for $500 and 
asked if Gerber would sell methamphet-
amine. Gerber agreed to sell the agent 
approximately 13 grams of methamphet-
amine for $240.  Finally, on April 25, 
2019, the agent brokered a third firearm 
purchase from Gerber. Gerber sold the 

agent a second sawed-off shotgun, an 
AR-style pistol, 181 rounds of assorted 
ammunition, six 30-round AR-style 
magazines, and a Colt .45 caliber “Night 
Defender” pistol for $1,500. A short 
time later, ATF agents executed a search 
warrant on Gerber’s residence and ar-
rested him.  As part of his plea agree-
ment, Gerber agreed to forfeit the fire-
arms described in the indictment.  On 
January 6, 2020, Geber pleaded guilty to 

one count each of unlawful possession 
of a short-barreled firearm and distribu-
tion of methamphetamine.  This case 
was investigated by ATF and prosecuted 
by Nathan J. Lichvarcik and William 
McLaren, Assistant U.S. Attorneys for 
the District of Oregon.  The case was 
brought as part of Project Safe Neigh-
borhoods (PSN). PSN is the centerpiece 
of the Department of Justice’s violent 
crime reduction efforts. PSN is an evi-
dence-based program proven to be effec-
tive at reducing violent crime. Through 
PSN, a broad spectrum of stakeholders 
work together to identify the most press-
ing violent crime problems in the com-
munity and develop comprehensive so-

lutions to address them. As part of this 
strategy, PSN focuses enforcement ef-
forts on the most violent offenders and 
partners with locally based prevention 
and reentry programs for lasting reduc-
tions in crime. 
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They’re our lifeline along the 
Oregon Coast for our com-
mercial fishing fleet.  The 

commercial Dungeness Crab 
Season can be one of the 

more dangerous times of year 
to be on the Pacific Ocean.  
Thankfully, the U.S. Coast 

Guard personnel are strategi-
cally positioned along our 

Coast to respond quickly to 
emergencies, either by heli-

copter or motor life boat. 



Drones over  
the Bay Area 

City of Coos Bay release - On Tuesday 
night, Feb. 4, the Coos Bay City Council 
approved the acceptance of a State 
Homeland Security Grant for the pur-
chase of two drones. These small un-
manned aircraft systems will be shared 
by the fire and police departments of 
Coos Bay and North Bend in a new inter
-agency program. Fire and police agen-
cies are using this technology for aerial 
imaging or reconnaissance. Examples of 
some of the applications include Search 
and Rescue missions, suspect pursuit, 
active shooter scene surveillance, evalu-
ation of fire conditions and spread, and 
post-disaster damage assessment.  
Drones can provide real-time aerial im-
ages and video in both high definition 
resolution and thermal imaging without 
putting personnel at risk. Drones are 
lightweight, easy to deploy and operate. 
They provide a perspective that helps 
firefighters and law enforcement officers 
better understand the scope of the inci-
dent and develop an informed operations 
plan. The thermal imaging aspect allows 
the operator to see through smoke, fog, 
or darkness.  The Coos County Sheriff’s 
Office has two drones, but the addition 
of these tools along with trained pilots 
dedicated to the Coos Bay/North Bend 
area allows for a timely response. They 
also add to the County’s resources for 
response to larger incidents. Coos Bay 
chose to include the North Bend agen-
cies in the program to provide compre-

hensive coverage of the whole bay area, 
which creates reasonable redundancy 
and strengthens the partnerships between 
the cities. Each agency will have at least 

two trained and licensed pilots. Training 
of these pilots will begin this spring and 
the program should be operational by 
July of 2020.  The amount of the grant 
award is $10,700 and will cover the cost 
of two drones and the training of pilots.   

Child Vaped 
NBPD release - On Monday, February 
10, 2020, a suspicious video was report-
ed to North Bend High School staff and 
the North Bend Police Department 
School Resource Officer (SRO). The 
video involved a juvenile teen placing an 
inhalant delivery system (vape device) 
into an 8-month-old infant's mouth. Law 
enforcement obtained a copy of the vid-
eo, identified a 15-year-old female sus-
pect, and interviewed the teen. The fe-
male was babysitting the male infant in a 
North Bend home at the time of the inci-
dent this past weekend. The incident has 
been cross-reported to the Department of 
Human Services / Child Protective Ser-
vices. The investigation into this inci-
dent is ongoing.  We want to thank those 
who reported the incident to our school 
staff, our SRO, and our Department. It 
was this quick reporting that led to a 
prompt investigation and identification 
of those involved. 

Empire Stabbing 
A reported fight between two transients 
in the Empire District of Coos Bay 
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Out of 123,000 Certified Instructors in the US, 
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2011, ranked #2 in 2012.   
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Classes upstair Pony Village Mall, North Bend 
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⚫ Get all 3 Permits in one Class 

Concealed Carry  

Permit Classes 

Joe Holdmann, Instructor 

Just an example of an “Eye in the Sky.”  Bay Area law enforcement 
is looking at purchasing Drones and has grants funds.  The RMUS 

Law Enforcement Drone®  - Heavy Duty -  is a Ready to Deploy 
package.  This dual thermal and daytime camera is gimbalized to 
provide remote control movement and stabilization in flight.  The 

thermal camera can be used for daytime operations as well as 
night operations.  The optical camera provides 4k resolution. Video 

feeds from the cameras can be viewed simultaneously. 



Thursday evening, Feb. 6, led to a man-
hunt complete with K9 units and police 
officers from four law enforcement 
agencies.  According to reports, the fight 
was reported in a wooded area at the 
north end of Morrison St.  A victim was 
discovered with an apparent stab wound.  
That person was transported to Bay Area 
Hospital in Coos Bay.  The suspect was 
described as “armed & dangerous.”  
CBPD release - On Thursday, February 
6, 2020, at about 4:08 PM Coos Bay 
Police and Oregon State Police respond-
ed to the area of Morrison Street just 
north of Newmark Avenue for a reported 
dispute.  When Officer’s arrived, they 
located a 49-year-old male reporting he 
was stabbed by another male.  Officer’s 
from the Coos Bay Police Department, 
North Bend Police Department, Coos 
County Sheriff’s Office, and Oregon 
State Police quickly contained the area 
and began attempted to locate the sus-
pect with the assistance of Coos County 
Sheriff’s Sergeant Slater and his canine 
partner Odin.  The suspect was not im-
mediately located, but several pieces of 
evidence were located.  The investiga-
tion is continuing. Coos Bay Officers 

believe they know the identity of the 
suspect(s) and are actively attempting to 
locate those involved.  At this time, it is 
not believed that the suspect(s) in this 
case pose a risk to public safety.  More 
information will be made available to 
the public regarding this case in the 
coming days. 

Empire Stabbing Update 
CBPD release - The stabbing victim in 
Thursday’s dispute was treated and re-
leased from Bay Area Hospital Thursday 
night (Feb. 6) with minor, non-life-
threatening injuries.  Officers learned the 
dispute was between two adult males 
known to each other, and there are no 
indications of any risk to the safety of 
the general public.  The investigation is 
continuing.  The Coos Bay Police De-
partment requests anyone who witnessed 
the dispute contact the department at 541
-269-8911 option 1, or the Coos Stop 
Crime hotline at 541-267-6666. 

Empire Stabbing 
CBPD release - On Thursday, February 
6, 2020, at about 4:08 PM Coos Bay 
Police and Oregon State Police respond-
ed to the area of Morrison Street just 

north of Newmark Avenue for a reported 
dispute.  When Officer’s arrived, they 
located a 49-year-old male reporting he 
was stabbed by another male.  Officer’s 
from the Coos Bay Police Department, 
North Bend Police Department, Coos 
County Sheriff’s Office, and Oregon 
State Police quickly contained the area 
and began attempted to locate the sus-
pect with the assistance of Coos County 
Sheriff’s Sergeant Slater and his canine 
partner Odin.  The suspect was not im-
mediately located, but several pieces of 
evidence were located.  The investiga-
tion is continuing. Coos Bay Officers 
believe they know the identity of the 
suspect(s) and are actively attempting to 
locate those involved.  At this time, it is 
not believed that the suspect(s) in this 
case pose a risk to public safety.  More 
information will be made available to 
the public regarding this case in the 
coming days. 

Empire Stabbing Update 
CBPD release - On February 6, 2020 the 
Coos Bay Police Department began an 
investigation of a stabbing that occurred 
in the Empire Area of Coos Bay.  Since 
that time, the Coos Bay Police Depart-

ment, has provided the public with a 
couple press releases updating infor-
mation of the case, as well as, requesting 
assistance in the locating of all parties 
involved.  As of today, The Coos Bay 
Police Department has made contact 
with all parties directly involved in the 
incident and no suspect remains at large.  
The investigation is ongoing at this time, 
and no arrests have been made.  The 
investigation, once complete, will be 
forwarded over to the District Attorney’s 
Office for their review. 

5 Impaired drivers  
arrested by Coos Bay 

Police in January 
CBPD release - In January the Coos Bay 
Police Department arrested 5 drivers for 
DUII.  All 5 arrests were made during 
regular patrols. Of the 5 arrests, 2 were 
alcohol related DUII arrests and 3 arrests 
were of drug impaired drivers.  On Janu-
ary 12th the Coos Bay Police Depart-
ment participated in a random DUII en-
forcement operation. Although there 
were no DUII arrests made during the 
operation, two subjects that fled from a 
traffic stop were apprehended and trans-
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ported to jail. The passenger who fled on 
foot was charged with a probation viola-
tion and interfering with police. The 
driver who fled the stop in her vehicle 
was taken into custody for probation 
violation and felony elude. DUII en-
forcement operations are sponsored by 
Oregon Impact and ODOT.  The Coos 
Bay Police Department will have addi-
tional officers out periodically through-
out the month of February for DUII en-
forcement. 

Police Officer Training 
The Oregon Department of Public Safety 
Standards and Training (DPSST) is 
pleased to announce the graduation of its 
395th Basic Police Class.  The Basic 
Police Class is 16-weeks in length and 
includes dozens of training areas includ-
ing survival skills, firearms, emergency 
vehicle operations, ethics, cultural diver-
sity, problem solving, community polic-
ing, elder abuse, drug recognition, and 
dozens of other subjects.  Basic Police 
Class 395 graduated at the Oregon Pub-
lic Safety Academy at 4190 Aumsville 
Hwy SE in Salem, Oregon on Friday, 
February 14, 2020 at 11:00 a.m. The 
graduating students appreciate the fami-
ly, friends and guests who make gradua-
tion an appropriate conclusion to their 
basic training at the Oregon Public Safe-
ty Academy.  Graduating members of 
BP395 assigned to the South Coast:  
Police Officer Christopher Sparks, Coos 
Bay Police Department. 
 
 

 

Coos Co. 
 
 

Cedar Bough Thefts 
Fall Ck, MP, CCSO release - On Janu-
ary 17, 2020, the Coos County Sheriff’s 
Office received a report of an active 
cedar theft occurring in the Fall Creek 
area in Myrtle Point. Deputies responded 
to the area and were unable to locate the 
suspect, but did locate the area where 
two cedar trees were cut and cedar bolts 
stolen. The area was Bureau of Land 
Management Property. Deputies re-
ceived information from a witness about 
the suspect vehicle and license plate.  On 
January 20, 2020, a Deputy and BLM 
Law Enforcement Ranger went to the 
registered address of the suspect vehicle 
in the 1600 block of Maple St in Myrtle 
Point. There, officers for the suspect 
vehicle and a large amount of cedar bolts 
in the yard.  Officers made contact with 
James Baker, who later admitted to 
stealing the cedar bolts from the Fall 
Creek area. Officers seized the stolen 
cedar bolts from the property. James 
Baker, 31 years old of Myrtle Point, was 
issued a criminal citation and released.  
Officers later received a timber value 
estimate that put the value of the two 
trees at over $1500.00. Baker will also 
be charged with Theft in the First De-
gree. Coos County Sheriff’s Office was 
assisted in the investigation by Law En-

forcement Rangers with Bureau of Land 
Management. 

Lockdown at  
Lighthouse School 

CCSO release - On February 14th, 2020 
at 1156 hours, Deputies were dis-
patched to 63656 Brookwood Road in 
Coos Bay for a third hand report of a 
male beating up an elderly woman.  As 
a Deputy was pulling up to the resi-
dence, the suspect, 25 year old Shawn 
M. Hampton fled back inside the resi-
dence with a knife. The female victim 
was standing in the roadway crying. 
The victim told the Deputy that Shawn 
had stated that anybody that went into 
the residence would be killed.  Within 
minutes and before the Deputy could 
apply for a search warrant to enter the 
residence and take Shawn into custody, 
Shawn fled out the back of the resi-
dence and towards the Light House 
School. The Coos County Sheriff’s Of-
fice had the Light House School placed 
on lockdown for the safety of the chil-
dren and the staff.  Sergeant Slater and 
K9 Odin arrived on scene and began 
tracking the suspect. Oregon State Po-
lice Trooper’s and North Bend Police 
School Resource Officers responded to 
assist.  Shortly after, K9 Odin located 
Shawn. Shawn attempted to stab K9 
Odin with a kitchen knife while being 

taken into custody. K9 Odin’s harness 
protected him and Odin was not injured. 
Shawn received minor injuries and was 
treated and cleared for incarceration.  

              Coos County Cops, March 2020, page 5 

Lakeside Towing & Service 
Affordable, Local, & Available 24/7 

 

Lakeside Store & Lock 
Convenient & Secure Self Storage Units 

115 Airport Way, Lakeside 

(541) 759-3234 
Open Mon.-Sat.—9 am to 5 pm 

24 Hr. Towing 
Gas Delivery 
Jump Starts 

Lockouts 
Auto Repairs 

Computerized Diagnostics 

(541) 759-3234 



During the investigation it was deter-
mined that Shawn had punched his 
mother multiple times. It was also deter-
mined that Shawn had shoved his moth-
er down and held a knife to her. After 
Shawn’s mother had fled and attempted 
to call 911 he took the phone from her. 
Shawn had broken two other phones 
inside the residence while his Mother 
had attempted to call family members 
for help.  Shawn was lodged the Coos 
County Jail for Domestic Menacing, 
Two Counts of Unlawful Use of a 
Weapon, Domestic Harassment, Interfer-
ing with making a 911 call, Interfering 
with a Police Animal, and Escape in the 
Second Degree.  The Coos County Sher-
iff’s Office would like to thank the Ore-
gon State Police and the North Bend 
Police Department for their assistance. 
We would also like to thank the Light 
House School for promptly placing the 
school on lock down for the safety of the 
children and the staff. 

Into the Bay 
CCSO release - On February 19th, 2020, 
at approximately 1850 hours, the Coos 
County Sheriff’s Office received the 
report of a trespass at 91133 Cape Arago 
Highway (the Old General Store) in 
Coos Bay. The reporting party informed 
Dispatch that the male, later identified as 
19 year old Peter Melnik, has been pre-
viously trespassed from the store and 
was currently refusing to leave.  The 
Deputy requested assistance from the 
BLM Rangers, who were in the area, to 
contact the Peter as the Deputy was en 
route. BLM Rangers and Deputies con-
tacted Peter inside the High Tide Café 
and requested for him to speak with 
them outside the establishment. Once 
outside, Peter gave Deputies a false 
name, and then ran from the officers 
towards the water.  With the quick re-
sponse of the United States Coast Guard, 
as well as Bay Cities Ambulance, Offic-
ers were prepared to recover Peter from 
a small landing in the water during low-
tide. Officers were able to get Peter out 
of the water and he was transported to 
Bay Area Hospital by Bay Cities Ambu-
lance to be evaluated by Medical staff. 
Peter was issued a citation in lieu of cus-
tody for Disorderly Conduct in the Sec-
ond Degree, Escape in the Third Degree 
& Interfering with a Peace Officer. 
 

Strangulation 
Grinnell Ln., CB, CCSO release - On 
February 22nd, 2020, at approximately 
0502 hours, the Coos County Sheriff’s 
Office received the report of an assault 
that occurred on Grinnell Lane in Coos 
Bay. The Reporting Party informed Dis-
patch she had been assaulted by her fian-
cé, 55 year old Cy Woodward. It was 
discovered that Cy had an active warrant 
for his arrest.  As Deputies were re-

sponding to the residence, Cy was re-
ported as arming himself with knives, 
homemade weapons and a shield inside 
the kitchen. Cy also made statements 
that he was not going to go “Alive.” 
North Bend Police Department also re-
sponded to assist.  Deputies arrived on 
scene with North Bend Police. While 
speaking with the original caller, Cy 
exited the house and was placed into 
custody without further incident. Both 
individuals stated they had been arguing 
most of the day, as the caller had made 
several attempts to call 9-1-1 but was 
unsuccessful due to Cy’s efforts. During 
the dispute, Cy caused physical injury to 
and at one point was on top of the caller 
causing her to have issues breathing.  Cy 
was transported to the Coos County Jail, 
where he was booked and lodged for the 
Warrant, Assault IV (Domestic) & 
Strangulation (Domestic). 

Probation Violation 
Greenacres Ln. & Luscombe Lp., CCSO 
release - On February 26, 2020, at about 
2245 hours, a Sergeant from the Coos 
County Sheriff’s Office was stationary 
in the area of Luscombe Loop and 
Greenacres Lane. Due to a recent rash of 
burglaries in the area, Deputies from the 
Coos County Sheriff’s Office have been 
increasing their patrol presence in the 
area.  While there, the Sergeant observed 
a vehicle proceed through the intersec-
tion of Luscombe Loop and Greenacres 

Lane without coming to a stop. Based 
upon the observed violation of Fail to 
Obey a Traffic Control Device (Stop 
Sign), the Sergeant stopped the vehicle.  
Upon contacting the driver, he was iden-
tified as 52 year old Troy Newsted. 
Newsted was confirmed to be on proba-
tion and his probation officer was con-
tacted who requested Newsted be de-
tained. Newsted was arrested without 
incident and transported to the Coos 
County Jail for a probation violation. 

Troy Newsted 
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WB Teen Shoots up 
House 

DCSO release - WINCHESTER BAY, 
Ore. - On Thursday, February 13, 2020, 
at approximately 9:17 pm, deputies were 
dispatched to a residence in the 73000-
block of Highway 101 in Winchester 
Bay for a report of a 17 year-old male 
who was shooting a gun inside a home 
following a disturbance.  Deputies, 
along with multiple law enforcement 
agencies responded to the residence. The 
teen was taken into custody at 9:56 pm, 
without further incident.  Deputies 
learned that the teen became upset with 
his mother over his cell phone and 
then proceeded to assault her, before 
being stopped by his father.  Following 
the assault, the teen retrieved an AR-15 
rifle and began to fire it multiple times 
inside the home causing a significant 
amount of damage. At one point, he 
pointed the firearm at his father, but did 
not fire it. No one was injured during the 
incident. The teen was transported to and 
lodged at the Douglas County Juvenile 
Detention Facility on the following 
charges: Unlawful Use of a Weapon; 
Pointing a Firearm at Another; 1st De-
gree Criminal Mischief; Menacing x2; 
4th Degree Assault. 

Despondent Juvenile 
On February 14th, 2020 at 4:00 PM, 
Lincoln County Sheriff's Deputies were 

dispatched to an armed juvenile outside 
the Siletz Valley School.  The caller to 
dispatch was a staff member at the 
school.  The staff member told dis-
patch the areas of the school near the 
subject had been evacuated and school 
staff were trying to speak with her.  The 
subject, a 12-year-old student, was de-
spondent and threatening to harm herself 
with a knife.  On-shift members of Lin-
coln County's Tactical Response Team 
(TRT) were the first to arrive. TRT 
members deployed with concealed less-
lethal force options to ensure the area 
was safe and keep the juvenile's behav-
ior from escalating until additional per-
sonnel could be summoned.  Trained 
negotiators from the newly-formed Cri-
sis Negotiations Team arrived and began 
communicating with the juvenile.  The 
juvenile agreed to surrender the knife 
after about 45 minutes of negotia-
tions.  She was taken into protective 
custody by members of the TRT without 
further incident.  Neither the juvenile or 
any responders sustained injury after law 
enforcement arrived.  Members of the 
Siletz Valley Fire District and Pacific 
West Ambulance assisted at the sce-
ne.  The Lincoln County Sheriff's Office 
thanks the staff members of the Siletz 
Valley School for their quick reaction 
and compassionate response to a student 
in crisis. 

Plane Crash 
A single-engine Cessna airplane, carry-
ing just a pilot, crashed into Humboldt 
Bay at Eureka, CA Thursday morning 
Feb. 6.  The pilot was reportedly trying 
to land at Murray Field in dense fog.  
Fire and rescue personnel responded 
about 7:24 a.m.  The US Coast Guard 
dispatched a helicopter and a 29-foot 

Response Boat Small boatcrew.  A small 
boat from the Humboldt Bay Port Au-
thority rescued the uninjured pilot.   

Crashed into a House 
On Wednesday, January 29, 2020 at 
about 5:51 AM, Lincoln City Police 
Officers responded to a report of a motor 
vehicle crashing into a house in the area 
of NW 20th Street and NW Keel. When 
officers arrived on scene they found that 
a vehicle had crashed through a land-
scape hedge, into the porch of a resi-
dence, and continued through a detached 
garage building and a chain link fence 
before coming to a stop in the neighbor-
ing residence trees and bushes. The 
crash caused extensive damage to the 
house and detached garage building. The 
involved vehicle, a 2005 GMC Denali, 

also sustained substantial damage and 
was disabled and stuck in a neighboring 
residence landscape.  The subsequent 
investigation determined that the driver 
of the Denali at the time of the crash, 
identified as 21-year-old Brett A Delga-
do of Lincoln City, had actually crashed 
into the residence and garage building at 
about 4:30 AM, but had walked to a 
friend’s house and the friend called the 
police. The driver reported he had been 
driving south on NW Keel and claimed 
he fell asleep before crashing into the 
house and garage.  The owner of the 
house was not home at the time of the 
crash and no injuries were reported as a 
result of the crash. Mr. Delgado was 
issued criminal citations charging him 
with Reckless Driving and Criminal 
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Mischief II. He was released at the sce-
ne. The Denali was towed from the sce-
ne by Car Care Towing.  The members 
of the Lincoln City Police Department 
would like to remind all drivers to stay 
alert while driving and to use extra cau-
tion especially with the wet roads and 
inclement weather which can cause de-
creased visibility and longer stopping 
distances.  

Transient Garbage 
Dump 

Seven dump truck loads of trash were 
removed from a transient camp in the 
Brookings area Wednesday, Feb. 12.  
According to Curry Co. Sheriff John 
Ward, the property near South Bank 
Chetco and Lower Harbor roads, is 
county property.  Hundreds of rats were 
found at the dump site when crew mem-
bers arrived to clean it up.  One individ-
ual, identified as 49-year old Garry Rob-
erts Jr. was arrested for Trespassing and 

Depositing Trash within a Hundred 
Yards of a Waterway.  He was lodged in 
the Curry Co. Jail at Gold Beach and 
released the next day.  Sheriff Ward says 
each dump truck load cost the county 
$600 each.   

Bias Crime Statement 
from OPRD Director 

Oregon Parks and Recreation Director 

Lisa Sumption today issued a statement 
about the conviction of an Idaho man 
who brutally assaulted a transgender 
woman at Agate Beach State Recreation 
Site in August 2019.  Idaho resident 
Fred Costanza was found guilty in Lin-
coln County Court January 29, 2020 of 
first-degree bias crime, second-degree 
assault and harassment after an attack 
that injured Lauren Jackson, 29, a new-
comer to Oregon. Jackson was severely 
injured, suffering a skull fracture and a 
broken jaw.  “There is no place for this 

kind of hate and violence anywhere,” 
said Sumption. “And especially not in 
our state parks, places specifically meant 
to welcome all of us, and to inspire 
peace and joy. We stand with Lauren 
Jackson, and will continue to work 
with the community to make our public 
spaces reflect Oregon values."  Sump-
tion said that the perpetrator is currently 
banned from all state parks in Lincoln 
county. “It is the only tool we have at 
our disposal to send the strongest mes-
sage possible. We welcome all who re-
spect the law and respect the rights of 
our fellow human beings.” 

Oregon's Car  
Care Program 

The Lincoln County Sheriff’s Office has 
enrolled in Oregon’s Car Care Pro-
gram.  This program is a partnership 
between the Oregon State Police, Ore-
gon State Sheriff’s Association, and Or-
egon Association of Chiefs of Police, to 
assist individuals and families with im-
proving the safety of their cars.  Many 
people defer small repairs and mainte-
nance on their vehicles in favor of other 

critical household expenses.  Oregon’s 
Car Care Program is a voucher system 
that provides discounts at local auto 
parts stores so drivers can purchase, re-
pair, or replace defective equip-
ment.  We hope this will allow people to 
fix safety issues with their vehicles and 

make Lincoln County roads safer for all 
motorists.  Deputies observing equip-
ment violations on vehicles they have 
stopped will be offering the vouch-
ers.  Vouchers issued in Lincoln County 
may be used at any of the growing list of 
participating retailers state-wide.  Those 
retailers include: Advance Auto Parts, 
Battery Systems, Baxter Auto Parts, 
Carquest Auto Parts, Clackamas Auto 
Parts, Milex Complete Auto Care, Mt. 
Angel Auto Body, Napa Auto Parts, and 
White's Collision. 

Raising Money for a K9 
The members of the Lincoln City Police 
Department are pleased to announce that 
the fundraising efforts for the depart-
ments K-9 program has successfully 
reached its initial goal of $75,000.00. 
We would like to take the opportunity to 
sincerely thank all the citizens, business-
es and organizations who so generously 
donated to the fund raising efforts for the 
department to obtain and implement a K
-9 program. The response and support 
from the public has been phenomenal 
and we sincerely appreciate the generos-
ity from our community members and 

Garry Roberts Jr. 
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businesses, as well as those outside the 
community who stepped up and made 
this program happen. A special thank 
you is also offered to Meredith Lodging 
along with Oksenholt Capital, who put 
out a matching funds challenge that 
helped push the fundraising efforts up to 
and over the initial goal. Their media 
information letter is attached along with 
this media release.  With the initial fund-
raising goal reached, the department will 
be beginning the process of selecting an 
officer to be the K-9 handler and then 
going through the process of selecting 
the right K-9 for our intended mission. 
The process of matching a handler and K
-9 and having them complete the re-
quired training is expected to take sever-
al more months before the K-9 team will 
patrolling our streets.  Donations toward 
the K-9 program will continue to be ac-
cepted and used towards the continued 
maintenance of the K-9 program in gen-
eral. Donations can be made to the pro-
gram in the following ways: through a 
Go Fund Me account at https://
www.gofundme.com/lincoln-city-k9-
program-fund, or at 
www.lincolncityk9.com. Donations can 
also be mailed to the Lincoln City Police 
Department, Attention K-9 Fund, 1503 
SE East Devils Lake Road, Lincoln City, 
OR, 97367.  The Lincoln City Police 
Department would again like to express 
our gratitude and appreciation to all of 
those who have already supported and 
donated to the Lincoln City Police De-
partment K-9 program. If you have any 
questions about K-9 Fund donations or 
the K-9 program in general please con-
tact the Lincoln City Police Department 
at 541-994-3636 and we would be glad 
to talk with you.   

Hwy. 101 Fatal Curry Co. 
On Monday, February 17, 2020 at ap-
proximately 3:00 P.M., Oregon State 
Police and emergency personnel re-
sponded to a vehicle crash on Hwy 101 
near milepost 323.  Preliminary investi-
gation revealed that a red Ford Ranger 
pickup, operated by Jerry Vanhoosen 
(70) of Kerman, CA. had been north-
bound on Hwy 101 when it left the road-
way, impacted a tree, and came to rest in 
a ravine.  Vanhoosen was pronounced 
deceased.  Vanhoosen had been reported 

missing to the Brookings Police Depart-
ment on February 11 and it is believed 
the last known contact with Vanhoosen 
was on February 8.  Brookings Police 
Department had been actively looking 
for Vanhoosen with assistance from the 
Curry County Sheriff's Office Search 
and Rescue. 

Central Coast Search 
Warrant 

On February 6, 2020, the Street Crimes 
Response Team (SCRT) along with Lin-
coln City Police, Toledo Police, and 
McMinnville Police executed a search 
warrant at the residence located at 2333 
NE 29th Street in Lincoln City. One of 
the residents, 60-year-old Daryl Donat, 
of Lincoln City, was arrested after many 
months of compiling evidence regarding 

his involvement in buying and selling 
illegal narcotics. Also arrested at the 
residence during the warrant service was 
59-year-old Melody Goodmanson, also 
of Lincoln City.  During the warrant 
execution the SCRT seized quantities of 
suspected methamphetamine as well as 
other items including narcotics parapher-
nalia such as digital scales and plastic 

baggies. There were also two children 
living in Donat’s residence.  Donat was 
lodged at the Lincoln County Jail for, 
Delivery / Possession / Manufacturing of 
Methamphetamine and two counts of 
First Degree Child Neglect. His bail was 
set at $500,000.00.  Goodmanson was 
lodged at the Lincoln County Jail for 
Possession of Methamphetamine. Her 
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bail was set at $15,000.00.  The Street 
Crimes Response Unit (SCRT) is a 
county-wide team designed to augment 
the Patrol Division.  This team specializ-
es in the handling of community impact 
crimes, such as narcotics investigations, 
burglaries, and repeat offenders and does 
so by investigating these crimes thor-
oughly.  The SCRT is made up of mem-
bers of the Newport Police and the Lin-
coln City Police Departments 
and routinely obtains assistance from the 
Toledo Police Department and Lincoln 
County Sheriff’s Office.  LCPD would 

like to express our thanks to McMin-
nville Police drug-detection K9 Tucker 
and his handler, who assisted in this in-
vestigation.  The Lincoln City Police 
Department encourages citizens to report 
any suspicious activity they witness, as 
it may assist law enforcement. The 
LCPD Drug Tip Line is available at 541-
994-9800. 

Central Coast Crime 
Spree 

On February 25, 2020 at approximately 
8:36 AM Lincoln County Sheriff's Of-
fice responded to the Salishan Golf 
Course on a report a silver SUV travel-
ing down the golf cart path and through 
portions of the golf course. The caller 
reported the SUV was stopped by an 
employee. The employee contacted two 
middle aged males in the vehicle. A 
brief confrontation ensued regarding the 
subjects trespassing. The suspects then 
fled the scene at a high rate of speed.  
Lincoln County Sheriff's Deputies were 
not in the area at the time of call and 

began their response. At 8:48 AM Lin-
coln County Sheriff's Deputies received 
a second call from a homeowner near 
mile post 5 on Siletz Hwy. The home-
owner reported an unknown male had 
entered his home and caused a confron-
tation before fleeing the house. The 
homeowner reported seeing a second 
male and a silver SUV.   At 8:59 AM 
while Deputies and Troopers with the 
Oregon State Police responded to report 
of the burglary a third call was reported 
to 911. The caller, an elderly female, 
reported while driving south on Siletz 
Highway near mile post 5, she was 
flagged down by two men standing next 
to a silver SUV. She reported one of the 
men attempted to force his way into her 
vehicle. Law enforcement officials ar-
rived shortly after and contacted the sus-
pects in the silver SUV. The investiga-
tion revealed Damon Michael Hodge age 
46 from Portland and his passenger 
Mark Alan Hays age 48 also from Port-
land trespassed at the Salishan Golf 
Course. After leaving the golf course 

they traveled to Siletz Hwy near S. Alta 
Drive where their vehicle ran out of gas. 
Michael Hodge entered a nearby home 
and was confronted by the homeowner 
where he fled from the home. During 
this time a passing motorist was flagged 
down by the two men. The motorist 
stopped to check on them. At this time 
Mark Hays grabbed the passenger door 
handle and began forcibly trying to open 
it. The passenger door was locked pre-
venting the Hays from entering the vehi-
cle. The motorist sped away from the 
scene and called 911.  Michael Hodge 
was lodged at the Lincoln County Jail on 
the following charges: Criminal Tres-
pass I, Criminal Trespass II, Burglary I, 
Attempted Robbery in the third degree, 
Attempted Unlawful Entry into a Motor 
Vehicle and Attempted Unauthorized of 
a Use Motor Vehicle his bail was set at 
$212,500.00. Mark Hays was lodged at 
the Lincoln County jail on the same 
charges with the addition of Driving 
Under the Influence, Reckless Driving 
and Driving While Revoked (Felony). 
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His bail was set at $292,500.00. If you 
believe you may have witnessed this 
vehicle or any police action involving 
this vehicle the Lincoln County Sheriff's 
Office would like to speak to you. Please 
call 541 265 0777 and ask for Senior 
Deputy Boys case number 20s-00461. 

Missing Fisherman 
Found 

The body of a missing fisherman from 
the Central Coast has been found float-
ing in Yaquina Bay at Newport.  Nor-
man Grant, a crew member on the com-
mercial fishing vessel “Prolifik” was 
reported missing Feb. 8.  He was last 
seen near the boat’s moorage.  A search, 
including divers, did not locate Grant.  
However, on Feb. 26, another fishing 
vessel reported hitting something near 
the Hallmark Fisheries Dock.  A local 
diver found clothing tangled in the pro-
peller.  A further search led to the dis-
covery of Grant’s body. 
 

 
USCG 

 
 

USCG Airlift at  
Loon Lake 

NORTH BEND, Ore. – A Coast Guard 
helicopter crew airlifted a 65-year-old 
man Friday stranded near Loon Lake.  

The man had been reported missing 
Wednesday but was located by a Doug-
las County search and rescue team Fri-
day morning, Feb. 21.  The Oregon 
search and rescue coordinator contacted 
the Coast Guard for interagency assis-
tance due to the area’s difficult terrain, 
which made a ground evacuation too 
dangerous.  An MH-65 Dolphin helicop-
ter from Coast Guard Sector North Bend 
launched from Air Station North Bend at 
1 p.m. and arrived at the scene at 2:15 
p.m.  The man was hoisted from his lo-
cation and taken to Coast Guard Air 
Station North Bend, where they landed 
at 4 p.m.  The man was transferred to 
emergency medical service technicians 
waiting at the air station.  He was report-
ed to be suffering from hypothermia and 
dehydration.  "The Coast Guard works 
closely with state and local agencies to 
keep people safe, and this case demon-
strates how good communication and 
cooperation can help save lives," said 
Petty Officer Trevor Lilburn. 

USCG Rescues  
Injured Hiker 

SEATTLE – A Coast Guard helicopter 
crew medically evacuated an injured 
hiker Saturday, Feb. 22 near Olympic 
National Park.  The 26-year-old man 
reportedly fractured his ankle while hik-
ing on the Duckabush Trial, west of 
Hood Canal.  He reportedly crawled for 
eight hours before his phone acquired 
adequate signal to call 911.   A Jefferson 
County search and rescue team located 
the man at 4 a.m., rendered first aid and 
readied him for medevac.  A Coast 
Guard Air Station Port Angeles MH-65 
Dolphin helicopter crew launched at first 
light and arrived at the scene at 7 a.m.  
The aircrew hoisted the man from his 
location and took him to Harborveiw 
Medical Center.  The man was reported 
to be in stable condition.   “We like to 
train for high-altitude rescues because of 
the mountainous region we operate in,” 
said Lt. Cmdr. Sam Hill, MH-65 pilot, 
Air Station Port Angeles. “Because of 
that training, we were able to overcome 
numerous environmental challenges to 
rescue the hiker from a dangerous situa-
tion. We thank Jefferson County Search 
and Rescue for their help locating the 
hiker and assisting with the hoist.” 

 
Douglas Co. 

 
Sexual Abuse Charges 

Roseburg 
On January 30th, 2020, a 32 year old 
Roseburg resident, Tristan Stanton, was 
arrested by Roseburg Police Department 
Detectives on the following charges.  
Rape in the First Degree x 2, Sodomy in 
the First Degree x 2, Unlawful Sexual 

Penetration, Sex Abuse in the First De-
gree x 2, and Harassment x 3.  His bail 
was set at 1.5 million dollars.  Detec-
tives began investigating this case when 
a victim reported it on January 27th, 
2020.  During the investigation there 
were at least three separate victims iden-
tified who alleged abuse by Stanton.  All 
three of these victims are under the age 
of 14 and are known to Stanton.  The 
investigation is still ongoing, but Stanton 
has been lodged at Douglas County Cor-
rections.  

Child Menacing in  
Douglas Co. 

GLENDALE, Ore. - On Saturday, Feb-
ruary 8, 2020, at approximately 11:41 
am, deputies were dispatched to a resi-
dence in the 800-block of Willis Avenue 
in Glendale for a subject who had barri-
caded herself in a room with a five-year-
old child with a sledge hammer.  Depu-
ties arrived to learn that 34 year-old 
Glendale resident Naomi Hope Ellis was 
in her bedroom with the child. The child 
could be heard screaming for help, so 
deputies forced their way through a bar-
ricaded door into the bedroom.  Ellis 
was holding the child with one hand and 
had the hammer above the child's head 
with the other hand. Ellis failed to com-
ply with deputies’ orders to drop the 
hammer, at which point they were able 

to physically overtake her. Ellis contin-
ued to fight with deputies at which point 
a TASER device was deployed. The 
deputies were then able safely remove 
the child and take Ellis into custo-
dy.  Ellis was transported to the Douglas 
County Jail where she was lodged on the 
following charges:  Menacing x2; Re-
sisting Arrest; Unlawful Use of a Weap-
on; Harassment; Disorderly Conduct II; 
Reckless Endangering; The child was 
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unharmed in the incident. 

Meth/Heroin Bust  
Douglas Co. 

DINT has been conducting an ongoing 
investigation into the suspected drug 
related activities at a residence in the 
Soft Winds Mobile Home Park at 401 
North Comstock Road in Suther-
lin.  Based on that investigation, detec-
tives recently developed probable cause 
for the arrest of 31 year old Georgina 
Watson, of Sutherlin, for suspected drug 
crimes to include possession and deliv-
ery of methamphetamine.  On Thursday, 
February 6th, 2020, DINT, with assis-
tance from the Sutherlin Police Depart-
ment, executed a search warrant at the 
residence.  Detectives located a substan-
tial quantity of methamphetamine as 
well as a small amount of heroin and 
numerous other drug related items.  The 
mobile home park is immediately adja-
cent to Sutherlin's West Intermediate 
School.  Per the Oregon Revised Stat-

utes, there is an additional crime for 
drug sales that occur within 1,000 feet of 
a school.  In this case, the residence in 
question is less than 500 feet from West 
Intermediate School.  Watson was ar-
rested and lodged at the Douglas County 
jail on suspicion of the following charg-
es: 2 counts of Unlawful Possession of 
Methamphetamine; 2 counts of Unlaw-
ful Delivery of Methamphetamine; 2 
counts of Unlawful Delivery of Meth-
amphetamine within 1000' of a School; 1 
count of Unlawful Possession of Heroin.  
This is not the first time DINT detec-
tives have searched this residence.  In 
August, 2019, DINT arrested 51 year old 
Eric Nelson and Georgina Watson from 
this same residence.  At that time, a 
search of Eric Nelson, Georgina Watson, 
and the residence revealed approximate-
ly 1.3 pounds of methamphetamine, and 
3.5 ounces of heroin.  Both Georgina 
Watson and Eric Nelson were charged 
with several drug crimes.  Nelson was 
convicted of multiple felonies and on 
October 15th, he received a 111 month 
prison sentence. Georgina Watson's case 
is still pending.  

Tracking Down a  
Stolen Vehicle 

ROSEBURG, Ore. - A Roseburg man is 
in jail after Douglas County Sheriff's 
Office K9 Zoro tracked him down fol-
lowing a vehicle pursuit.  On Sunday, 
February 9, 2020, at 11:55 pm, a deputy 
observed a tan 1992 Honda Accord com-
mit a traffic violation on Meadow Ave-
nue near Kerr Street. The deputy learned 
the vehicle had previously been reported 
stolen to the Springfield Police Depart-
ment.  The deputy attempted to stop the 
vehicle, at which point the driver failed 
to stop. The driver began driving south 
in the northbound lanes of travel. The 
pursuit was terminated due to safety 
concerns. As the suspect drove in the 
wrong direction, he nearly struck a re-
sponding deputy. Shortly thereafter, the 
suspect hit a van and the suspect driver 
crashed between mileposts 124 and 123 
and fled from the vehicle on foot.  K9 
Zoro tracked the suspect and located him 
along the riverbank. The suspect, 40 
year-old Matthew Kelm of Roseburg, 
was taken into custody without further 
incident.  Kelm was transported to the 
Douglas County Jail where he was 
lodged on the following charges:  At-
tempt to Elude Police – Vehicle; Reck-
less Driving; Reckless Endangering; 
Unlawful Use of a Motor Vehicle; Driv-
ing While Suspended – Felony; Arrest 
Warrants x5.  The subjects in the van 
were uninjured. The Sheriff's Office was 
assisted by the Roseburg Police Depart-
ment.  K9 Zoro, a 2 year-old German 
Shepherd, has been with the Douglas 
County Sheriff’s Office since September 
2019 and was purchased by an anony-
mous donor in the community. The 
Sheriff’s K9 program is supported finan-

cially by the Friends of Umpqua Valley 
Police K9 Programs, a nonprofit organi-
zation which holds fundraisers and re-
ceives donations from the community. 
Bailey's Veterinary Clinic provides med-
ical care for K9 Zoro while Coastal 
Farm and Home Supply provides his 
food. 

Toketee Falls Rescue 
TOKETEE, Ore. - On Sunday, February 
9, 2020, at 2:30 pm, 911 dispatchers 
received a report of a 17 year-old male 
who had fallen 100' from Toketee 
Falls.  Emergency crews were dis-
patched to the area and determined a 17 
year-old Redmond, Oregon man had 
crossed over the safety railing and had 
fallen approximately 10 feet, then slid-
ing approximately 20 feet before stop-
ping. The male suffered only minor inju-
ries. Rescue crews were able to safely 
assist him back to the trail where he 
walked back to the parking lot on his 
own.  The male was transported to Mer-
cy Medical Center by ambulance for 
evaluation.  The Douglas County Sher-
iff's Office was assisted by Douglas 
County Search and Rescue, Douglas 
County Fire District #2, REACH Air 
Ambulance, Bay Cities Ambulance and 
Oregon State Police.  The Sheriff's Of-
fice urges individuals to stay within the 
safety railings when hiking into the falls. 
Crossing the railings has previously re-
sulted in serious injuries and deaths. 

Charges Related to  
Human Trafficking 

At approximately 0357 hours on Febru-
ary 13th, 2020 Roseburg Police Officers 
observed a suspicious vehicle parked in 
the vicinity of the Roseburg Municipal 
Airport.  Officers contacted a male, 
Maurice Pierre Hurth, 41 years old of 
Suisun City, CA and 3 minor females, in 
the rental vehicle.  During the contact it 
was discovered that Hurth had multiple 
warrants for his arrest out of San Fran-
cisco, Fairfield, and Solano, Califor-
nia.  After a brief resistance, Hurth was 
arrested on those warrants.  During fur-
ther investigation it was discovered the 
three minor females were recently re-
ported missing from a youth group home 

in the Seattle, Washington area.  They 
were all taken into protective custody 
and were later transferred to the Douglas 
County Juvenile Shelter.  Evidence 
learned from this investigation led to 
Hurth being charged with the following 
crimes:  Trafficking in Persons (ORS 
163.266) X 3; Compelling Prostitution 
(ORS 167.017) X 3; Custodial Interfer-
ence in the First Degree X 3; Encourag-
ing Child Sex Abuse in the First Degree.  
Hurth remains lodged at Douglas Coun-
ty Corrections as the investigation con-
tinues. 

Missing Mushroom 
Hunter (Loon Lake) 

REEDSPORT, Ore. - On Thursday, Feb-
ruary 20, 2020, at approximately 11:00 
am, the Douglas County Sheriff's Office 
was contacted regarding an individual 
who had gone mushroom picking in the 
Elliot State Forest off of Elk Ridge Road 
near Loon Lake on Wednesday, Febru-
ary 21st and had become lost. The lost 
male was identified as 65 year-old Juan 
Pitcher of Reedsport.  Deputies were 
dispatched to the area along with Search 
and Rescue. The terrain was very steep 
and rocky with thick brush and heavy 
timber. Search Crews searched until 
nightfall on Thursday without finding 
signs of Pitcher.  The search resumed on 
Friday morning. Around noon, crews 
began hearing a voice response from a 
male which came from deep within a 
canyon. Shortly after 1:00 pm, searchers 
located Pitcher who was in poor condi-
tion. He was located at 43.5656, -
123.8672.  At the request of the Sheriff's 
Office, the Oregon State Search and 
Rescue Coordinator arranged for the 
U.S. Coast Guard to fly into the area and 
extract Pitcher out of the difficult terrain. 
He was then transported to Bay Area 
Hospital for treatment.  The Sheriff's 
Office was also assisted by Search and 
Rescue crews from Josephine, Coos, 
Curry and Del Norte (California) coun-
ties and Lower Umpqua Hospital Ambu-
lance Service.  

K9 Track Douglas Co. 
SUTHERLIN, Ore. - Two wanted Doug-
las County men are in custody after they 
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ran from law enforcement.  Shortly be-
fore 10:30 am, on Wednesday, February 
26, 2020, deputies and officers from the 
Sutherlin Police Department went to a 
residence in the 100-block of South Av-
enue looking for 25-year old Billy James 
Wells and 23 year-old Johnny Lee 
Wells, both of Sutherlin. When deputies 
arrived, Johnny fled from the home on 
foot. A perimeter was set up to contain 
the area as deputies lost sight of John-
ny.  Billy Wells was located hiding in-
side the house and was taken into custo-
dy by Sutherlin Police without inci-
dent.  Roseburg Police Department K9 
Axel was dispatched to assist deputies. 
K9 Axel began tracking and quickly lead 
officers to Johnny who failed to comply 
with commands and was apprehended 
by K9 Axel until he could be taken into 

custody. He was taken into custody on a 
property in the 12000-block of Driver 
Valley.  Both Johnny and Billy Wells 
were transported to the Douglas County 
Jail where they were lodged on the fol-
lowing:  Johnny Wells:  - Arrest War-
rant,  - Escape III,  - Criminal Trespass.  
Billy Wells: - Arrest Warrants x2. 
 
 

Police Logs 
 
 

Counterfeit 
According to an entry on the Coos Bay 
Police log for Jan. 30, 12:24 p.m., 200 
block S. 5th St., “counterfeit money.” 

Warrants 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Jan. 30, 6:11 p.m., 1700 block 
Thompson Rd., “result of assist DHS,” 
42-year old Corey Timothy Gray arrest-
ed on Umatilla Co. SO warrant charging 
Theft II, and 34-year old Donovan Anne 
Cree arrested on Umatilla Co. SO war-
rant charging Failure to Appear on Theft 
II & Criminal Trespass II charges.  Both 
transported to the Coos Co. Jail at Co-
quille. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Jan. 31, 10:15 a.m., “CCSO served 
our valid warrant” on 33-year old Shaun 
Patrick Huckabay charging Probation 
Violation on original charge of Unlawful 
Possession of Meth.   

Detainable 
According to an entry on the Coos Bay 
Police log for Jan. 31, 12:11 p.m., 1200 
block Newmark Ave., “detainable sub-
ject observed,” 31-year old Kristina 
Frickey charged with Probation Viola-
tion and transported to the Coos Co. Jail 
at Coquille. 

Detainable 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Jan. 31, 1:57 p.m., 1400 block New-
mark Ave., “observed detainable subject 
at location,” 65-year old Debar Vermil-
lion-Chery charged with Probation Vio-
lation and transported to CCJ. 

Contact 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Jan. 31, 2:45 p.m., Pacific & Was-
son, “casual contact,” 32-year old Nata-
sha Foskitt charged with Probation Vio-
lation and transported to CCJ. 

 

Shoplifter 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Jan. 31, 10:40 p.m., 1000 block 
Newmark Ave., “deputy out at location, 
employee caught a shoplifter,” 54-year 
old Troy Adam Boyer cited in lieu of 
custody for Criminal Trespass II. 

Foot Patrol 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 1, 1:12 a.m., E. Anderson & So. 
Bayshore, “result of foot patrol,” 66-year 
old Terry Lee Handsaker charged with 
Probation Violation and transported to 
CCJ. 

Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 1, 11:26 a.m., 100 block N. 
Schoneman St., “result of criminal tres-
pass complaint,” 28-year old Mikyna 
Rene Odom charged with Criminal Tres-
pass I, DUII, & Resisting Arrest.  Trans-
ported to CCJ. 

Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 1, 12:45 p.m., 500 block S. 
Cammann St., “just observed 2 subject 
going onto property next door,” 37-year 
old Robert C. Harris charged with Pro-
bation Violation and two CCSO war-
rants charging Contempt of Court.  
Transported to CCJ. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 2, 10:10 a.m., Newmark & 
Ackerman, “wanted subject observed,” 
34-year old Daniel Renee Mayer 
charged with Probation Violation & 2 
CBPD warrants charging FTA on Inter-
fering with Police & Unlawful Posses-
sion of Meth, and FTA II.  Transported 
to CCJ. 

Follow Up 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 2, 4:36 p.m., 800 block Augus-
tine, “result of follow up,” 39-year old 
Jesse Morgan Spinella arrested on 
CBPD PC for Harassment, Menacing, & 
Unlawful Use of a Weapon.  Transport-
ed to CCJ. 

Assault 
According to an entry on the CQPD log 
for Feb. 2, 9:33 p.m., 800 block No. 
Dean St., 30-year old Bobby James 
Storts charged with Criminal Mischief 
III and transported to CCJ. 

Burglary 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Jan. 31, 2:16 p.m., 2300 block Ma-
drona St., “burglary.” 

Disorderly 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Feb. 1, 8:51 a.m., Marion & Virgin-
ia, 44-year old Benedict Mendonca, 
Coos Bay, arrested on charges of Disor-
derly Conduct II and a Probation Viola-
tion Detainer.  Transported to CCJ. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
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for Feb. 1, 5:13 p.m., “Klamath Falls PD 
served our valid warrant,” on 40-year 
old Neil Patrick Fawcett charging Fail-
ure to Appear on Criminal Citation. 

Dispute 
According to an entry on the Coos Bay 
Police log for Feb. 3, 11:33 p.m., 700 
block No. 10th St., “result of possible 
dispute, dispute not as reported,” 44-year 
old Virginia Leigh Prang charged with 
Disorderly Conduct II and transported to 
the Coos Co. Jail at Coquille. 

Probation 
According to an entry on the Coos Bay 
Police log for Feb. 4, 4:43 p.m., New-
mark & Cammann, “location of detaina-
ble subject,” 29-year old William 
Vernon Emery charged with Probation 
Violation, Interfering and Resisting Ar-
rest.  Transported to the Coos Co. Jail at 
Coquille. 

Probation 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 4, 5:11 p.m., 1000 block Mary-
land Ave., “probation violation,” 22-year 
old Jacob Alvin Latta charged with Pro-
bation Violation and transported to CCJ. 

Arrest 
According to an entry on the Coquille 
Police log for Feb. 4, 8:48 a.m., 200 2nd 
St. Coos Co. Jail, “CCJ arrested subject 
on CQPD’s PC,” 27-year old Cody Aus-
tin Williams charged with Burglary I, 
Assault III & Harassment. 

Arrest 
According to an entry on the CQPD log 
for Feb. 4, 7:08 p.m., 800 block N. Cen-
tral, 49-year old Jodee Lee Lanning 
charged with Theft II and transported to 
CCJ. 

Wild Turkeys 
According to an entry on the North Bend 
Police log for Feb. 6, 8:40 a.m., New-
mark & Cedar, “officer responded, wild 
turkeys are out of the roadway.” 

Burglary 
According to an entry on the Coos Bay 
Police log for Feb. 5, 9:48 a.m., 300 
block Hull St., “burglary.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 5, 5:39 p.m., Curry Co. SO, 
“Curry Co. SO serving CBPD warrant,” 

on 32-year old Ashley Shoop charging 
Unlawful Possession of Meth.  Trans-
ported to the Coos Co. Jail at Coquille. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the North Bend 
Police log for Feb. 7, 12:12 a.m., 3400 
block Ash St., “NBPD located wanted 
subject out of CCSO,” 30-year old Ali-
cia Cross, Coos Bay, charged with Con-
tempt of Court and Contempt of Court.  
“Will be referred for PCS Meth,” trans-
ported to the Coos Co. Jail at Coquille. 

Wanted 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 6, 9:37 a.m., 1200 block Ocean 
Blvd., “observed possible wanted sub-
ject walk into location,” 34-year old 
Kayla Renee Brun arrested on Glenn Co. 
SO, (CA) warrant charging Failure to 
Appear on original charge of Dangerous 
Drugs.  Transported to CCJ. 

Welfare Check 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 6, 10:35 a.m., 200 block E. 
Johnson Ave., “result of request for wel-
fare check,” 27-year old Jessica Lee 
Scott arrested on CBPD warrant charg-
ing FTA on Unlawful Possession of 
Meth, Theft in the Second Degree and 
FTA on FTA 2nd Degree, and FTA 2nd 
Degree.  Transported to CCJ. 

Wanted 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 6, 12:50 p.m., 2000 block New-
mark Ave., “wanted subject observed 
inside store,” Shelby K. Benn arrested 
on CCSO warrant on FTA on original 
Criminal Trespass I.  Transported to 
CCJ. 

Probation 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 7, 9:54 a.m., Cammann & New-
mark, “suspicious subject,” 36-year old 
Mitchell Wayne Bissonnette arrested on 
Probation Violation Detainer and trans-
ported to CCJ. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 7, 11:28 a.m., “warrant service,” 
34-year old James Steven Spear arrested 
on CCSO warrant charging Attempt to 
Elude, Reckless Endangering & Reck-
less Driving.  Transported to CCJ. 

Shoplifter 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 7, 6:14 p.m., 1300 block New-
mark Ave., “shoplifter/dispute,” 46-year 
old Misty Carol Werner charged with 
Theft III, Criminal Trespass I & Rob-
bery III.  Transported to CCJ. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 7, 9:23 p.m., Newmark & 
Woolridge, “located wanted subject by 
CBPD, on CBPD warrant,” 26-year old 
Shyann McMillen-Markusson charged 
with FTA on Burglary I, Criminal Tres-
pass I, Theft III & Failure to Appear on 
a Criminal Citation.  Transported to 
CCJ. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CQPD log 
for Feb. 7, 2:42 p.m., Central & 3rd, “out 
with a subject,” 41-year old Larry J. 
Statham arrested on CQPD warrant 
charging FTA on Disorderly Conduct II.  
Transported to CCJ. 

Stolen Vehicle 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 8, 3:05 a.m., 900 block Mont-
gomery Ave., “result of stolen and re-
covered vehicle report,’ 36-year old Ty-
ler Gardner Gray charged with Unlawful 
Use of a Motor Vehicle and Criminal 
Mischief II.  Transported to CCJ. 

DWS 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 8, 9:45 a.m., 2000 block New-
mark Ave., “out with subject in parking 
lot,” 54-year old Larry James Crume 
charged with DWS Misdemeanor and 
transported to CCJ. 

DUII 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 8, 9:46 a.m., SB Hwy. 101 & 
The Mill Casino, “driving complaint,” 
48-year old Roger Len Kephart charged 
with DUII & Reckless Driving.  Trans-
ported to CCJ. 

Shoplifter 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 8, 1:27 p.m., 2051 Newmark 
Ave., Walmart, “shoplifter,” 33-year old 
Jeremy M. Garcia charged with Theft III 
& Possession of a Controlled Substance.  
Transported to CCJ. 
 

Burglary 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 8, 2:19 p.m., 1200 block S. 10th 
St., “possible burglary.” 

Arrest 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 8, 4:26 p.m., 200 block No. 
Schoneman, “located wanted subject,” 
Justin Chase Roberts charged with Har-
assment – Domestic & Criminal Mis-
chief II.  Transported to CCJ. 

Screaming 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 8, 7:17 p.m., 800 block S. 5th 
St., “female screaming nearby,” 32-year 
old Sophia Nicole Romero charged with 
Probation Violation and transported to 
CCJ. 

Burglary 
According to an entry on the CQPD log 
for 3:21 p.m., 1700 block N. Fir St., 
“possible burglary.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Feb. 8 10:53 a.m., 1000 block Ohio 
Ave., 27-year old Sarah Gulotta, Coos 
Bay, charged with Criminal Trespass I, 
transported to CCJ. 

Yelling 
According to an entry on the Coos Bay 
Police logs for Feb. 9, 6:27 a.m., 800 
block Central Ave., “report of suspicious 
subject outside store yelling at employ-
ee,” 58-year old Charles L. Messenger 
arrested on Oregon State Parole Board 
warrant charging Parole Violation on 
original charge of Robbery.  Transported 
to the Coos Co. Jail at Coquille. 

Dispute 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 9, 9:46 a.m., 400 block Madison 
St., “report of verbal dispute behind the 
school between a man & woman,” 31-
year old Codi Lee Lott arrested on four 
CCSO warrants charging Failure to Ap-
pear on PCS Meth; FTA on DUII, PCS 
Heroin, two-counts Recklessly Endan-
gering Another Person; FTA on FTA II 
and FTA II.  Transported to CCJ. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 9, 9:56 a.m., Main & Newmark, 
“out attempting contact with wanted 
subject,” 22-year old Caleb Moffett ar-
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rested on CBPD warrant charging FTA 
on Unlawful Possession of Meth.  Trans-
ported to CCJ. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 9, 10:13 a.m., Newmark & So. 
Empire, “assist fire & ambulance,” 32-
year old Anthony Ross arrested on two 
Coquille Police warrants charging FTA 
on Criminal Trespass II, Disorderly 
Conduct II and Resisting Arrest.  Also, 
FTA II. 

Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 9, 5:59 p.m., 800 block S. 5th 
St., “criminal trespass,” 32-year old So-
phia Nicole Romero arrested on charges 
of Criminal Mischief II, Criminal Tres-
pass II & Probation Violation.  Trans-
ported to CCJ. 

Refused to Leave 
According to an entry on the Coos Bay 
Police log for Feb. 10, 5:22 a.m., 1200 
block Newmark Ave., “result of disor-
derly subject refusing to leave business,” 
32-year Antonio Alamilla Mejia charged 

with Criminal Trespass II and transport-
ed to the Coos Co. Jail at Coquille. 

Warrants 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 10, 6:37 a.m., “CBPD warrants 
served on inmate at Coffee Creek Cor-
rections,” 43-year old Daniel Brumlow 
charged with two CBPD warrants on 
Criminal Trespass I and Disorderly Con-
duct II.   

Traffic Stop 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 10, 10:04 a.m., 100 block N. 
Cammann St., “traffic stop resulting in 
arrest,” 39-year old Joni Kate Blean 
charged with DUII, Unlawful Possession 
of Meth – Misdemeanor, Unlawful Pos-
session of Heroin – Felony, and Reck-
less Driving.  Also, 62-year old Kristi 
Alex Palica charged with Probation Vio-
lation and Unlawful Possession of Meth.  
Transported to CCJ. 

DUII 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
or Feb. 10, 6:51 p.m., 100 block So. 7th 
St., “driving complaint,” 32-year old 

Darwin Martinez Cruz charged with 
DUII and DWS Misdemeanor.  Trans-
ported to CCJ. 

Locked in Restroom 
According to an entry on the Coos Bay 
Police log for Feb. 11, 7:55 a.m., 2051 
Newmark Ave., Walmart, “subject 
locked self in restroom for hours refus-
ing to come out,” 58-year old Charles 
Lindsay Messenger arrested on Oregon 
State Parole Board Warrant for Parole 
Violation on original charge of Robbery.  
“Released to Coos County P&P.” 

Probation Violation 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 11, 10:41 a.m., Empire Lakes, 
“probation violation,” 31-year old Kris-
tina Lynn Frickey charged with Proba-
tion Violation and transported to the 
Coos Co. Jail at Coquille. 

Screaming 
According to an entry on the North Bend 
Police log for Feb. 14, 5:45 a.m., 900 
block Virginia Ave., “officers respond to 
report of male in roadway screaming in 
the street,” 43-year old Benedict Men-
donca III, Coos Bay, charged with Pro-
bation Violation, Disorderly Conduct, 
Resisting Arrest & Criminal Mischief II.  
Transported to the Coos Co. Jail at Co-
quille. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Feb. 14, 8:01 a.m., “Reedsport PD 
served valid NBPD warrant” on 46-year 
old James Earl Wilson, Coos Bay, 
charged with Probation Violation on 
original charge of Possession of Meth.  
“Lodged at Reedsport PD, will be trans-
ported to CCJ.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Feb. 14, 10:57 p.m., 38-year old 
Danielle Elaine Miller, Coos Bay, arrest-
ed on NBPD warrant for Unlawful Pos-
session of Heroin, Unlawful Possession 
of Meth.  Transported to CCJ. 

Disorderly 
According to an entry on the Coos Bay 
Police lo for Feb. 12, 1:55 p.m., 500 
block W. Anderson Ave., “subject inside 
causing damage to Library property,” 
Robert Lloyd Finder charged with Dis-
orderly Conduct II & Probation Viola-
tion.  Transported to CCJ.  

Burglary 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 12, 2:21 p.m., 1500 block Bar-
ham Terrace, “theft of jewelry.” 

Assault 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 13, 1:13 a.m., 600 block 10th 
Ct., “intoxicated subject, domestic as-
sault,” 24-year old Tyler Michael Wood-
man Stewart charged with Domestic 
Assault IV, Strangulation, Unlawful Use 
of a Weapon, Pointing a Firearm at An-
other.  Transported to CCJ. 

Suspicious Conditions 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 13, 8:29 a.m., Newmark & No. 
Main St., “result of suspicious circum-
stances,” 33-year old Richard S. 
Boushey charged with Unlawful Posses-
sion of Heroin and Unlawful Possession 
of Meth.  Transported to CCJ. 

Probation Violation 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 13, 9:41 a.m., 1800 block Ocean 
Blvd., “result of persons contact, located 
detainable subject,” 50-year old Danny 
Joseph Thomas charged with Probation 
Violation & PCS Meth.  Transported to 
CCJ. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 14, 2:23 a.m., “Gresham PD 
arrested subject on Coquille Tribal PD 
warrant,” 38-year old Christopher Gene 
Baker charged with Failure to Appear on 
original charge of Harassment. 

Theft 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 14, 9:28 a.m., 1000 block Mich-
igan Ave., “result of theft report,” 18-
year old Billy Shane Leatherman 
charged with Theft II, “released on cita-
tion.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 14, 2:23 p.m., 1100 block New-
mark Ave., “warrant service,” 31-year 
old Codi Lee Lott arrested on CCSO 
warrant charging FTA on PCS Meth and 
FTA on DUII, PCS Heroin and two-
counts of Reckless Endangering, FTA 
on FTA, and FTA on FTAII.  Transport-
ed to CCJ. 

Shoplifter 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb 14, 4:01 p.m., 1000 block S. 1st 
St., 37-year old Ryan David Lile 
charged with Theft II and transported to 
CCJ. 

Stolen Vehicle 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 14, 10:38 p.m., Sherman & 
Commercial, “traffic stop – resulting in 
recovery of stolen vehicle,” 37-year old 
Danielle Elaine Miller arrested on 
NBPD warrant charging Unlawful Pos-
session of Heroin and Unlawful Posses-
sion of Meth.  Also, 24-year old Sarah 
Amelia Martin charged with Unauthor-
ized Use of a Motor Vehicle and Unlaw-
ful Possession of Meth.  Both transport-
ed to CCJ. 

UEMV 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Feb. 15, 2:02 a.m., 10th & Cedar, 
“vehicle entered,” 19-year old Robert 
Murel Parmley IV, Coquille, charged 
with DUII Marijuana, transported to 
CCJ. 

Citizen’s Citation 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
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for Feb. 15, 9:22 a.m., McCullough 
Bridge, “RP reported vehicle tailgating 
on the bridge southbound into town.  
Officer located the vehicle, 400 block 
Virginia Ave, issues Citizen’s Citation 
to 30-year old male from Roseburg for 
Following Too Closely.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 15, 9:27 a.m., 1300 block N. 8th 
St., “warrant service,” 42-year old Bren-
da M. Latimer arrested on three CCSO 
warrants charging Contempt of Court 
Fail to Pay Child Support.  Transported 
to CCJ. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 15, 4:02 p.m., Newmark & 
Hull, “warrant service,” 36-year old Jes-
sica Ashley Howell arrested on CBPD 
warrants charging Criminal Mischief 2nd 
Degree, Criminal Trespass 1st Degree 
and 12-counts Criminal Trespass 2nd 
Degree and additional warrant for FTA 
2nd Degree.  Transported to CCJ. 

Shoplifter 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 15, 9:51 p.m., 1000 block S. 1st 
St., “2 shoplifters fighting with securi-
ty,” 38-year old Ruslana V. Machuka 
charged with Theft II and transported to 
CCJ. 

Disputes 
A couple of early morning “disputes” on 
the Coos Bay Police lo for Feb. 16.  Ac-
cording to an entry at 1:43 a.m., 1000 
block of Anderson Ave, “dispute.”  At 
2:18 a.m., Broadway & Market, “report 
of male & female in the area in some 
sort of verbal dispute.  At 3:11 a.m., 100 
block Central Ave., “dispute between 
male & female, cell phone taken and 
thrown into the bay.” 

Harassment at BAH 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 16, 4:17 a.m., 1775 Thompson 
Rd., “patient at location, combative, 

spitting at and attempting to assault 
staff,” 39-year old Suzanne Fields 
charged with Aggravated Harassment 
and transported to the Coos Co. Jail at 
Coquille. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 16, 9:04 a.m., 1900 block New-
mark Ave., “result of traffic stop,” 67-
year old Roger William Soto arrested on 
Corvallis PD warrant charging Failure to 
Appear on Failure to Perform Duties of 
a Driver and Criminal Driving while 
Suspended or Revoked.  Transported to 
CCJ. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 16, 3:11 p.m., 1000 block So. 1st 
St., “CBPD served Oregon State Parole 
Board” warrant on 56-year old Joseph 
Boyd charging Parole Violation on Har-
assment charge, transported to CCJ. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 16, 5:52 p.m., Southwest Blvd. 
& So. 7th St., “result of traffic stop,” 37-
year old Jennifer Michelle Wilson arrest-
ed on CBPD warrant for Probation Vio-
lation on original charges of FTA 1st 
Degree, Probation Violation on two-
counts of Attempt to Commit a Class C / 
Unclassified Felony, Identity Theft, 
Theft in the First Degree and Forgery in 
the First Degree.  Transported to CCJ. 

UEMV 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 16, 6:05 p.m., 500 block New-
mark Ave., “unlawful entry into MV.” 

Arrest 
According to an entry on the Coquille 
Police log for Feb. 16, 2:09 p.m., So. 
Cedar St., “result follow up,” 63-year 
old Mona Leisa Taylor charged with 
Criminal Trespass II and transported to 
CCJ. 

Weapon 
According to an entry on the CQPD log 
for Feb. 16, 5:48 p.m., W. 1st St., 
“follow up,” 27-year old Dennis Briggs, 
Jr., charged with Menacing & Unlawful 
Use of a Weapon.  Transported to CCJ. 

Transients 
Entries on the North Bend Police log for 
Feb. 16 involving transients.  At 1:13 

a.m., 3000 block Broadway Ave., 60-
year old Jed Parks, North Bend, cited in 
lieu of custody for Criminal Trespass II 
and “instructed to not return to property, 
will be gathering belongings and leav-
ing.”  At 1:34 a.m., 1600 block Virginia 
Ave., “advised Mall doesn’t allow peo-
ple to camp there, subject gathering be-
longings and departing.”  At 3:28 a.m., 
Public Square, “advised not to sleep on 
sidewalk.”   

Disorderly 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Feb. 16, 2:30 p.m., California Boat 
Ramp, 63-year old Caren Shanks taken 
into custody for Disorderly Conduct II 
and Interfering.  Transported to CCJ.  
Also cited for DOC II and will be re-
ferred to DA’s Office for Interfering. 

Probation Violation 
According to an entry on North Bend 
Police Dept. log for Feb. 17, 3:24 a.m., 
60-year old Daniel Duran, Coos Bay, 
charged with Parole Violation, Failure to 
Register as Sex Offender and transported 
to the Coos Co. Jail at Coquille.  Also 
cited for Drinking Unlicensed Premise, 
and Failure to Register as Sex Offender. 

Trespassing 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Feb. 17, 10:55 a.m., 1800 block 
Newmark St., “officer observed male 
subject trespassing at location,” 59-year 
old Jed H. Parks cited for Criminal Tres-
pass II and transported to CCJ. 

Shoplifter 
According to an entry on the Coos Bay 
Police log for Feb. 17, 12:06 p.m., 1000 
block So. 1st St., “result of shoplifter,” 
64-year old John Robert Bowen charged 
with Theft III and Criminal Trespass I.  
Transported to the Coos Co. Jail at Co-
quille. 

Sex Offender Registra-
tion 

According to an entry on the Coos Bay 
Police log for Feb. 18, 10:18 a.m., 200 
block Kruse Ave., “result of subject lay-
ing on the side of the road,” 23-year old 
Dusty Jo Daniel charged with Failure to 
Register as a Sex Offender and trans-
ported to the Coos Co. Jail at Coquille. 
 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 18, 10:42 a.m., “Newport PD 
arrested subject on 2 CBPD warrants” 
charging 23-year old Deanna Carol West 
with Failure to Appear on Theft II and 
FTA 2nd Degree. 

Stolen Vehicle 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 18, 3:19 p.m., 700 block Broad-
way Ave., “report stolen vehicle, officer 
located & recovered vehicle,” 36-year 
old Dustin Tyler Anderson charged with 
Unlawful Use of a Motor Vehicle, 37-
year old Danielle Elaine Miller charged 
with Probation Violation and 38-year 
old Cody Daniel Cullen Plymer charged 
with Probation Violation.  All transport-
ed to CCJ. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 18, 7:02 p.m., Roseburg, Doug-
las Co. SO arrested 29-year old Brandon 
Michael Martin on CBPD warrants for 
FTA on Theft 2nd Degree and FTA on 
FTA 2nd Degree. 

Disorderly 
According to an entry on the North Bend 
Police log for Feb. 20, 12:29 p.m., Sher-
man & California, 37-year old Robert 
Finder “taken into custody following 
report of male subject beating on news-
paper box.”  He was charged with Disor-
derly Conduct II, Probation Violation 
and transported to the Coos Co. Jail at 
Coquille. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the Coos Bay 
Police log for Feb. 19, 12:19 p.m., 250 
N. Baxter, Coquille, “CCSO serving 
CBPD warrant” on Chelsea Rayshell 
Grauf charging Theft II. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 19, 1:32 p.m., 1200 block New-
mark Ave., “out with wanted subject,” 
Eric Darrell Ekblad arrested on Douglas 
Co. SO warrant for Failure to Appear X2 
on original charge of Theft II.  Trans-
ported to CCJ. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 19, 11:43 p.m., E Anderson & 
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                        Energy  
                    Company 

  
Home Heating Fuels 

(541) 267-2107                                        
 
 
 

24-HR FOOD MART 
  

 Hwy. 101  -  So. Coos Bay 

 
 
 

 

"We offer many  
services at  
no charge"  

269-5127 
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Moe's Super Lube 
Oil Lube & Filter Service 

Open 8 a.m., Mon. - Sat. 

*1326 Virginia Ave., North Bend 

(541) 756-7218 

*330 South Broadway, Coos Bay 

(541) 269-5323 

2 Locations in the Bay Area 



S. Bayshore, “foot patrol”, Danny Joe 
Sager arrested on NBPD warrant for 
Failure to Appear on Interfering with 
Peace Officer.  Transported to CCJ. 

Damaged Road Barriers 
According to an entry on the Coos Bay 
Police log for Feb. 20, 9:24 a.m., Inger-
soll & So. Broadway, “result of damage 
to Road Barriers,” 26-year old Jordan 
Skyler Jones charged with Failure to 
Perform Duties of a Driver and Criminal 
Mischief II.  “Released on citation.” 

Probation Violation 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 20, 1:02 p.m., Ocean & Central, 
“located detainable subject,” 49-year old 
James Douglas Box charged with Proba-
tion Violation and transported to CCJ. 

Probation Violation 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 20, 1:42 p.m., 100 block Ocean 
Blvd. Harmony First Church homeless 
camp, “male & female out at location 
yelling,” 22-year old Brandon Birman 
charged with Probation Violation & Re-
sisting Arrest.  Transported to CCJ. 

UEMVs 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 21, 6:32 a.m., 1000 block Au-
gustine St., “UEMV, theft.”  On Feb. 21, 
7:43 p.m., 200 block 1st Ave., “UEMV.” 

Harassment 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 21, 12:03 p.m., No. 10th St & 
W. Commercial Ave., 47-year old Jack 
Bert Stuart arrested on CCSO warrant 
charging Probation Violation on original 
charge of Menacing & Harassment; 
Reedsport PD warrant charging Unlaw-
ful Possession of Meth.  Transported to 
CCJ. 

Probation Violation 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 21, 2:12 p.m., Ocean & Radar, 
“traffic stop on possible detainable sub-
ject,” Jacob S. Potter arrested on Proba-
tion Violation Detainer & Elude in a 
Vehicle and on Foot.  Transported to 
CCJ. 

Sex Offender 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 22, 12:55 a.m., No. 10th St. & 
W. Commercial, “patrol check,” Joshua 
D. Pratt charged with Failure to Register 
as a Sex Offender.  Transported to CCJ. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 22, 11:44 a.m., S. Wasson & 
Michigan, “warrant service,” Gregory 
Gene Kister arrested on an Oregon State 
Parole Board warrant and transported to 
CCJ. 

Wanted 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 22, 2:16 p.m., Noble & Madi-
son, “located wanted subject,” Tyler 
Gardner Gray arrested on CBPD warrant 
for FTA on Unauthorized Use of a Vehi-

cle & Criminal Mischief II.  Additional-
ly, charged with PCS Heroin and trans-
ported to CCJ. 

Burglary 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 23, 7:18 a.m., 1800 block Cot-
tonwood Ave., “burglary.” 

Shoplifter 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb 23, 2:42 p.m., 1000 block So. 1st 
St., “subject leaving property with mer-
chandise concealed,” 49-year old Scott 
Charles Robinson charged with Theft II 
and transported to CCJ. 

Probation Violation 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 23, 10:36 p.m., 2000 block 
Newmark Ave., “casual contact,” 26-
year old Krysta Guptill arrested on Pro-
bation Violation Detainer and transport-
ed to CCJ. 

Probation Violation 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 23, 10:51 p.m., 1800 block 
Newmark Ave., “person stop,” 39-year 
old Redonna Ham arrested on Probation 
Violation Detainer and transported to 
CCJ. 

Counterfeit 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 23, 11:15 p.m., 900 block New-
mark Ave., “counterfeit money.” 

Theft 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Feb. 24, 12:24 p.m., 2700 block Vir-
ginia Ave., “officers checked area for 
teen needing trespass from market, una-
ble to locate, market wants to pursue 
charges for earlier Theft III / report tak-
en,” 18-year old Colin Jeske, North 
Bend, taken into custody on charges of 
Theft III and transported to CCJ. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 24, 8:56 p.m., No. 28th St. & 
Ocean Blvd., “from traffic stop,” 39-
year old Aaron Neil Allison charged 
with Parole Violation warrant, out of 
state Parole Board and transported to 
CCJ. 

Probation Violation 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 24, 10:56 p.m., 700 block F. St., 
27-year old Whitney Jean Bell charged 
with Probation Violation and transported 
to CCJ. 

Too Close 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Feb. 25, 10:58 a.m., Ash & 13th 
streets, “vehicle almost struck officer 
and RP on trespass call at location,” 73-
year old male from Coos Bay cited for 
Careless Driving.   

Alarm at BAH 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 25, 2:30 a.m., 1775 Thompson 
Rd., Bay Area Hospital, “probation vio-
lation, result of alarm,” 28-year old Jon-

athon Kamfonik charged with Probation 
Violation and transported to CCJ. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 25, 11:06 a.m., “result of assist 
with parking enforcement; located want-
ed subject,” 49-year old Rodney Lee 
Lowe charged with Probation Violation 
and arrested on Clackamas Co. SO war-
rant charging Possession of Meth; and, 
Florence PD warrants charging DUII, 
Hit & Run and Trespass II.  Transported 
to CCJ. 

Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 25, 2:41 p.m., 1000 block So. 1st 
St., 43-year old Carrie Lynn Lott 
charged with Criminal Trespass II and 
transported to CCJ. 

Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 25, 6:01 p.m., “subject who was 
previously been trespass is back on the 
property,” 30-year old James Luis Quin-
tana charged with Criminal Trespass II 
and transported to CCJ. 

Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Feb. 26, Broadway & Newmark, 59-
year old Jedediah Parks cited for Crimi-
nal Trespass II in lieu of transport to 
CCJ. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Feb. 26, 3:11 p.m., Boynton Park, 52
-year old Paul Elliis Rossii arrested on 
NBPD warrant charging Failure to Ap-
pear on Unlawful Possession of Meth 
and transported to CCJ. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Feb. 26, 2200 block Broadway Ave., 
“officer out with wanted subject,” 28-
year old Jeremy E. Field, of North Bend, 
arrested on warrant charging FTA on 
Theft II.  Transported to CCJ. 

DUII 
According to an entry on the North Bend 
Police log for Feb. 27, 1:30 a.m., Harri-
son & Washington avenues, 56-year old 
Ronald J. Lacanfora, Port Orford, cited 
for Breath Test Refusal and for DUII.  
Transported to the Coos Co. Jail at Co-
quille. 

Disturbance 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Feb. 27, 8 p.m., Newmark & Broad-
way, “anonymous 911 report of DOC 
subject at location, officers responded, 
subject place in custody,” 31-year old 

Kekoa O. Domen warned for Disorderly 
Conduct, arrested on Probation Viola-
tion and transported to CCJ. 
 
 

Regionals 
 

Do you need a Real ID 
Something big is happening October 
first of this year. If you aren’t paying 
attention, it might mean missing your 
flight out of PDX or any other airport 
across the U.S.  On that date the Trans-
portation Security Administration, or 
TSA, begins requiring a new type of 
identification to board a commercial 
aircraft. The new ID must be compliant 
with something called the Real ID Act. 
It’s designed to keep us safer in the air, 
but if you try to board an aircraft using 
your current Oregon driver license start-
ing in October – it won’t work. That’s 
because the current Oregon driver li-
cense is not Real ID compliant. Oregon 
DMV will begin offering a Real ID op-
tion on July 6, 2020. To fulfill the de-
mand of nearly one million Oregonians 
who will want the Real ID option, DMV 
would have to issue 32 licenses a minute 
every business day from July to October. 
That’s just not possible. If you don’t 
have a Real ID compliant form of ID at 
the airport, TSA will put you through an 
alternate identity verification process 
that could take an hour or more, and you 
could miss your flight. There is an an-
swer for Oregonians: obtain and use a 
passport or passport card. The cost of 
getting a new passport card is roughly 
equal to that of getting a replacement 
license with the Real ID option – and 
you can apply now at one of over 76 
acceptance sites across Oregon.  To find 
out more, visit https://www.Oregon.gov/
REALID By the way, Washingtonians 
already have the option of getting a Real 
ID compliant driver license. If you are a 
Washington resident, go to https://
id2020wa.com/ to find out more. 

Bilked Weyco for $4.5 
Million 

EUGENE, Ore.—Susan Tranberg, 61, of 
Eugene, Oregon, pleaded guilty Thurs-
day, Jan. 30 in federal court to mail 
fraud, aggravated identity theft and tax 
evasion after defrauding her former em-
ployer, the Weyerhaeuser Company, out 
of more than $4.5 million.  “Susan Tran-
berg used her intimate knowledge of the 
Weyerhaeuser Company to perpetrate a 
lengthy and complex fraud. She went to 
great lengths to disguise her actions and 
mislead her colleagues,” said Billy J. 
Williams, U.S. Attorney for the District 
of Oregon. “She then took her scheme a 
step further by evading paying taxes on 
her fraudulent gains. Her crimes reflect a 
complete disdain for her employer and 
utter contempt for her responsibilities as 
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an American taxpayer.”  “Between 2004 
and 2019, Susan Tranberg purported 
herself as a trustworthy and dedicated 
employee. In reality she was embezzling 
more than $4 million dollars,” said IRS-
Criminal Investigation Special Agent in 
Charge Justin Campbell. “She cheated 
both her employer and the American 
taxpayers by evading taxes on her em-
bezzled income. The IRS is committed 
to promoting taxpayer confidence by 
ensuring every taxpayer pays their fair 
share regardless of the taxable source.”  
According to court documents, begin-
ning as early as June 2004 and continu-
ing to January 2019, Tranberg defrauded 
Weyerhaeuser out of more than $4.5 
million by submitting fraudulent invoic-
es for payment to a fake vendor she cre-
ated. Tranberg had worked for Weyer-
haeuser in Springfield, Oregon in vari-
ous positions for more than 40 years.  At 
some point in or before June 2004, Tran-
berg created a fake timber contract be-
tween the company and a vendor she 
named after her mother, who was un-
ware of the scheme. Over the next 10 
years, Tranberg would use her positions 
in the company’s accounting and finance 
departments, to request cashier’s checks 
payable to the fake vendor. During this 
time period, Tranberg requested and 
received more than $2.6 million. In June 
2014, Weyerhaeuser transitioned to a 
new payment processing system. To 
continue her scheme, Tranberg set up a 
fake vendor account in the new system 
and attached a letter purportedly from 
her mother describing the documentation 
provided to set up the account. This doc-
umentation included a Form SSA-1099 
Social Security Statement and a forged 
Form W-9 Request for Taxpayer Identi-
fication Number and Certification.  Be-
tween June 2014 and January 2019, 
Tranberg continued her scheme by forg-
ing colleagues’ signatures on check re-
quests and using her colleagues’ com-
puter login credentials without authori-
zation to create requests and approve 
fraudulent payments. All requested cash-
ier’s checks were sent via private or 
commercial interstate carrier directly to 
Tranberg. During these final five years, 
Tranberg requested and received nearly 
$1.9 million.  Tranberg faces a maxi-
mum sentence of 20 years in prison, a 
$250,000 fine and three years of super-
vised release. In addition, a conviction 
for aggravated identity theft carries a 
two-year mandatory minimum sentence 
required to be served consecutive to any 
other prison sentence imposed.  As part 
of her plea agreement, Tranberg has 
agreed to pay $4,581,218 in restitution 
to Weyerhaeuser and $807,033 in resti-
tution to the IRS.  This case was investi-
gated by IRS-Criminal Investigation 
(IRS-CI) and prosecuted by Gavin W. 
Bruce, Assistant U.S. Attorney for the 
District of Oregon. 
 

Froggy Robber  
Sentenced 

PORTLAND, Ore.—Diego Sanchez-
Lopez, 25, of Clark County, Washing-
ton, known locally as the “Froggy Rob-
ber,” was sentenced today to 97 months 
in federal prison and three years’ super-
vised release for armed bank robbery.  
According to court documents, between 
November 2017 and April 2018, 
Sanchez-Lopez stole more than $87,000 
from the following six banks in Oregon 
and Southwest Washington:  On No-
vember 27, 2017, $9,710 was stolen 
from the Albina Community Bank locat-
ed at 2002 NE Martin Luther King Jr. 
Boulevard in Portland.  On December 
27, 2017, $26,000 was stolen from the 
Wells Fargo Bank located at 8699 SW 
Main Street in Wilsonville, Oregon.  On 
January 11, 2018, $11,580.99 was stolen 
from the Wells Fargo Bank located at 
6785 Beaverton Hillsdale Highway in 
Beaverton, Oregon.  On January 30, 
2018, $6,720 was stolen from the U.S. 
Bank located at 52313 Columbia River 
Highway in Scappoose, Oregon.  On 
February 12, 2018, $15,400 was stolen 
from the Wells Fargo Bank located at 
1800 Main Street in Vancouver, Wash-
ington.  On April 30, 2018, 33,357 was 
stolen from the Wells Fargo Bank locat-
ed at 7200 NE Butler Street in Hillsboro, 
Oregon.   During sentencing, U.S. Dis-
trict Court Judge Michael W. Mosman 
ordered Sanchez-Lopez to pay more than 
$119,000 in restitution.  Previously, On 
August 5, 2019, Sanchez-Lopez pleaded 
guilty to six counts of bank robbery. As 
a non-citizen and lawful permanent resi-
dent, this conviction will subject 
Sanchez-Lopez to removal from the U.S. 
by immigration authorities.  This case 
was investigated by the FBI and prose-
cuted by John C. Brassell, Assistant U.S. 
Attorney for the District of Oregon. 

I-5 Fatal Marion Co. 
On Saturday, February 1, 2020 at ap-
proximately 8:00 A.M., Oregon State 
Police Troopers and emergency person-
nel responded to a two vehicle crash on 
Interstate 5 northbound near milepost 
251.  Preliminary investigation revealed 
that a Chevrolet Silverado pickup, oper-
ated by Eduardo Mendoza (29) of Sa-
lem, was traveling northbound on I5 
when for unknown reasons the Silverado 
left the travel lane and struck a Chevro-
let S-10 pickup, operated by David Tha-
ler (67) of Lebanon, that was travelling 
slowly on the shoulder.  The impact sent 
both vehicles off the roadway and onto 
the grass shoulder.  Thaler sustained 
fatal injuries and was pronounced de-
ceased at the scene.  Mendoza was not 
injured.   One lane of I5 northbound was 
closed for approximately six hours.   

Hwy. 30 Fatal 
On Thursday, February 6, 2020 at ap-
proximately 11:18 A.M., Oregon State 

Police Troopers and emergency person-
nel responded to a two vehicle crash on 
Hwy 30 near milepost 92.  Preliminary 
investigation revealed that a Buick 
LeSabre, operated by Emilee Mabey 
(24) of Ocean Park, WA. was westbound 
on Hwy 30 when for unknown reasons 
crossed the centerline and into the path 
of a eastbound Commercial Motor Vehi-
cle operated by Ronald Sutter (53) of 
Portland.  Mabey sustained fatal injuries 
and was pronounced deceased.  Sutter 
was not injured. 

SAR Umatilla Co. 
Sunday, February 9th, the Umatilla 
County Sheriff’s Office (UCSO) Search 
and Rescue (SAR) volunteers and part-
ner agencies are continuing SAR opera-
tions throughout the day.  Extraction 
operations will be taking place in the 
South Fork of Walla Walla River Rd up 
to Harris Park, and Mill Creek areas, for 
those who have requested assistance and 
are stranded due to flooding.  An Oregon 
Army National Guard HH-60M-
Blackhawk as well as a CH-47-Chinook 
will be assisting with extractions for 
those wishing to evacuate.  Volunteer 
Search and Rescue teams are currently 
conducting a ground search of the Thorn 
Hollow/Gibbon area with UTVs and will 
perform extractions if requested. 

Repeat Offender goes to 
Prison 

PORTLAND, Ore.—Timothy Ray 
Vance, 54, of Salem, Oregon, was sen-
tenced to 90 months in federal prison 
and five years’ supervised release for 
distributing large quantities of metham-
phetamine throughout Marion County. 
Vance has a long criminal history dating 
back to 1983. Vance served more than 
20 years in prison after being convicted 
in Marion County Circuit Court in 1994 
on two counts of robbery, two counts of 
burglary, and one count each of kidnap-
ping and theft.  Two months after com-
pleting post-prison supervision, in Au-
gust 2018, Vance was found to be in-
volved in a large methamphetamine dis-
tribution network. By October 2018, 
investigators discovered the network’s 
source of supply and at least one inform-
ant who revealed they had purchased 
methamphetamine from Vance on ten 
different occasions.  A different inform-
ant told investigators that on one occa-
sion, Vance sold them one pound of 
methamphetamine for $3,200.  In Febru-
ary 2019, Salem Police Department exe-
cuted a search warrant on Vance’s resi-
dence. Investigators located 62.7 grams 
of methamphetamine, $2,780 in cash, 
drug packaging materials, and two hand-
guns. Vance was placed under arrest and 
later released.  In March 2019, investiga-
tors learned that Vance was dealing 
methamphetamine out of a Salem hotel 
room. Officers conducted a traffic stop 
of Vance after obtaining a search war-
rant on his vehicle. During the search, 

they found 443 grams of methampheta-
mine, $1,500 in cash, and two additional 
firearms.   On November 11, 2019, 
Vance pleaded guilty to one count of 
possession with intent to distribute 
methamphetamine. As part of his plea 
agreement, Vance agreed to abandon 
four firearms used to facilitate his crime.  
This case was investigated by the Bu-

Oregon Prisons & Jails 
 

Federal prisons:   
Federal Correctional Institution, Sher-

idan (1,350 medium security, 480 
minimum security). 

State prisons:   
    Coffee Creek Correctional Facility, 

Wilsonville (1,685 inmate capacity) 
    Columbia River Correctional Insti-

tution, Portland (595 ic) 
    Deer Ridge Correctional Institu-

tion, Madras (1,867 ic) 
    Eastern Oregon Correctional Insti-

tution, Pendleton (1,659 ic) 
    Mill Creek Correctional Facility, 

Salem (240 ic) 
    Oregon State Correctional Institu-

tion, Salem (880 ic) 
    Oregon State Penitentiary, Salem 

(2,194 ic) 
    Powder River Correctional Facili-

ty, Baker City (366 ic) 
    Santiam Correctional Institution, 

Salem (440 ic) 
    Shutter Creek Correctional Insti-

tution, North Bend (260 ic) 
    South Fork Forest Camp, Tilla-

mook (200 ic) 
    Snake River Correctional Institu-

tion, Ontario (3,050 ic) 
    Two Rivers Correctional Institu-

tion, Umatilla (1,878 ic) 
    Warner Creek Correctional Facili-

ty, Lakeview (496 ic) 

Youth correctional facilities 
Male 

    Eastern Oregon Youth Correction-
al Facility, Burns (50 beds) 

    Hillcrest Youth Correctional Facil-
ity, Salem (180 beds) 

    MacLaren Youth Correctional Fa-
cility, Woodburn (186 beds) 

    North Coast Youth Correctional 
Facility Warrenton (50 beds) 

    Rogue Valley Youth Correctional 
Facility, Grants Pass (100 beds) 

    Tillamook Youth Correctional Fa-
cility, Tillamook County (50 beds) 

Female 
    Oak Creek Youth Correctional 

Facility, Albany (75 beds) 
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reau of Alcohol, Tobacco, Firearms and 
Explosives (ATF) and the Salem Police 
Department. It was prosecuted by Lewis 
S. Burkhart, Assistant U.S. Attorney for 
the District of Oregon.  The case was 
brought as part of Project Safe Neigh-
borhoods (PSN). PSN is the centerpiece 
of the Department of Justice’s violent 
crime reduction efforts. PSN is an evi-
dence-based program proven to be effec-
tive at reducing violent crime. Through 
PSN, a broad spectrum of stakeholders 
work together to identify the most press-
ing violent crime problems in the com-
munity and develop comprehensive so-
lutions to address them. As part of this 
strategy, PSN focuses enforcement ef-
forts on the most violent offenders and 
partners with locally based prevention 
and reentry programs for lasting reduc-
tions in crime. 

Unlawful Taking of Big 
Horn Sheep 

Oregon State Police Fish and Wildlife 
Troopers are asking for the public’s as-
sistance in locating and apprehending 
the person(s) responsible for shooting a 
bighorn sheep ram in Wallowa County 
near the town of Troy sometime during 
the week of January 27.  Preliminary 
investigation revealed that the ram was 
shot on the Wenaha Wildlife Area along 
the road leading to the feed sight.  The 
ram was fitted with a telemetry collar 
and an ear tag.  The collar and severed 
ear were the only items left at the scene.  
Anyone who may have information that 
will help identify the suspect(s), is asked 
to call the Turn In Poachers (TIP) line at 
(800) 452-7888, *OSP(677) or Sergeant 
Chris Hawkins (541) 963-7575 ext. 
4670. 

Officer Involved  
Shooting Silverton 

On February 14, 2020 at approximately 
12:40 P.M., Silverton Police Department 
personnel responded to a reported do-
mestic violence disturbance at 911 Re-
serve St. Apt.#3, in Silverton.  Shortly 
after arriving, officers located the in-
volved man, William Bluestone (21) of 

Bend/Silverton, concealed in the bed-
room of the apartment. Bluestone told 
officers he was armed with a handgun 
and barricaded himself.  Officers at-
tempted to negotiate his surrender for 
more than an hour when shots were 
fired. Bluestone was pronounced de-
ceased by medical personnel who ar-
rived shortly thereafter.  This investiga-
tion is being led by the Oregon State 
Police with the assistance of the Salem 
Police Department and Keizer Police 
Department. The Marion County District 
Attorney’s Office is overseeing the in-
vestigation and will release additional 
details when appropriate.  The involved 
officer was placed on paid administra-
tive leave pending the outcome of the 
investigation as per protocol.  Update:  
The Oregon State Police is continuing 
the investigation into the OIS in Silver-
ton.  Preliminary investigation has re-
vealed that William Bluestone was in 
possession of a handgun at the time of 
the shooting.  The Silverton Officer was 
wearing a body worn camera and the 
incident was recorded.  It is unable to be 
released at this time as this is an open/
active investigation.  The Oregon State 
Police and Marion County DA’s office 
understands the public’s desire to know 
immediate information when an officer 
is involved in a deadly use of 
force.  However in an effort to complete 
a fair and thorough investigation infor-
mation needs to be withheld until after a 
Grand Jury can be convened to hear the 
facts of the case, as is Marion County 
District Attorneys standard practice. 

DEQ on Fuel Spill  
Hwy. 22 

UPDATE on North Santiam River Tank-
er Spill - The Oregon Department of 
Environmental Quality continues to 
oversee cleanup and monitoring near the 
site of a Feb. 16 truck crash and fuel 
release on Highway 22 about 60 miles 
east of Salem.  Of the 10,600 gallons of 
fuel on board the double tanker, 7,871 
gallons spilled and the remaining fuel 
was recovered. Fuel is discharging from 
the bank of the North Santiam River and 

a sheen is visible for a few hundred feet 
downstream of the crash site.  Crews 
began excavating contaminated material 
this morning and will evaluate disposal 
options.  About 400 feet of hard boom 
and other absorbent materials are in the 
river to contain and collect fuel. DEQ 
will continue to monitor potential im-
pacts to fish and wildlife at and down-
stream of the site. There have been no 
reports of impacts to drinking water sup-
plies in the area.  U.S. Environmental 
Protection Agency’s On-Scene Coordi-
nator and contractors are providing the 
water sampling data for hydrocarbon by-
products at two- and four-mile intervals 
in the North Santiam River downstream 
of the crash site.  Oregon Highway 22 
will remain closed to through traffic 
from just west of Idanha to the junction 
with U.S. 20 (milepost 53-81) until at 
least Friday or Saturday of this week, 
according to the Oregon Department of 
Transportation. This morning, ODOT 
was able to assess the damage and deter-
mined that it will take several days to 
remove contaminated soil and repair the 
road where the truck crashed.  An area 
of roadway about 600 feet long needs to 
be excavated and rebuilt. Motorists trav-
eling to and from the Willamette Valley 
and Central Oregon can use U.S. 20 and 
OR 126E as alternative routes. 

Hwy. 22 Fuel Spill 
DEQ release - Statewide, OR—Federal, 
state and local responders continue to 
clean up spilled fuel and contaminated 
soil along the banks of the North San-
tiam River near Idanha – east of Salem 
and Detroit Lake on OR 22 – following 
a crash on Feb. 16.  The agencies re-
sponsible for managing the response are 
monitoring water quality in the area of 
the tanker crash. Latest water sampling 
data from the North Santiam River fol-
lowing the crash and spill shows petrole-
um-related chemicals are present at lev-
els that decrease with distance down-
stream from the site. Except for at the 
crash site, all water samples contained 
extremely low levels of petroleum-
related chemicals, at concentrations far 
below safe drinking water levels. Petro-
leum contaminants in river water that 
may reach drinking water intakes down-
stream are expected to remain below 
regulatory standards. Communities clos-
est to the spill pull drinking water from 
tributaries to the river and not the North 
Santiam itself. The nearest drinking wa-
ter intake on the North Santiam is 25 
miles downstream from the spill site and 
below Detroit Lake.  

OR Hwy. 22 Update 
ODOT release - ODOT: Valley, No. 
Coast: OR 22 just east of Idanha is open-
ing to all traffic by 9:45 p.m., Friday, 
Feb. 21.  The road had been closed be-
tween Idanha and the OR 22/U.S. 20 
junction since last Sunday morning, Feb. 
16, when a double tanker carrying fuel 

crashed spilling most of its load. A 600 
foot section of road needed to be exca-
vated, removing contaminated materials 
and then rebuilt. 

Guilty for Threatening 
Mass Shooting 

MEDFORD, Ore.—William Gregory 
Douglas, 37, of Cave Junction, Oregon, 
pleaded guilty today for threatening to 
shoot YouTube employees at the compa-
ny’s San Bruno, California headquarters 
after his account was removed for violat-
ing the video-sharing platform’s terms 
of service.  “Threatening a mass shoot-
ing is a serious crime whether or not an 
individual plans to act. This is a crime 
that undermines Americans’ fundamen-
tal right to live and work without fear,” 
said Billy J. Williams, U.S. Attorney for 
the District of Oregon. “We will contin-
ue to diligently respond to and prosecute 
criminal threats of violence to the fullest 
extent of the law.”  “Using social media 
outlets to threaten violence of any kind 
victimizes individuals and undermines 
the safety of our communities,” said 
Renn Cannon, Special Agent in Charge 
of the FBI in Oregon. “The FBI remains 
committed to working with our state and 
local partners to respond quickly to 
threats and keep our communities free 
from violence and intimidation.”  Ac-
cording to court documents, sometime 
on or before August 22, 2018, YouTube 
removed Douglas’ video channel for 
violating the platform’s terms of service. 
In response, on August 23, 2018, Doug-
las posted five tweets threatening vio-
lence against YouTube employees. In 
one of the tweets, Douglas threatened a 
“bigger mass casualty” event, appearing 
to reference a prior shooting incident at 
YouTube’s headquarters in April 2018 
that injured three employees. Later, on 
September 8, 2018, Douglas posted a 
tweet stating “Hey why do you guys 
keep ignoring me would it be better if I 
leave you with no other options like 
your [sic] leaving me…I’m beyond 
pissed…I wonder how I should deal 
with this frustration.” Finally, on Sep-
tember 17, 2018, Douglas tweeted a di-
rect threat at one of YouTube’s senior 
leaders saying “…I’m coming for you 
today #pray.”  On October 4, 2018, a 
federal grand jury in Medford, Oregon 
returned a one-count indictment charg-
ing Douglas with cyberstalking. Later, 
on January 14, 2020, he was charged by 
criminal information with one count of 
making interstate communications with 
the intent to extort. Douglas pleaded 
guilty today to the latter charge. As part 
of the plea agreement, Douglas has 
agreed to pay restitution in full to his 
victims as determined and ordered by 
the court at sentencing.  Douglas faces a 
maximum sentence of 5 years in prison, 
a $250,000 fine and three years’ super-
vised release. He will be sentenced on 
May 14, 2020 before U.S. District Court 
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Bayside Coffee 
Charleston 

Small batch, fresh-roasted coffee for retail and 
mail order. Purchase coffee and loose leaf teas in 

our shop or from our website. 
 

www.baysidecoffeeshop.com 
63340 Boat Basin Rd, 

541 260-3742 

WINTER 
HOURS 7:00 

AM – 3:00 PM 



Judge Ann L. Aiken.  This case was in-
vestigated by the FBI and prosecuted by 
Judi R. Harper, Assistant U.S. Attorney 
for the District of Oregon.  Anyone with 
information about real or perceived 

threats of violence should call the FBI at 
(503) 224-4181 or submit a tip online at 
https://tips.fbi.gov. For immediate 
threats to life and safety, please call 9-1-
1.  The year 2020 marks the 150th anni-

versary of the Department of Justice. 
Learn more about the history of our de-
partment at www.Justice.gov/
Celebrating150Years. 

Hwy. 30 Fatal 
On Saturday, February 22, 2020 at ap-
proximately 6:30 A.M., Oregon State 
Police Troopers and emergency person-
nel responded to a two vehicle crash on 
Hwy 30 near milepost 82.   Preliminary 
investigation reveals that a gold Buick 
Regal, operated by Myranda Schultz 
(20) of Astoria, had stopped at the Knap-
pa intersection to proceed across Hwy 
30 onto Hillcrest Loop.  Schultz pulled 
into the path of an eastbound black Ford 
Mustang, operated by Cameron Rowles 
(72) of Warrenton, and was struck on the 
passenger side.  Enrique Sutphin (24) of 
Astoria was a passenger in the Regal and 
sustained fatal injuries and was pro-
nounced deceased. Schultz and Rowles 
sustained minor injuries and were not 
transported to the hospital. 

I-5 Fatal Jackson Co. 
On Sunday, February 23, 2020 at about 
10:39 A.M., Oregon State Troopers and 
emergency personnel responded to the 
report of a single vehicle crash on Inter-
state 5 southbound near mile post 23.  
Preliminary investigation revealed that a 
white 1996 Chevrolet SUV, Craig 
McRae (70) of Vacaville, CA. was 
southbound on Interstate 5 when for 
unknown reasons went off the roadway, 

rolled over, and landed in a nearby field 
off the shoulder off the freeway. 
McRae sustained fatal injuries and was 
pronounced deceased.  Interstate 5 was 
reduced to one lane for approximately 
2.5 hours following the crash. 

Substation Shot Up 
The FBI is offering a reward of up to 
$5,000 for information leading to the 
identification, arrest, and conviction of 
the person or persons responsible for the 
shooting of a Mid-State Electric Cooper-
ative Substation.  On June 1, 2019, un-
known suspects using high-caliber fire-
arms shot at a transformer and power 
regulators located at the “Mowich” sub-
station. Approximately 1,000 customers 
lost power due to the severe damage, 
which is estimated at more than 
$400,000.  To date, no group or person 
has claimed responsibility.  The seeking 
information poster can be found on the 
FBI’s website at https://www.fbi.gov/
wanted/seeking-info/shooting-of-
electrical-substation.  Anyone with in-
formation about the shooting is asked to 
call the FBI at (541) 773-2942 in Med-
ford or at (503) 224-4181 in Portland. 
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Miller's at the Cove  
Sports Bar & Grill 

 

Oyster Cove Square  
63346 Boat Basin Road , Charleston, Oregon 97420  

(541) 808-2404    
OPEN DAILY AT 11 AM  - Child Friendly ‘til 9 p.m. 

 

 

DAILY SPECIALS:   
Hand-Dipped Fish & Chips; Fish Tacos; Hand-Pattied Burgers   

Free WI-FI access during business hours 
HAPPY HOUR 7 DAYS A WEEK FROM 4PM - 6PM 

 

 

www.millersatthecove.rocks 

People’s Choice 
Awards 

Winners  
‘Bite of the Bay’ 

“Best in Show” 
“Best Bite” 

Brookings 
801 Chetco 
(541) 469-5391 
 
Coquille 
484 N. Central 
(541) 396-3145 
 
Coos Bay 
579 S. Broadway 
(541) 267-3163 
 
North Bend 
3025 Broadway 
(541) 756-2091 
 
 

Reedsport 
174 N. 16th 
(541) 271-3601 
 
Florence 
4325 Hwy. 101, North 
(541) 997-7178 
 
Newport 
550 E. Olive St. 
(541) 265-6604 
 
Lincoln City 
1025 SW Hwy. 101 
(541) 994-3676 

https://www.fbi.gov/wanted/seeking-info/shooting-of-electrical-substation
https://www.fbi.gov/wanted/seeking-info/shooting-of-electrical-substation
https://www.fbi.gov/wanted/seeking-info/shooting-of-electrical-substation

