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COVID-19 Fraud 
Schemes 

The Federal Bureau of Investigation 
(FBI), Department of Health and Human 
Services Office of Inspector General 
(HHS-OIG), and Centers for Medicare 
& Medicaid Services (CMS) are warn-
ing the public about several emerging 
fraud schemes related to COVID-19 
vaccines.  The FBI, HHS-OIG, and 
CMS have received complaints of scam-
mers using the public’s interest in 
COVID-19 vaccines to obtain personally 
identifiable information (PII) and money 
through various schemes. We continue 
to work diligently with law enforcement 
partners and the private sector to identify 
cyber threats and fraud in all forms.  The 
public should be aware of the following 
potential indicators of fraudulent activi-
ty:  Advertisements or offers for early 
access to a vaccine upon payment of a 
deposit or fee.  Requests asking you to 
pay out of pocket to obtain the vaccine 
or to put your name on a COVID-19 
vaccine waiting list.  Offers to undergo 
additional medical testing or procedures 
when obtaining a vaccine; Marketers 
offering to sell and/or ship doses of a 
vaccine, domestically or internationally, 
in exchange for payment of a deposit or 
fee. Unsolicited emails, telephone calls, 
or personal contact from someone claim-
ing to be from a medical office, insur-
ance company, or COVID-19 vaccine 
center requesting personal and/or medi-

cal information to determine recipients’ 
eligibility to participate in clinical vac-
cine trials or obtain the vaccine. Claims 
of FDA approval for a vaccine that can-
not be verified. Advertisements for vac-
cines through social media platforms, 
email, telephone calls, online, or from 
unsolicited/unknown sources. Individu-
als contacting you in person, by phone, 
or by email to tell you the government or 
government officials require you to re-
ceive a COVID-19 vaccine. Tips to 
avoid COVID-19 vaccine-related 
fraud:  Consult your state’s health de-
partment website for up-to-date infor-
mation about authorized vaccine distri-
bution channels and only obtaining a 
vaccine through such channels.  Check 
the FDA’s website (fda.gov) for current 
information about vaccine emergency 
use authorizations.  Consult your prima-
ry care physician before undergoing any 
vaccination.  Don’t share your personal 
or health information with anyone other 
than known and trusted medical profes-
sionals.  Check your medical bills and 
insurance explanation of benefits 
(EOBs) for any suspicious claims and 
promptly reporting any errors to your 
health insurance provider.  Follow guid-
ance and recommendations from the 
U.S. Centers for Disease Control and 
Prevention (CDC) and other trusted 
medical professionals.  General online/
cyber fraud prevention techniques:  
Verify the spelling of web addresses, 
websites, and email addresses that look 
trustworthy but may be imitations of 

legitimate websites.  Ensure operating 
systems and applications are updated to 
the most current versions.  Update anti-
malware and anti-virus software and 
conduct regular network scans.  Do not 
enable macros on documents download-
ed from an email unless necessary and 
after ensuring the file is not malicious.  
Do not communicate with or open 
emails, attachments, or links from un-
known individuals.  Never provide per-
sonal information of any sort via email; 
be aware that many emails requesting 
your personal information may appear to 
be legitimate.  Use strong two-factor 
authentication if possible, using biomet-
rics, hardware tokens, or authentication 
apps.  Disable or remove unneeded soft-
ware applications.  If you believe you 
have been the victim of a COVID-19 
fraud, immediately report it to the FBI 
(ic3.gov, tips.fbi.gov, or 1-800-CALL-
FBI) or HHS OIG (tips.hhs.gov or 1-800
-HHS-TIPS). 

Winter Traveling  
in Oregon 

Winter weather is here, and Oregon Of-
fice of Emergency Management State 
Search Rescue Coordinator Scott Lucas 
says Oregon is seeing uptick in lost or 
stranded travelers on foot and in vehi-
cles.  He is reminding Oregonians and 
visitors of ways to stay safe.  Lucas says 
the search and rescue community in Ore-
gon stands ready to respond when need-
ed, but that being safe and prepared 
should always be the priority. That 
means being having food, water, maps 
and other items needed for comfort and 
safety in the event you get lost or strand-
ed. Also, knowing your route and weath-
er conditions before you go is important, 
said Lucas.  “Technology should not 
replace sound planning when using GPS 
in your car, or for an adventure on 
foot like going out into the woods with 
your family this holiday season to 
look for a tree. Careless planning can 
result in discomfort, injury – or 
worse yet – loss  of life,” Lucas reminds 
us. “It is a good idea to have an emer-
gency kit in your car, and extra supplies 
when you travel on foot.”  Lucas recom-
mends not relying on GPS alone and 
using resources for Oregon travel like 
tripcheck.com or calling 511 for road 
conditions.  The Oregon Office of Emer-
gency Management Search and Rescue 
program supports a broad spectrum of 
search and rescue operations in Oregon. 
That mission includes coordinating ac-
tivities of state and federal agencies in-
volved in search and rescue, liaising 
with the Oregon State Sheriffs' Associa-
tion and other organizations, and provid-
ing on-scene search and rescue coordina-
tion when requested.  

Now is the Time to  
Prepare for Flooding  

With a wet, cold winter expected and 

burn scars prevalent from the 2020 wild-
fires in Oregon, it is important to be 
ready for flooding and landslides. Heavy 
rain can trigger mudslides and debris 
flows in steep terrain, and the risk is 
higher in wildfire burn areas.  Debris 
flows are rapidly moving, extremely 
destructive landslides. They can car-
ry boulders and logs in a fast-moving 
soil and water down steep hillsides and 
through narrow canyons.  To find the 
latest information on weather watches, 
warnings or advisories in Oregon you 
can visit the National Weather Service.  
If your home, work or driving route is in 
a watch area, here are some helpful 
pointers:  Stay alert and track the flood 
watch by radio, TV, weather radio or 
online. If told to evacuate, do so imme-
diately.  Listen to unusual sounds that 
might indicate moving debris, such as 
trees cracking or boulders knocking to-
gether. A trickle of falling mud or debris 
may precede larger landslides. If you 
think there is danger of a landslide, leave 
immediately.  Watch the water. If water 
in a stream or creek suddenly turns mud-
dy, or if the amount of water flowing 
suddenly decreases or increases, this is a 
warning that the flow has been affected 
upstream. You should immediately leave 
the area because a debris flow may soon 
be coming downstream.  Travel with 
extreme caution. Assume roads are not 
safe. Be alert when driving, especially at 
night. Embankments along roadsides 
may fail, sending rock and debris onto 
the road.  To prepare for a floods, land-
slides, or any emergency it is important 
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to have an emergency kit with necessary 
supplies. The Oregon Office of Emer-
gency Management recommends being 2 
Weeks Ready with enough supplies to 
last at least two-weeks. Be ready and 
stay safe.  For more information about 
what to do before, during and after a 
flood visit the OEM website. 

ONG Deployment  
Returns to Oregon 

SALEM, Ore. - More than 200 Oregon 
Army National Guard Citizen-Soldiers 
assigned to 2nd Battalion, 162nd Infan-
try Regiment, headquartered out of 
Springfield and Gresham, and part of 
Task Force Kosovo, returned home fol-
lowing their ten-month deployment to 
Kosovo, Dec. 8, 2020. The Oregon Citi-
zen-Soldiers arrived at the Portland In-
ternational Airport, Oregon and were 
greeted by senior leaders before later 
boarding buses to connect with family 
and friends at Camp Withycombe in 
Clackamas and Lane Community Col-
lege in Eugene.  The Citizen-Soldiers 
spent two weeks at Ft. Bliss, Texas for 
mandatory COVID-19 quarantine proto-
col prior to arriving in Portland. Since 
earlier this summer, Oregon Army Na-
tional Guardsmen have been returning 
home from the second-largest mobiliza-
tion since WWII. The final group of 
Soldiers who were deployed in Kosovo 
is scheduled to return home in the next 
few weeks before Christmas Eve. The 
last mobilization of Oregonians this size 
was in 2009 through 2010.  “2020 dy-
namic year, both home and abroad for 
the Oregon National Guard. We are hap-
py to welcome home our team members 
just in time for the holidays,” said Ste-

phen Bomar, Director of Public Affairs, 
Oregon Military Department. 

2019 ODFW Prosecutor 
of the Year Awards 

On December 4, 2020, Jackson County 
Assistant District Attorney Melissa Ler-
itz was presented the 2019 Oregon State 
Police Fish and Wildlife Division Wild-
life Prosecutor of the Year Award. The 
award itself consists of a wildlife print, 
which includes an engraved plaque that 
was underwritten by the Oregon Hunters 
Association. The award is sponsored by 
the Oregon Sportsmen’s Coalition, and 
was our 13th annual presentation of the 
award.  The prosecutors we work with 
play an integral role in helping combat 
wildlife crime by working to help bring 
those to justice who choose to disregard 
our state laws. Assistant DA Leritz was 
selected for her outstanding work in 
2019, and was specifically nominated 
for her ability to prosecute any fish and 
wildlife case that comes to her office, 
and for her availability any time of day 
or night.  Assistant DA Leritz is de-
scribed as not only caring about her job, 
but also caring about the resource. She 
has shown dedication and passion to-
ward the prosecution of those commit-
ting fish and wildlife crimes, and despite 
her increased work load at the District 
Attorney's Office, she continues to re-
quest to be lead on fish and wildlife 
crimes. Assistant DA Leritz also works 
actively with the Rogue Valley Team by 
putting on educational training to keep 
them current with case law.  Please join 
us in congratulating Assistant DA Melis-
sa Leritz for her outstanding work in 
2019! 

OSP & DNA 
Oregon State Police has partnered with 
the University of North Texas Center for 
Human Identification for over 10 years 
to process and upload missing person 
and unidentified person DNA profiles 
into the COmbined DNA Index System 
(CODIS).  UNT-CHI has also provided 
invaluable service to all 36 Oregon 
counties by sponsoring and managing 
the National Missing and Unidentified 
Persons System (NamUs).  Unfortunate-
ly, due to a loss of federal funds, the 
UNT-CHI can no longer process ANY 
missing person or unidentified remains 
samples outside the state of Texas.  UNT
-CHI will also be limited in their man-
agement of the NamUs website as of 
January 1, 2021.  DNA Analysis:  The 
OSP Forensic Science and Pathology 
Bureau will now be sought out by Ore-
gon law enforcement agencies to provide 
the services that UNT cannot.  In the 
coming days, we will communicate our 
analytical capabilities and limitations 
regarding the submission and processing 
of biological samples in missing person 
cases and unidentified remains cas-
es.  OSP cannot provide the suite of 
DNA examinations and services that 
UNT has provided in the past; however, 
we are committed to assisting Orego-
nians and Oregon law enforcement and 

will strive to provide DNA analyses to 
the best of our abilities. If you have 
missing person/family reference stand-
ards to submit for DNA analysis, please 
retain them securely until further no-
tice.  Additional information regarding 
future DNA services is forthcoming.  
National Missing and Unidentified 
Persons System (NamUs):  Death in-
vestigators and law enforcement agen-
cies routinely begin with the NamUs 
website to determine if DNA, dental 
records, and fingerprints from both miss-
ing persons and unidentified remains are 
available for searching and comparison 
purposes. In addition, families of miss-
ing persons access NamUs to provide 
and search for important information 
about their loved ones for “matching” or 
associating cases.  Negotiations appear 
to be ongoing regarding the maintenance 
and management of the NamUs website; 
the National Institute of Justice is ac-
knowledging the burden that suspending 
this national information repository 
would bring.  NamUs is a crucial tool to 
the forensic science, pathology, anthro-
pology, missing persons, and law en-
forcement communities. Our hope is that 
it remains a state-wide and nation-wide 
resource and service may continue unin-
terrupted.  Again, additional information 
regarding the maintenance and manage-

             Coos County Cops, January 2021, page 3 



ment of the NamUs website will be pro-
vided as we receive it.  Please direct any 
questions regarding the analysis of uni-
dentified remains and/or the OSP Hu-
man Identification Program to Dr. Nici 
Vance, State Forensic Anthropologist: 
nvance@osp.oregon.gov  Please direct 
any questions regarding DNA analysis 
for Family Reference Standards of miss-
ing persons to Stephenie Winter Serme-
no, OSP DNA Unit Supervisor: swin-
ter@osp.oregon.gov   

Former Police  
Detective Arrested 

On November 27, 2020, at approximate-
ly 3:58 P.M., Oregon State Police 
Troopers were dispatched to a multiple 
vehicle crash at the intersection of South 
6th Street and Crater Lake Park-
way.  The driver that caused the crash, 
later identified as, Thomas Dwayne Reif 
(27) was driving a silver 2013 Dodge 
Avenger.  Reif was a detective with the 
Klamath Falls Police Department, was 
on duty at the time of the crash, and was 
driving his assigned Detective vehicle.  
Just prior to the crash, Klamath County 
911 received a call describing Reif as 

driving recklessly down South 6th 
Street.  Reif was evaluated at the scene 
by Klamath County Fire District 1 per-
sonnel and found to be unresponsive and 
not breathing.  He was transported to 
Sky Lake Medical Center where emer-
gency department personnel were able to 
quickly stabilize him.  The Klamath 
Falls Police Department immediately 
requested the Oregon State Police take 
lead on the investigation.  Troopers be-
gan a DUII investigation and collected 
evidence the night of the crash.  Evi-
dence was sent to the Oregon State Po-
lice Crime Lab as part of the investiga-
tion.  Members of the Oregon State Po-
lice Criminal Investigation Division 
were brought in to work with the Patrol 
Division on the investigation.  While 
evaluating the evidence seized in the 
investigation, Troopers developed prob-
able cause that Reif had unlawfully ob-
tained and used drug evidence from an 
unrelated case in the course of his duties.  
Once lab results were obtained on the 
evidence, Troopers sought to arrest Reif 
for DUII, Reckless Driving, Recklessly 
Endangering Another Person, Official 
Misconduct 1st degree, Tampering with 

Evidence, and Unlawful Possession of a 
Controlled Substance (Schedule II con-
trolled substance – fentanyl); Thomas 
Dwayne Reif was booked into the Kla-
math County Jail on December 15, 2020. 

Driver Licenses for All 
law takes effect  
January 2021 

DMV release - Starting in January 
2021, the new “Driver License for All” 
law takes effect, and you will no longer 
need to provide proof of legal presence 
to get a standard Oregon driver license 
or ID card. The law was passed by the 
2019 Legislature as House Bill 2015.  
The standard driver license and ID card 
will remain as acceptable proof of driv-
ing privileges and as an identification 
document. The standard license or ID 
card, however, is not Real ID compliant, 
so you will not be able to use it to get on 
a plane beginning Oct. 1, 2021.  Ap-
pointment required:  To apply for any 
type of Oregon driving privileges or ID 
card, you must make an appointment at 
DMV2U.Oregon.gov. DMV adds ap-
pointment slots regularly to the online 
scheduling tool, with 15,000 being add-

ed today for March 2021. So, check 
regularly until you find a time and DMV 
location that work for you.  When you 
go to DMV for your appointment, wear 
your face mask and follow all other safe-
distance practices during your visit.  
What you need to qualify:  At your 
DMV appointment:  Provide proof of 
identity, current legal name and date of 
birth, such as your passport (current, or 
expired less than five years) or consular 
card; Provide proof of Oregon address; 
Provide your full 9-digit Social Security 
number (or certify you have not been 
issued an SSN ); Pay fees; Pass all re-
quired tests; Have your picture taken/  
The card design and fees will be the 
same as they are today. Also the same as 
today: If you do not provide proof that 
you are a U.S. citizen, you will not be 
automatically registered to vote under 
the Oregon Motor Voter Law.  Online 
services:  Many other common DMV 
services are available online or by mail, 
such as replacing a lost or damaged driv-
er license or ID card. Find out what’s 
available now at OregonDMV.com or 
DMV2U.Oregon.gov.  More infor-
mation:  Find out more about what docu-
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ments can be accepted, fees and other 
details about the new law here: https://
www.oregon.gov/odot/DMV/Pages/
HB2015.aspx  More about Real ID: Ore-
gon.gov/RealID.   

COVID-19 Vaccine for 
Dept. of Corrections 

The first Oregon Department of Correc-
tions (DOC) employees received the 
Moderna Therapeutics COVID-19 vac-
cine Monday, Dec. 28. DOC has re-
ceived enough doses to treat 400 people 
and anticipates regular access to, and 
distribution of, additional vaccines in the 
future. In the coming months, this pro-
tection will be offered and strongly en-
couraged to all DOC staff, contractors, 
Oregon Corrections Enterprises employ-
ees, and adults in custody (AICs). Priori-
tization of vaccines will be determined 
by guidance from the Oregon Health 
Authority (OHA), the Centers for Dis-
ease Control and Prevention (CDC), the 
Advisory Committee on Immunization 
Practices (ACIP), and the Governor’s 
Office.  Dr. Warren Roberts, DOC’s 
Chief Medical Director, was one of the 
first employees to receive the vaccine. 
Dr. Roberts shares, “Today, I received 
the first of two doses for my COVID-19 
vaccination. I strongly encourage all 
DOC employees, the people we incar-
cerate, and the public to also get vac-
cinated as soon as it is available to them. 
This virus has wreaked havoc in our 
communities, and I am sure, like me, 
many of you are ready to get back to 
normal life. As the Chief Medical Of-
ficer for the Department of Corrections, 
I’ve seen first-hand the epidemic in the 

prison setting and know we need to fight 
back with all tools available. Some of 
the worst outbreaks in Oregon have been 
in institutional settings and this virus 
does not stay behind the prison walls, it 
seeps out into the surrounding communi-
ty. Vaccinations at DOC begin with in-
dividuals who are in close contact with 
COVID-19-positive individuals and in-
fectious materials. This includes medical 
providers and nurses, transport employ-
ees, security staff working on COVID-
19 units and/or performing hospital 
watches, and a small number of AICs 
whose work assignments involve clean-
ing and disinfecting in COVID-19-
positive units.   “The 13,000 adults in 
DOC custody miss seeing their friends 
and family, and vaccines will help us 
open visiting again. And as essential 
public safety professionals, DOC em-
ployees and their loved ones deserve 
some peace of mind and protection 
against the virus. Again, I encourage all 
Oregonians to get vaccinated and help us 
turn the tide. Even if you are skeptical, 
please consider those around you – your 
elderly parents, your neighbors, your 
community members who have underly-
ing health conditions. We have all made 
sacrifices this year, but getting the vac-
cine is a heroic act and an enormous step 
toward protecting the lives of all Ameri-
cans.”  DOC is collaborating with our 
local public health officials, coordinating 
with the Oregon Health Authority 
(OHA), and following the Centers for 
Disease Control and Prevention (CDC) 
recommendations to prevent the spread 
COVID-19. DOC is following OHA’s 
guidance on long-term care facilities and 

law enforcement recommendations. 
DOC operates 14 prisons across the state 
and incarcerates approximately 13,000 
adults in custody. For information on 
DOC’s COVID-19 efforts, please visit 
DOC’s website at Oregon.gov/doc.  

 

Coos Co. 
 

Possible Road Rage 
The Coos County Major Crime Team 
and Crash Team were activated Sunday, 
Dec. 27, following a possible Road Rage 
incident in North Bend that resulted in 
the death of a 28-year old male.  Accord-
ing to a news release from District Attor-
ney R. Paul Frasier, authorities have 
turned to the public in an effort to help 
locate a person of interest in the case, 40
-year old Joshua James Thompson, 
whose last known address was in Co-
quille.  Frasier says the incident began 
about 11:27 a.m. on the 2700 block of 
Union Ave.  “Officers responded to the 
scene and found North Bend resident 
Michael David Moore deceased.  He 
suffered from what appeared to be ex-
tensive crush type injuries.”  Three vehi-
cles were reportedly involved in the 
Road Rage, a black Ford Ranger pickup 
and a Chevrolet Tahoe.  The third vehi-
cle was described as a Honda Prelude, 
red in color with a light-colored hood.  
The suspect reportedly fled the scene in 
the Prelude.  “The investigation suggests 
that this incident commenced near the 
Liberty Theater in downtown North 
Bend.  It then proceeded south on Sher-
man Avenue turning west on either Ore-
gon or Maryland Avenues then turning 
south on Union Avenue.  One of the 
vehicles, the black Ford Ranger, crashed 
into a curb and became undrivable. It is 
believed that Mr. Moore was an occu-

pant of the black Ford Ranger.  Mr. 
Moore exited the vehicle and confronted 
the driver of the Tahoe.  At some point 
Mr. Moore and the Tahoe moved further 
south on Union Avenue.  The Tahoe 
struck Mr. Moore, running into the resi-
dence at 2719 Union Avenue and caus-
ing damage to the residence.  The Tahoe 
then left the scene followed by the red 
Honda Prelude.”  The Tahoe was found 
abandoned on Chester Street.  Anyone 
with information about Thompson’s 
location is asked to contact law enforce-
ment. 

North Bend Homicide 
Investigation 

News release from Coos Co. District 
Attorney R. Paul Frasier.  Dec. 29, 2020 
– “The investigation into the death of 
Michael Moore is continuing.  As of this 
moment the person of interest in this 
case, Joshua Thompson, has not been 
located by police.  The investigators in 
the case are especially interested in talk-
ing with any person who say Mr. 
Thompson at any time on Sunday, De-
cember 27.  Anyone with such infor-
mation or who knows the current loca-
tion of Mr. Thompson, is encouraged to 
contact the North Bend Police Dept.”  
Police are still interested in a red Honda 
Prelude, white or light colored engine 
hood, that is believed to be involved in 
this case.  “Despite what is being stated 
on social media, the vehicle is not a 
Mustang convertible.  Anyone who rec-
ognizes or has seen this vehicle is asked 
to contact North Bend Police."  A sec-
ond news release from the DA on Dec. 
29, stated the red vehicle had been locat-
ed in a remote rural area of North Coos 
County on private forest land.  The vehi-
cle turned out to be a red Toyota Camry 
with a sunroof.  It has been impounded.  
Frasier also reports that an autopsy on 
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Moore showed he died as a result of 
severe crushing injuries to his chest and 
abdomen.   

Ambulance Service  
Recognized 

SWOCC release - Coos Bay, OR –
 Southwestern Oregon Community Col-
lege is pleased to announce that our an-
nual Career Technical Education (CTE) 
Industry Partner of the Year award for 
2020 is Bay Cities Ambulance. General 
Manager Tim Novotny, and his team at 
Bay Cities Ambulance have served as an 
outstanding industry partner for South-
western’s Paramedic Degree program 
for many years. In addition to providing 
highly qualified instructors, Bay Cities 
Ambulance has provided the college 
with vital training equipment including 
the college’s ambulance.  Southwestern 
students are also able to complete their 
required field training through Bay Cit-
ies Ambulance in collaboration with our 
numerous community healthcare provid-
er facilities. And, Bay Cities Ambulance 
serves as a great employer partner with 
many Southwestern EMT and Paramed-
ics graduates finding successful employ-
ment with the ambulance service.  Dean 
of Instruction for CTE, Dr. Daniel 
Koopman says, “Like so many vital ca-
reer technical education programs at 
Southwestern, our programs of study 
depend on the generous support and 
partnership with great companies like 
Bay Cities Ambulance. Thank you, Tim 
Novotny and congratulations to the dedi-
cated team at Bay Cities Ambulance!”  
To learn more about Southwestern’s 
career technical training programs visit 
www.socc.edu, or call 541-888-7371 to 
make an appointment with an advisor. 

CBPD Searches for SUV 
CBPD release - On December 8, 2020, 
at approximately 1205 hours, the Coos 
Bay Police Department received a 9-1-1 
call from a citizen in the parking lot of 
Banner Bank, downtown Coos Bay. The 
caller reported a suspicious vehicle, de-
scribed as a silver or grey newer model 
Mitsubishi Outlander SUV with either 
no license plates or a license plate cover, 
had followed her from North Bend into 
Coos Bay almost crashing into her mul-
tiple times along the way. The caller 
reported she got out of her vehicle at 
Banner Bank to use the ATM and no-
ticed the SUV had followed her into the 
parking lot. While she was at the ATM 
the driver of the SUV exited his vehicle, 
approached her vehicle, and proceeded 
to stab one of her tires multiple times. 
The driver of the SUV was described as 
a white male adult, in his thirties, wear-
ing a red AC/DC shirt and a mask that 
covered his face. The driver then got 
back into his SUV and fled the scene.  
The Coos Bay Police Department has 
reason to believe this subject has been 
part of several similar incidents, 
throughout the county, including at-

tempting to pull people over with fake 
emergency vehicle lights. Be cautious of 
these attempts. Remember: it is reasona-
ble for a driver being stopped to proceed 
to the nearest safe place to stop if they 
believe the location of a traffic stop is 
unsafe. We suggest turning on your 
emergency flashers to acknowledge the 
officer; and drive safe and at the speed 
limit to a populated or well-lit area to 
stop.  The Coos Bay Police Department 
urges anyone who may have information 
pertaining directly to the incident to con-
tact the Coos Bay Police Department at 
541-269-8911 or Coos Stop Crime at 
541-267-6666. 

Vehicle & Driver  
Identified 

CBPD release - On December 8, 2020, 
at approximately 1205 hours, the Coos 
Bay Police Department received a 9-1-1 
call from a citizen in the parking lot of 
Banner Bank, downtown Coos Bay. The 
caller reported a suspicious vehicle, de-
scribed as a silver or grey newer model 
Mitsubishi Outlander SUV with either 
no license plates or a license plate cover, 
had followed her from North Bend into 
Coos Bay almost crashing into her mul-
tiple times along the way. The caller 
reported she got out of her vehicle at 
Banner Bank to use the ATM and no-
ticed the SUV had followed her into the 
parking lot. While she was at the ATM 

the driver of the SUV exited his vehicle, 
approached her vehicle, and proceeded 
to stab one of her tires multiple times. 
The driver of the SUV was described as 
a white male adult, in his thirties, wear-
ing a red AC/DC shirt and a mask that 
covered his face. The driver then got 
back into his SUV and fled the scene.  
The Coos Bay Police Department pro-
vided information about this incident to 
the public seeking assistance with identi-
fying the person involved. Thanks to the 
involvement of our local community and 
greater Oregon community, the Coos 
Bay Police Department received several 
tips that have led to the identification of 
this vehicle and the operator.  The Coos 
Bay Police Department is working in 
collaboration with other jurisdictions to 
bring this person to justice.  The Coos 
Bay Police Department would again like 
to thank all of the citizens who made this 
case possible.  Since this case is still on-
going, no further information is availa-
ble at this time.     

Attempt to Elude 
CCSO release - On December 16th, 
2020 at approximately 10:17 PM, a traf-
fic stop was initiated by Coos County 
Deputies on Hwy. 42 near Hyland Rd.  
A red Hyundai Tiburon with no license 
plates had been observed by Deputies 
swerving out of his lane of travel in an 
area of construction near the junction of 
Hwy. 42 and Hwy. 101.  At the initiation 

of the traffic stop the driver, later identi-
fied as 32 year old Steven M. White of 
Coos Bay, accelerated to a speed of ap-
proximately 74 miles an hour. Deputies 
pursued the vehicle as it drove East-
bound on Hwy. 42 toward Coquille.  
Near the intersection of Hwy. 42 and 
Green Acres, Mr. White performed a U-
turn and drove the vehicle back toward 
the City of Coos Bay reaching speeds up 
to 90 miles per hour and driving in the 
wrong lane of travel. Mr. White ran over 
placed spike strips at the intersection of 
Hwy. 101 and Coos Sumner Rd. and 
then again later in downtown Coos Bay. 
He ultimately lost both front tires, and 
had both rear tires deflated, but contin-
ued attempting to elude Deputies.  Dep-
uties were aided by both the Coos Bay 
Police Department and the North Bend 
Police Department as the vehicle drove 
both in the correct and the oncoming 
lane of traffic through their cities. Due to 
the erratic driving pursuing deputies and 
officers backed into a “slack pursuit” 
once on Virginia Ave.  Mr. White’s ve-
hicle ultimately stopped functioning and 
caught fire near the intersection of 
Lakeshore Dr. and Morrison Rd.  Mr. 
White ran on foot from that area and was 
later apprehended by canine Deputy 
Odin.   
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Strangulation Charge, 
Bandon 

CCSO release - On December 20, 2020 
at about 1:34 PM, The Sheriff’s Office 
Dispatch received a report from a female 
stating that she was strangled by her ex-

boyfriend, 39 year old Dominque Peters.  
Deputies from the Sheriff’s Office and 
Officers from the Bandon Police made 
contact with Dominque on Rosa Rd. in 
Bandon. As a result of the investigation, 
Dominque was arrested and taken into 
custody without incident.  Dominque 
was transported to the Coos County Jail 
where he was booked and lodged on the 
charge of Strangulation.   

VRO 
CCSO release - On December 26, 2020, 
at approximately 10:00 A.M., the Coos 
County Sheriff’s Office responded to 

Noah Road in Coos Bay  for a report of 
Violation of a Restraining Order.  The 
victim stated her ex-boyfriend, 50 year 
old Raul Ramirez, had violated a re-
straining order served 24 hours prior by 
coming within one hundred and fifty feet 
of her and her residence.  In addition, 
another investigation had been conduct-
ed the evening of December 25, 2020 
resulting in Ramirez being wanted for a 
separate Violation of a Restraining Or-
der upon the same victim.   
As a result of the call and investigation, 
Ramirez was arrested for two counts of 
Violation of Restraining Order.  Ramirez 
was transported to the Coos County Jail 
where he was booked 

 

Oregon Coast 
 

Crestview Hills Golf 
Course Owner Killed 

On December 6, 2020, at approximately 
3:37 am, Lincoln County Sheriff’s Of-
fice Dispatch received a 911 call report-
ing a burglary in progress on South 
Crestline Drive, in Waldport. The report-
ing party told Dispatch her husband was 
fighting with a suspect inside the resi-
dence at the time of call.  Lincoln Coun-
ty Sheriff’s deputies responded to the 
scene and located Mark Campbell, 66, of 
Waldport. Campbell was pronounced 
deceased at the scene from injuries he 
sustained during the fight.  No suspect(s) 
have been arrested in connection with 
this incident.  The investigation is ongo-
ing. The Sheriff’s Office is being assist-
ed by the Oregon State Police Criminal 
Investigation Unit (CID), Oregon State 

Police Forensics, Newport Police, Lin-
coln City Police and the Lincoln County 
District Attorney’s Office. 

Central Coast Homicide 
Investigation 

The Lincoln County Sheriff’s Office is 
continuing the homicide investigation 
that began on the morning of December 
6, 2020 involving victim, Mark Camp-
bell. The crime scene has been processed 
by the Oregon State Police - Crime Sce-
ne unit. Evidence collected at the scene 
has been collected and referred to the 
Oregon State Police Crime Lab for anal-
ysis. No arrests have been made in con-
nection to the homicide at this time.  The 
Sheriff’s Office is actively being assisted 
by members of the Oregon State Police, 
Lincoln City Police Department, New-
port Police Department, Lincoln County 
District Attorney’s Office and the 
State Medical Examiner’s Office.  Lin-
coln County Sheriff Curtis Landers stat-
ed, “We are deeply saddened by the 
tragic death of Mr. Campbell. Our 
thoughts and condolences are with the 
Campbell family as well as our entire 
Waldport community.”  Sheriff Landers 
continued, “Mr. Campbell was a busi-
ness owner, city councilman and a friend 
to many. Our investigators will continue 
working diligently to ensure every step 
is taken to bring the person(s) responsi-
ble for this horrific act to justice.”  The 
Sheriff’s Office has been reviewing and 
following up with leads provided by the 
public. Investigators have received over-
whelming support from the community 
with information and potential leads to 
the case. Anybody with information re-
lated to this investigation is asked to call 
Detective Abby Dorsey at 541-265-

0683. Investigators are also asking resi-
dents with surveillance video systems in 
the area of Range and Crestline Drive to 
contact investigators at this same num-
ber. 

Waldport Homicide  
Investigation 

12.15.2020 – Lincoln County, Oregon - 
Investigation continues into the homi-
cide of Mark Campbell that occurred on 
December 6, 2020 in Waldport, Oregon. 
Sheriff’s Office Detectives, assisted by 
members of the Lincoln County Major 
Crime Team, continue to follow up on 
investigative leads, persons of interest 
and tips received from the public. Detec-
tives have executed multiple search war-
rants and have seized evidentiary items 
which have been submitted to the Ore-
gon State Crime Lab for analysis. Re-
sults are pending at this time.  Anyone 
with information related to this investi-
gation is encouraged to contact Lincoln 
County Sheriff’s Detective Abby Dorsey 
at 541-265-0683. 

Burglary Charge in 
Waldport 

The Lincoln County Sheriff’s Office 
received a report of multiple burglaries 
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that occurred at a residence located at 
1680 S. Crestline Drive, Waldport, Ore-
gon. The burglaries were reported to 
have occurred between the dates of No-
vember 24 and December 5, 2020. In-
vestigation revealed 52 year old Jack 
Edward Sigler of Waldport unlawfully 
entered the residence on multiple occa-
sions and removed valued property with-
out permission. Sigler was found to be in 
possession of several items stolen from 
the residence and was taken into custody 
by Deputy Dalynn Shinholster and 
lodged at the Lincoln County Jail on 
December 9, 2020.  On December 15, 
2020 Sigler was indicted by a Lincoln 
County Grand Jury on three counts of 
Burglary in the 1st Degree (164.225) 
and one count of Theft in the 1st Degree 
(164.005) related to the incidents. 

Shark Attack 
A North Oregon Coast surfer was bit on 
the leg by a shark Sunday, Dec. 6.  The 
incident occurred about 3:30 p.m. at 
Seaside Cove.  The male victim received 
a gash about eight-inches long, but the 
injury was not life threatening.  He was 
transported to a nearby hospital’s trauma 
unit. 

Bad Santa 
Just when you think things could not be 
more different in 2020 with this pan-
demic comes the tale from the Central 
Oregon Coast Thursday, Dec. 10.  Police 
dispatch started receiving 9-1-1 calls in 
the afternoon about a male dressed in a 
Santa suit walking alongside Hwy. 101 
with what looked like a handgun.  That 
got an immediate response by officers 
who quickly located 25-year old Jeffrey 
Stamps, decked out in a Santa outfit.  A 
little question & answer back and forth 
led to a pat down. That’s when Santa 
pulled out the weapon from his waist-
band and officers responded with a 
Taser.  Just a reminder this is going on 
alongside Hwy. 101 with vehicles pass-
ing by.  The Taser apparently didn’t 
have much of an effect through the Santa 
suit and Stamps took off.  He dropped 
the weapon, turned out to be all-black 
replica CO2 BB gun.  Santa gave up and 
was lodged in the Lincoln Co. Jail at 
Newport on charges of Assaulting a Po-
lice Officer, Interfering with Police, 
Menacing, Resisting Arrest and Disor-

derly Conduct.  The Santa suit was ex-
changed for jail overalls.   

Life Saving Story 
Kudos to two South Coast Law Enforce-
ment Officers who answered the call and 
risked their own lives to save an elderly 
couple during a house fire.  The event 
occurred late Nov. 12, 2020, but what 
took place wasn’t widely reported until a 
month later.  From the Oregon State 
Police, “An amazing lifesaving story.  
On November 12, 2020 at approximately 
11:05 P.M., Deputy Stout from Curry 
County Sheriff's Office was dispatched 
to a structure fire in Brookings, Oregon. 
Deputy Stout and OSP Trooper Erik 
Holland were first on scene. The house 
was 2 stories and was fully engulfed in 
flames. When they arrived on scene, 
there was no information about occu-
pants inside. The weather was stormy 
and heavy winds swirled in the canyon. 
They were unsure where the driveway 
was located as the house was up a hill. 
Deputy Stout parked up the hill and 
Trooper Holland parked down the hill. 
As Deputy looked up the driveway, he 
observed an elderly lady scurrying down 
the driveway with her walker. He then 
looked for Trooper Holland. He spotted 
Trooper Holland fireman carrying an 
elderly man who was disabled. The man 
appeared out of it as he was unable to 
walk and did not have proper clothing 
on. Trooper Holland carried the man 
approximately 50-75 yards away from 
the burning house, exploding cars, and 
exploding cooking grilles. Trooper Hol-
land saw the exploding cars and contin-
ued to carry the man down the entire 
driveway. Trooper Holland’s bravery, 
courage, and self-less act saved a hu-
man’s life that night.  When you ask a 
Trooper about these types of incidents 
the answers always come back very sim-
ilar: All in a day’s work and I was so 
happy that I was in the right place at the 
right time.  A great example of 
#teamwork by your public safety agen-
cies here in #Oregon.” 

Death in the Van Duzer 
Corridor 

On Thursday, December 10, 2020 Ore-
gon State Police Major Crimes Detec-
tives responded to the H.B. Van Duzer 

Forest State Scenic Corridor for a death 
investigation.  The area is a heavily 
wooded state park in Lincoln County, 
Oregon.  Due to the terrain OSP Detec-
tives were assisted by Lincoln County 
SAR members.  At this time the de-
ceased has yet to be positively identified. 
No further information regarding this 
individual is available for release until 
identity is established and next of kin 
can be notified.  An investigation into 
the circumstances of this incident is ac-
tive and ongoing. No further details are 
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available for release at this time. 

Van Duzer Corridor 
Death Update 

OSP release - Oregon State Police De-
tectives are seeking the public’s assis-
tance in identifying the remains of an 
individual discovered in rural Lincoln 
County.  On December 10, 2020, Inves-
tigators were summoned to the H.B. Van 
Duzer Forest State Scenic Corridor for a 
death investigation. At this location, 
investigators found the remains of a fe-
male child.  The Oregon State Medical 
Examiner’s Office estimate the de-
ceased’s age to be 6.5 to 10 years 
old.  She is approximately 3’10” to 4’6” 
tall, and had long hair that is dark brown 
or black.  Her race or ethnic origin has 
yet to be determined, but DNA analysis 
is not complete.  Due to the condition of 
the remains she had likely been deceased 
at least 30 days before she was discov-
ered.  If you have any information that 
might help investigators in identifying 
this child, please call 800-442-0776 or 
*OSP (*677).  No information regarding 
the cause or manner of death is available 
for release at this time. 

Multiple Vehicle Crash 
on Hwy. 101 

On December 13, 2020 at approximately 
11:41 A.M., a four-vehicle, serious inju-
ry collision occurred on US 101 near 
MP 40. Three vehicles were headed 
southbound: a silver, 2010, Infinity, 
G37X, followed by a silver, 2019, GMC, 
Sierra, followed by a silver, 2009, Nis-
san Xterra. A tan, Ford motorhome was 
northbound. Witnesses stated the Infini-
ty had been swerving out of its lane for 
miles prior to the collision and almost 
caused other collisions. The Infinity 
turned left into the northbound lane. The 
front of the Infinity struck the rock em-
bankment on the shoulder. The mo-
torhome struck the passenger side of the 
Infinity. The Infinity spun several times 
and came to an uncontrolled rest in the 
northbound lane. The motorhome con-
tinued forward and struck the GMC. The 
GMC spun around and came to an un-
controlled rest in the northbound lane. 
The motorhome continued forward and 
swerving right to avoid going over a 
cliff. The motor home then struck the 

front of the Nissan. The Nissan spun 
around and then the motorhome struck 
the driver side of the Nissan pushing it 
up against the rock embankment on the 
northbound shoulder. The Nissan came 
to an uncontrolled rest. The motorhome 
came to an uncontrolled rest blocking 
both lanes. The driver of the Infinity was 
transported by ground ambulance and 
then air ambulance to Legacy Emanuel 
Hospital. The passenger of the Infinity 
was transported by ground ambulance to 
Tillamook Hospital. The passenger of 
the motorhome was transported by 
ground ambulance to a hospital in 
Clatsop Co. The motorhome was towed 
by Burden's towing and all others were 
towed by South County Towing.  The 
highway was closed for approximately 
4.3 hours. OSP was assisted by Tilla-
mook County Sherriff’s Office, Manza-
nita Police Department and Nehalem 
Bay Fire and Rescue. A Collison recon-
structionist was called to the scene. Mul-
tiple empty alcohol containers were 
found in Infinity and the driver of that 
car admitted to drinking and using co-
caine that day. Exigent blood was taken 
from the driver of the Infinity on scene.  
The investigation is ongoing. 

Pedestrian Hit  
on Hwy. 101 

On Wednesday, November 25, 2020 at 
about 5:19 PM, Lincoln City Police Of-
ficers were dispatched to a pedestrian 
struck by a vehicle at the intersection of 
Highway 101 and NW 15th Street in 
Lincoln City.  Lincoln City Police Offic-
ers arrived to find a female lying in the 
roadway near the intersection. An off-
duty firefighter rendered aid until medics 
arrived on scene. The female identified 
as 40-year-old Shannon Hogan of Lin-
coln City sustained multiple fractures 
and internal injuries was transported by 
ambulance to Legacy Emmanuel Hospi-
tal. She is expected to survive her inju-
ries.  During the subsequent crash inves-
tigation it was learned that the female 
had been crossing Highway 101 in a 
marked crosswalk when she was struck 
by a vehicle traveling south. The impact 
caused the female to be thrown into 
northbound traffic and she was struck by 
an additional vehicle traveling north. 
The drivers of both of the involved vehi-

cles remained on scene and were cooper-
ative with the investigation.  At the time 
of the crash the road surface was wet 
and it was dark, but there were function-
ing street lights in the area. The female 
was wearing moderately bright clothing 
at the time she was hit.  Due to the na-
ture of this incident, the Lincoln County 
Major Crash Team was activated and 
requested to respond and assisted with 
the investigation. Assistance at the crash 
scene was provided by members of the 
crash team from the Lincoln County 
Sheriff’s Department, the Oregon State 
Police, the Lincoln City Police Depart-
ment, and the Lincoln County District 
Attorney’s Office. Additional assistance 
was provided by North Lincoln Fire & 
Rescue personnel and from the ODOT 
Incident Response team. The south-
bound and northbound lanes of Hwy 101 
were closed for several hours while the 
crash was being investigated, with traffic 
being diverted around the scene on area 
side streets.  There is no indication at 
this time that speed or alcohol impair-
ment were factors in this incident and no 
citations were issued. The investigation 
is open and anyone with information 
should contact the Lincoln City Police 
Department at 541-994-3636. 

Bags of Chia Seeds 
Wash Ashore on  

Central Coast 
OPRD release - Oregon Parks and Rec-
reation Department (OPRD) is cleaning 
up several bags of chia seeds that 
washed ashore near Florence and New-
port this week.  Unusual commercial-
sized bags of “sludge” were reported just 
north of Nye Beach the morning of Dec. 
22. Later that day, another beachgoer 
discovered the likely source just north of 
Florence: a battered chunk of a shipping 

container and two bags of seeds nearby.  
Although the seeds are not toxic, they do 
expand when they come into contact 
with water.  “The bags were too heavy to 
move by hand. We had to cut them up to 
remove them, or use equipment to haul 
them out,” said ranger Jason Hennessey.  
At least four bags have sprouted ashore 
so far. OPRD is still tracking down in-
formation about the source. People can 
help the agency by reporting any addi-
tional bags — as well as any other beach 
debris — to beach.debris@oregon.gov. 
For safety reasons, it’s best for individu-
als to avoid moving debris themselves.  
This situation is a good reminder to all 
to pack out your own trash. Some beach 
access parking lots have cleanup bags, 
but it’s good practice to carry some from 
home. For information on keeping Ore-
gon’s beaches clean, go to solveore-
gon.org or surfrider.org.  

Curry Co. Drowning 
The body of a 29-year old California 
male was recovered near the entrance of 
the Rogue River at Gold Beach on Sat-
urday, Dec. 26.  A citizen reported the 
body to the Curry Co. Sheriff’s Office 
who responded with two Marine Depu-
ties and a boat.  They recovered the body 
of Hector Camarena, of Redwood City, 
CA.  Deputies recognized him as an in-
dividual they had contacted in late No-
vember at the Lobster Creek 
Campground, nine-miles east of Gold 
Beach.  It was reported that Camarena 
had dove into the river on that date, but 
was pulled to safety and transported to 
the hospital.  The campground host re-
ported him missing on November 30. 

Clatsop Co. Shooting 
A North Oregon Coast law enforcement 
officer shot and killed a woman Monday 
afternoon, Dec. 28 who allegedly broke 
into an occupied house near the ocean in 
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Clatsop Co. and barricaded herself in-
side a room with several weapons.  The 
unidentified female reportedly fired at 
least one round inside the house, left 
through a backdoor, but climbed up on 
the roof and brandished a gun at officers.  
They responded with deadly force.   

 

Douglas Co. 
 

Meth Bust Douglas Co. 
On Tuesday, December 1st, 2020, at 
approximately 10:00 PM, members of 
the Douglas Interagency Narcotics Team 
(DINT) executed a search warrant at a 
residence in the 100 block of Summer-
wood Court, Roseburg (Green Dis-
trict).  There has been a consistent level 
of high volume vehicle and foot traffic 
coming and going from the residence for 
a long period of time.  The activity at the 
residence has been suspected to be drug 
related, as well as other types of lower 
level criminal activity.  Residences like 

this cause substantial livablity problems 
for the surrounding neighbor-
hood.  DINT, as well as the other local 
law enforcement agencies try to address 
these issues whenever, and wherever 
possible.  After developing an investiga-
tion, DINT obtained a search warrant for 
the residence, and with the help of the 
Douglas County Sheriff's Office, execut-
ed the warrant at approximately 10:00 
PM.  The residence contained numerous 
people and was secured without inci-
dent.  A search of the residence revealed 
approximately 1/2 pound of metham-
phetamine, an extensive amount of mari-
juana, and other drug parapherna-
lia.  Only two arrests were made.  21 
year old Joey Dingus, of Dillard, was 
arrested as he had an outstanding war-
rant for his arrest for Parole Viola-
tion.  48 year old Oscar Herrera, of Fres-
no, California, was also arrested.  He 
was charged with Unlawful Possession 
of Methamphetamine and Unlawful De-
livery of Methamphetamine.  Both sub-
jects were lodged at the Douglas County 

Jail.  

Douglas Co. Meth Bust 
On Thursday, December 10th, Myrtle 
Creek Police arrested 36 year old Chad 
Allrunner, of Bend, Oregon, on Main 
Street in Myrtle Creek.  Allrunner was 
taken into custody on an outstanding 
warrant for his arrest out of Deschutes 
County.  Detectives with the Douglas 
Interagency Narcotics Team became 
involved and requested the assistance of 
a drug detection canine.  Winston Police 
responded with canine "Buster".  Buster 
alerted to the presence of controlled sub-
stances in Allrunner's vehicle.  A search 
of the vehicle revealed a small amount 
of suspected methamphetamine, and 
other drug paraphernalia.  A search of 
Allrunner himself revealed approximate-
ly 123 grams of suspected methampheta-
mine.  Allrunner was lodged at the 
Douglas County Jail on charges on Un-
lawful Possession of Methamphetamine, 
Unlawful Delivery of Methampheta-
mine, and is being held on the warrant 
out of Deschutes County. 

Firearm Arrest  
Douglas Co. 

Detectives with the Douglas Interagency 
Narcotics Team arrested 47 year old 
Kevin Davison on Wednesday, Decem-
ber 9th.  Detectives contacted Davison in 
the 4700 block of NE Stephens Street in 
Winchester where they took Davison 
into custody on an outstanding warrant 
for his arrest for a Parole Violation.  A 
pat down search of Davison revealed an 
illegal switch blade dagger in his posses-
sion.  Detectives also searched Davison's 
vehicle, finding a loaded handgun con-
cealed inside.  Davison was transported 
to the Douglas County Jail where he was 
lodged on the following charges:  Felon 
in Possession of a Firearm; Unlawful 
Possession/Concealment of Firearms; 
Felon in Possession of a Restricted 
Weapon; Parole Violation. 

Douglas Co. Courthouse 
Burglar Caught 

ROSEBURG, Ore. - Deputies have ar-
rested a man who broke into the Douglas 
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County Courthouse Sunday night.  
On Monday, December 14, 2020, depu-
ties were notified of a burglary which 
had occurred sometime over the week-
end. An employee reporting for work at 
the Courthouse noticed a door which had 
been damaged and reported it.  Deputies 
were able to obtain surveillance footage 
from the Courthouse which showed a 
male enter the building at approximately 
8:00 am on Sunday, December 13, 2020. 
Deputies processed the scene and col-
lected evidence to further the investiga-
tion.  The suspect was later identified as 
27 year-old Robert Darnell Kemp of 
Roseburg.  On Tuesday, December 15, 
2020, Kemp was contacted in the 200-
block of Jackson Street in Roseburg. 
Additional evidence was collected link-
ing Kemp to the burglary. He was taken 
into custody and transported to the 
Douglas County Jail where he was 
lodged on the following charges:  Bur-
glary II; Theft III; Attempted Theft II; 
Criminal Mischief II. 

Douglas Co. Pursuit 
OAKLAND, Ore. - On Wednesday, De-
cember 16, 2020, at about 1:00 pm, a 
patrol sergeant observed a white Chevy 
Tahoe missing a front license plate in the 
700-block of John Long Road. A DMV 
check showed the license plate had ex-
pired in 2016 and was registered a black 
Chevy Tahoe.  The driver of the vehicle 
was acting suspiciously and attempted to 
avoid deputies. A short time later, the 
sergeant and a deputy attempted to con-

tact the driver in the parking lot of a 
business. As they approached, the driver 
accelerated and attempted to get away 
striking the deputy's patrol vehicle.  The 
driver attempted to elude law enforce-
ment as he entered the freeway on-ramp 
at which point the vehicle rolled onto its 
side.  The driver, identified as 32 year-
old Noah Joel Kuro of Oakland, was 
detained a short time later. A female 
passenger, 28 year-old Jessica Nicole 
Cowart also of Oakland, was also taken 
into custody.  No injuries were sustained 
during the incident.  Deputies discovered 
the Tahoe Kuro was driving was stolen 
out of Washington state.  Both Kuro and 
Cowart were transported to the Douglas 
County Jail and lodged on the follow-
ing:  Kuro: Unlawful Use of a Motor 
Vehicle, Attempt to Elude - Vehicle, 
Fail to Perform the Duties of a Driver, 
Reckless Driving, Reckless Endanger-
ing, Criminal Mischief I, Probation Vio-
lation.  Cowart: Possession of a Stolen 
Vehicle. 

Two Hour Pursuit,  
Douglas Co. 

DOUGLAS COUNTY, Ore. - A Port-
land man is in custody following a two 
hour slow speed pursuit in a stolen vehi-
cle Thursday afternoon.  On Thursday, 
December 17, 2020, around 12:00 pm, 
a deputy attempted to conduct a traffic 
stop on a black 1991 Toyota Celica 
which was displaying the wrong license 
plate on Interstate 5 near milepost 88 
northbound. The driver, later identified 
by law enforcement as 47-year-old Jef-
frey Jay Fahey of Portland, failed to stop 
for the deputy which resulted in a vehi-
cle pursuit. Fahey lead deputies off of 
Interstate 5, onto Upper Cow Creek 
Road, through forest roads over the 
mountain and down onto Tiller Trail 
Highway at mostly slow speeds. Spike 
strips were deployed three times, each 
attempt successful, although Fahey con-
tinued to attempt to elude deputies.  At 
1:50 pm, the vehicle failed in the 21000 
block of Tiller Trail Highway and came 
to a stop. Fahey fled from the vehicle on 
foot, but was captured by deputies a 
short distance later. He was taken into 
custody without further incident.  Depu-
ties learned the vehicle had been stolen, 
but had not yet been reported to law en-
forcement. Fahey was transported to the 
Douglas County Jail where he was 
lodged on the following charges:  At-
tempt to Elude – Vehicle; Unlawful Use 
of a Vehicle; Possession of a Stolen Ve-
hicle; Reckless Drive; Reckless Endan-
gering; Escape III; Disorderly Conduct 
II ; Theft II; Possession of Stolen Prop-
erty; Interfere with a Police Officer; Ob-
structing Governmental / Judicial Ad-
ministration; Warrant.  The Douglas 
County Sheriff's Office was assisted by 
the Myrtle Creek Police Department, 
Roseburg Police Department, Jackson 
County Sheriff's Office and the Oregon 

State Police.  

Medal of Valor,  
Douglas Co. 

ROSEBURG, Ore. - A Myrtle Creek 
man was recognized by Sheriff Hanlin 
on Monday for actions he took in earlier 
this year at the scene of a vehicle 
crash in a small COVID compliant cere-
mony.  On February 19, 2020, at approx-
imately 7:00 PM, Scott Pettibone was 
traveling in the 2500 block of Can-
yonville Riddle Road when he observed 
the glow of a small fire off the side of 
the road.  As he got closer, he realized 
the fire was the result of a vehicle which 
had caught fire after crashing head-on 
into a tree. Pettibone stopped his vehicle 
to investigate and observed the shadow 
of a person inside the crashed car.  The 
driver of the crashed car was trapped in 
the vehicle and was pounding on the 
window screaming for help as the cab 
filled up with smoke.  Despite the engine 
compartment and a portion of the cab 
being on fire; Pettibone was able to get 
the driver's side door open, remove the 
victim and carry him to safety on the 
other side of the road. Pettibone then 
returned to the car to check for addition-
al victims before calling 911 at which 
time the vehicle became fully engulfed 
in flames.  On Monday, December 21, 
2020, Sheriff Hanlin presented Pettibone 

with the Sheriff's Citizen Medal of Valor 
for his actions.  "Scott Pettibone demon-
strated, in great degree, the qualities of 
selflessness and personal courage on that 
day," Sheriff Hanlin remarked. "There 
are no doubts that the victim would have 
perished in the vehicle fire if it weren’t 
for the decisive actions of Mr. Petti-
bone".  Pettibone, age 49, received a 
medal and a pin for his actions. The 
Sheriff's Medal of Valor is is the most 
distinguished award presented to a civil-
ian.    

 

USCG 
 

Coast Guard urges  
winterization of boats 

across the PNW 
SEATTLE — The Coast Guard urges 
the public to winterize their vessel as 
winter approaches the Pacific Northwest.  
Winterization is an important step, even 
if you live in a moderate region like the 
Pacific Northwest. Proper winterization 
will ensure your safety, prolong the lon-
gevity of your vessel, and help safe-
guard the maritime community and envi-
ronment around you.  The Coast Guard 
frequently responds to sunken vessels 
and oil discharges at marinas due to 
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poor winterization. Below are a few 
items to get you started but if you don’t 
feel comfortable performing these items 
by yourself, we encourage you to reach 
out to your boat dealer or local marina 
for assistance:  Remove excess gear –
 Removing gear that has accumulated 
over the boating season will make room 
for cleaning and any necessary repairs. 
This should include an inspection of all 
safety gear and replacing any expired or 
defective gear, including life jackets, fire 
extinguishers, first aid kit, etc.  Drain the 
water – Properly dispose of any bilge 
water and drain any fresh water tanks, 
fittings and lines. During this time check 
all boat plugs and seals to ensure they 
are properly set and ready for winter. 
This is an important step to prevent wa-
ter lines and tanks from cracking 
and preventing internal water damage, 
including mold.  Remove waste and ma-
terials – Use environmentally friendly 
chemicals when cleaning your vessel 
and remember to properly dispose of any 

chemicals, oils, and batteries. If you 
are not sure of where to dispose of these 
items, check with your marina or local 
authorities.  Whether you are going to 
keep your boat in the water for the win-
ter or take it out, we encourage you 
to disconnect your batteries, shut and 
lock all doors and windows, and secure 
all covers.  Before departure, double 
check all moorings and ensure they are 
securely set. If the boat is taken out 
of the water, shrink wrapping the vessel 
is also an option. Sealing the vessel is 
extremely important in preventing cap-
sizing due to heavy rainfall or icing.  Be 
advised that heat lamps pose a potential 
fire a danger due to improper size and 
wiring, poor grounding of extension 
cords, as well as placing too close to 
flammable materials.  As with all 
maintenance and repairs, consult your 
owner’s manual for any special recom-
mendations or concerns. 

Hiker Rescue  
Cape Arago 

USCG release - CAPE ARAGO, Ore. — 
The Coast Guard medevaced a hiker 
near Cape Arago State Park Saturday 
afternoon after he reportedly fell down a 
cliff and sustained injuries.  Watchstand-
ers at Coast Guard Sector North Bend 
received an agency assistance request at 
10:50 a.m. Local emergency responders 
had arrived on scene but were unable to 
safely transport the injured hiker from 
his remote location.  At approximately 
11 a.m., an MH-65 Dolphin rescue heli-
copter crew diverted from a training 
mission to respond. The aircrew refueled 
at Sector North Bend before arriving on 
scene at Cape Arago.  The MH-65 air-
crew landed on a nearby beach at ap-
proximately 11:45 a.m., allowing the 
rescue swimmer to disembark and assess 
the situation.  At 12:30 p.m., the aircrew 
hoisted the hiker into the helicopter due 
to the challenging terrain.  The hiker was 
transported to awaiting emergency medi-
cal personnel at Sector North Bend 
where he was reported to be in stable 
condition.  The Coast Guard urges pub-
lic, whether on the water or exploring 
trails on land, to remain aware of your 
surroundings and respect your limita-
tions. Always have a reliable means of 
communication to reach emergency re-
sponders. 

USCG Safety for  
Commercial Crab  

Season 
USCG release - SEATTLE -- The Coast 
Guard urges commercial fishermen to 
ensure vessel safety to prevent maritime 
emergencies before the opening of the 
Dungeness crab season scheduled to 
begin Dec.16.   Marine Investigators 
from Marine Safety Unit Portland have 
responded to over 95 marine casualties 
involving commercial fishing vessels so 
far this year. The term “marine casualty” 

is often misunderstood by mariners and 
is essentially any non-standard event 
that disrupts normal operations; like an 
emergency, accident, collision or dam-
age involving a vessel that occurs upon 
the navigable waters of the United 
States.  Certain marine casualties are 
required to be reported to the Coast 
Guard and are identified in 46 CFR 4.05
-1.  Immediately after addressing the 
resultant safety concerns, the owner, 
agent, master, operator, or persons-in-
charge of a vessel engaged in commer-
cial service, shall notify the nearest 
Coast Guard Sector Office whenever a 
vessel is involved in a marine casualty, 
involving a loss of life, injuries requiring 
professional medical treatment 
(treatment beyond first aid), grounding, 
bridge collision, loss of main propulsion, 
reduction in the maneuverability of the 
vessel, an occurrence causing property 
damage in excess of $75,000, or an oc-
currence involving significant harm to 
the environment.  In addition to the im-
mediate notice requirement, a written 
report is also required. The owner, agent, 
master, operator, or person-in-charge, 
shall, within five days, file a written 
report on Form CG-2692 (Report of Ma-
rine Accident Injury, or Death). Failure 
to make an immediate notification or 
subsequently file the written report with-
in five days could result in imposed 
fines not to exceed $40,640.  The Coast 
Guard reminds all commercial fishermen 
that prior to crossing a restricted bar 
between sunset and sunrise, they must 
notify the Coast Guard on VHF-FM 
channel 16 or 22A to provide their ves-
sel name, position, number of people 
aboard, destination and any vessel limi-
tations. After crossing, they are required 
to report back a safe transit or otherwise.  
Life jackets or immersion suits must be 
worn by all persons on deck, or located 
in any open areas of the vessel while 
crossing a restricted bar. Life jackets or 
immersion suits are required to be readi-
ly accessible for all persons located in 
any enclosed spaces of vessels when 
crossing a bar with restrictions in place. 
Life jackets are also required whenever a 
vessel is under tow or while being es-
corted across the bar by the Coast 

Guard.  Failure to comply with these 
requirements may result in a maximum 
civil penalty of $25,000.  “Without a 
doubt, Dungeness crab fishermen are 
anxious to start the 2020-21 commercial 
crab fishing season,” said Lt. Carl Esch-
ler, the assistant chief of the investiga-
tions division at Coast Guard Marine 
Safety Unit Portland.  “Be it their first 
time or 101st time navigating over a bar, 
fishermen are encouraged to contact 
their local Coast Guard station to famil-
iarize themselves with bar conditions 
and reporting methods. Contacting the 
Coast Guard prior to crossing a restrict-
ed bar between sunset and sunrise is 
more than just a good idea for commer-
cial fishermen, it is a requirement."  You 
can access current bar conditions and 
restrictions on your smart phone or hand 
held device by going to: https://
www.weather.gov/pqr/AllBars  Infor-
mation for each bar along the Oregon 
Coast can be accessed at: https://
www.oregon.gov/osmb/boater-info/
Pages/Water-Level-and-Chart-
Information.aspx   

USCG Medevac off 
Washington Coast 

SEATTLE – A Coast Guard air-
crew medevaced a man Monday, Dec. 
14, who suffered a severe hand injury 
aboard a commercial freighter 135 miles 
off the Washington coast.  Watchstand-
ers at the Coast Guard Thirteenth Dis-
trict command center received a call 
from Canadian dispatch in Victo-
ria at 9:30 a.m., reporting a 39-year-old 
male aboard had injured his hand and leg 
during a fall.  At the time, the vessel was 
located 135 miles west of Cape Flat-
tery en route to China.  The command 
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center launched an MH-60 Jayhawk 
helicopter crew from Sector Columbia 
River.  At approximately 12:30 p.m., the 
rescue crew arrived on scene, hoisted the 
injured man and proceeded to Astoria, 
Oregon. The patient was transferred to 
awaiting emergency medical services 
personnel at the airport just after 2 p.m.  
EMS brought the patient to Columbia 
Memorial Hospital for a higher level of 
care.  The patient’s current medical con-
dition is unknown. 

Lil Tough Guy Nets $159 
Million in Cocaine 

USCG release - PORT ANGELES, 
Wash. – The Coast Guard Cutter Active 
returned to its homeport of Port Angeles 
Friday following a 46-day deployment 
to the Eastern Pacific Ocean, Dec. 18.  
Nicknamed “Lil Tough Guy,” the Ac-
tive’s crew patrolled 10,056 total nauti-
cal miles off the coast of Central Ameri-
ca, deployed with an armed Coast Guard 
MH-65 Dolphin helicopter crew from 
the Helicopter Interdiction Tactical 
Squadron (HITRON) in Jacksonville, 
Florida, which specializes in Airborne 
Use of Force (AUF) and drug-
interdiction missions.  HITRON helped 
Active search for, detect and stop, drug 
smuggling vessels.  Pacific Area Tacti-

cal Law Enforcement Team (TACLET) 
personnel sailed with the Active and 
augmented the unit’s law enforcement 
capabilities, proving critical during inter-
dictions. TACLET are Coast Guard 
members that specialize in counter-
narcotics tactics and procedures and 
deploy aboard U.S. and allied navy ships 
that transit drug trafficking areas.  In just 
72 hours, the Active crew interdicted 
two vessels suspected of drug smuggling 
and seized approximately 4,200 kg of 
cocaine worth $159 million. These ef-
forts resulted in the detainment of 13 
suspected narcotics traffickers.  The U.S. 
Coast Guard narcotics interdiction ef-
forts aim to thwart transnational criminal 
organizations, which are fueled by drug 
trafficking money. Deployments like the 
one Active completed attack supply net-
works in Central and South America. 
Active’s success highlights the impact 
that a single Coast Guard unit can have 
when working with interagency and for-
eign partners.  “The Active crew gave 
everything to this deployment. We 
proved our readiness by adapting to an 
unscheduled embarkation of a HITRON 
helo and seamlessly integrated that 
crew,” said Cmdr. James O’Mara, Ac-
tive’s commanding officer. “We can-

celled port calls, extended patrol legs, 
stretched our fuel state and food stores to 
the limit, all in support of this mission. 
The crew answered the call, and they 
executed with distinction. Our success 
traces back to the support from our fami-
lies – and these results serve as a cap-
stone for an entire year of operational 
results, which have confirmed, for me, 
that no crew compares to Active. Peri-
od.”  On April 1, U.S. Southern Com-
mand began enhanced counter-narcotics 
operations in the Western Hemisphere to 
disrupt the flow of drugs in support of 
Presidential National Security Objec-
tives. Numerous U.S. agencies from the 
Departments of Defense, Justice, and 
Homeland Security cooperated to com-
bat transnational organized crime. The 
Coast Guard, Navy, Customs and Border 
Protection, FBI, Drug Enforcement Ad-
ministration, and Immigration and Cus-
toms Enforcement, along with allied and 
international partner agencies, play a 
role in counter-drug operations.  The 
fight against drug cartels in the Eastern 
Pacific Ocean and the Caribbean Sea 
requires unity of effort in all phases from 
detection, monitoring, and interdictions, 
to criminal prosecutions for these three 
interdictions by United States Attorney’s 

Offices from the Middle District of Flor-
ida and the Southern District of Califor-
nia. The law enforcement phase of coun-
ter-smuggling operations in the Eastern 
Pacific Ocean is conducted under the 
11th Coast Guard District's authority, 
headquartered in Alameda. The interdic-
tions, including the actual boardings, are 
led and conducted by the U.S. Coast 
Guard members.  The Active is a 210-
foot medium endurance cutter homeport-
ed in Port Angeles and routinely deploys 
in support of counter-drug, migrant in-
terdiction, fisheries, and search and res-
cue and homeland security missions. 

SAR Finds Overdue 
Christmas Tree Hunters 

Lane Co. Sheriff’s release - Missing four 
year old Zelda and her grandparents 
Sharon and Gregory were located today 
after getting their vehicle stuck in the 
Quartz Creek area of the Willamette 
National Forest on Monday while they 
were out looking for a Christmas 
tree. They were reported missing on 
Tuesday, December 22, 2020 when 
Zelda's mom went to pick Zelda up at 
Sharon and Gregory's house and there 
was no indication they had returned 
from the Willamette National For-
est. Lane County Search and Rescue 
teams along with deputies searched the 
area into the evening and throughout the 
morning. Shortly before noon today 
the family's vehicle was spotted by a 
U.S. Coast Guard helicopter team assist-
ing with the search. They were able to 
direct ground teams to the vehicle and 
found Zelda, Sharon, and Gregory safe 
and unharmed.  After getting the family 
into a warm place with some food and 
water, we learned that their car got stuck 
in an area with downed trees and snow. 
Thankfully they had a blanket, some 
water, a tarp, and snacks in the car, and 
were all wearing warm clothing.  A huge 
thank you to all of the Search and Res-
cue volunteers who assisted with the 
search, to the U.S. Coast Guard for their 
assistance, and to the community who 
kept their eyes out for the family and 
called in tips! 

USCG Locates  
Missing Trio 

USCG release - NORTH BEND, Ore. - 
The Coast Guard and the Lane County 
Sheriff’s Office located a 4-year-old girl 
and her grandparents Wednesday after 
they were reported missing in the 
Willamette National Forest earlier in the 
week. The girl and her grandparents 
ventured into the forest Monday looking 
for a Christmas tree.  The three were 
reported missing after the girl’s mother 
went to pick her up at the grandparents’ 
home in Eugene and found no sign that 
the group had returned from the forest.  
Investigators did not know what part of 
the forest they headed to, but cell phone 
signals indicate they were last in the area 
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of Fall Creek.  A Coast Guard aircrew 
aboard an MH-65 Dolphin helicopter 
from Air Facility Newport began search-
ing at first light on Wednesday morn-
ing.  After several hours of searching 
and a return to base for refueling, they 
located the family's vehicle stopped on a 
snow-covered road.  The vehicle ap-
peared to have a blue tarp placed across 
part of it, which made the white-colored 
car easier to spot from the air.  The air-
crew reported one person waving both 
arms at the helicopter, an international 
signal for ‘HELP.'  The aircrew radioed 
their position to search and rescue teams 
on the ground, who arrived on scene and 
found the family unharmed.  “We are 
thrilled to see this case close with a hap-
py ending,” said Lt. Bert Toone, co-pilot 
from Coast Guard Sector North Bend. 
“This holiday miracle should remind 
everyone to always let someone know 
where you’re going when you head out 
on an adventure and always go prepared 
for the worst-case scenario.”  

 

Police Logs 
 

Burglary 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Nov. 30, 9:51 a.m., 400 block So. 4th 
St., “burglary to office space.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Nov. 30, 10:18 a.m., 1000 block No. 
Front St., “out with one,” 40-year old 
Janet Austin-Lincoln arrested on CBPD 
warrant charging FTA on Unlawful Pos-
session of Meth, “cited in lieu of custo-
dy.” 

Shoplifter 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Nov. 30, 11:10 a.m., 900 block So. 
Front St., “shoplifter fight with staff,” 49
-year old Scott Charles Robinson 
charged with Robbery III, Theft II, 
Criminal Trespass I, and two-counts of 
Harassment, “cited and released from 
PD.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Nov. 30, 1:21 p.m., 100 block So. 7th 
St., “warrant service,” James Earl Wil-

son arrested on NBPD warrant charging 
Probation Violation on Unlawful Posses-
sion of Meth, CBPD warrants charging 
Unlawful Possession of Meth, Felon in 
Possession of Restricted Weapon, Carry-
ing a Concealed Weapon; also, CCSO 
warrants charging PCS Meth and Inter-
fering with a Peace Officer, “Wilson 
cited in lieu of custody.” 

DUII 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Nov. 30, 3:24 p.m., Empire Lakes & 
Hull St., “report of intoxicated driver in 
the park,” 62-year old Karen Ann Spen-
cer charged with DUII and Breath Test 
Refusal, “Spencer was cited in lieu of 
custody.” 

Suspicious Subject 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Nov 30, 4:20 p.m., 100 block E. 
Johnson Ave., “suspicious subject,” 31-
year old James Quintana charged with 
Disorderly Conduct, “Quintana was cit-
ed in lieu of custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 1, 39-year old Ruslana 
Vyacheslavovna Machuka “cited in lieu 
of transport to CCJ on warrant” charging 
Theft II. 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 1, 3:15 p.m., 2100 block Mari-
on Ave., “owner reported subject previ-
ously caught in house is back / officers 
respond,” 30-year old Matthew Garner, 
North Bend, cited for Criminal Trespass 
I and Criminal Mischief III, “cited in 
lieu of custody.” 

Indecent 
According to an entry on the CQPD log 
for Dec. 1, 3:11 p.m., Hwy. 42 & Cen-
tral, 36-year old Michael Garrett charged 
with Public Indecency, “cited in lieu of 
custody.” 

DUII 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 1, 12:07 p.m., 300 block W. 
Central Ave., “intoxicated subject just 
drove around the block,” 32-year old 
Savannah Gilkey charged with DUII-
Drug, “cited & released from PD.” 

 

Shoplifter 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 1, 3:22 p.m., 2051 Newmark 
Ave., Walmart, “shoplifter in custody.” 
22-year old Alysha Browning charged 
with Theft II. 

Disorderly 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 1, 11:01 p.m., Central & Third, 
“reckless burn,” 28-year old Mathue 
Meighan charged with Disorderly Con-
duct, Resisting Arrest, Attempted Reck-
less Burn, Unlawful Possession Meth, 
“Meighan was transported to CCJ.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 2, 6:26 p.m., “OSP served valid 
NBPD warrant” on 49-year old Eric D. 
Ekblad, Coos Bay, charging Unlawful 
Possession Meth & Theft III. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 3, 10:52 a.m., 2000 block 
Broadway Ave., “officer served valid 
NBPD & CBPD warrants, subject was 
cited in lieu of custody,” 29-year old 
Craig W. Hyatt, Coos Bay, charged with 
Placing Offensive Substances in Waters 
on Highways or Other Property, and 
Unlawful Possession of Meth. 

Arrest 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 2, 7:46 p.m., Newmark & So. 
Empire, “follow up,” 32-year old Mark 
Anthony Dixon charged with Criminal 
Mischief II, “cited in lieu of custody.” 

DUII 
According to an entry on the CQPD log 
for Dec. 2, 11:23 p.m., 600 block No. 
Dean St., “accident, DUII,” 35-year old 
Aaron T. Dickinson charged with DUII, 
Reckless Driving & Criminal Mischief 
II, “cited in lieu of custody.” 

Disorderly 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 4, 7:03 a.m., 1600 block Virgin-
ia Ave., “report of DOC subject threat-
ening people walking inside mall.  Of-
ficers located subject still inside, advised 
same subject from DOC case,” 45-year 
old Steven Zentz, North Bend, charged 
with Disorderly Conduct II, Resisting 
Arrest, Interfering & PCS Meth.  
“Referred to the DA Office.” 

Assault 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 4, 1:02 p.m., 800 block Wall 
St., “911 report from subject advising of 
assault he committed at location, suspect 
left, time delay 10 minutes, officers re-
spond with NB Medical to victim ad-
dress, officers contacted suspect at ad-
dress he advised he was at, assisted by 
OSP,” 27-year old Stephen Hudson, 
North Bend, charged with Assault IV 
Domestic Felony, Domestic Strangula-
tion & Criminal Mistreatment, “subject 
transported to CCJ.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 4, 8:59 p.m., “CBPD served 
valid NBPD warrant” on 41-year old 
Chad L. Fondren, North Bend, charging 
VRO, “cited in lieu of custody.” 

UEMV 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 3, 8:49 a.m., 2100 block Wood-
land Dr., “unlawful entry into MV.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 3, 10:59 a.m., 700 block So. 
Broadway, “request for subject to be 
trespassed,” 50-year old Curtis Alan 
Tarbox arrested on NBPD warrant 
charging FTA on Unlawful Possession 
of Meth, “Tarbox cited in lieu of custo-
dy.” 

Assault 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 3, 5:32 p.m., 200 block No. 
Empire Blvd., “result of assault/
strangulation,” 28-year old Eric Mitchel 
Jordan charged with Strangulation Do-
mestic & Harassment Domestic, 
“arrested and transported to CCJ.” 

Accident 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 3, 6:07 p.m., Newmark & Scho-
neman, “accident, CBPD warrant service 
on Redonna Darlene Ham”, charging 
Felony Probation Violation on Failure to 
Appear I, “Ham cited in lieu of custo-
dy.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 3, 10:54 p.m., “warrant ser-
vice”, 29-year old Craig Warren Hyatt 
charged with Unlawful Possession of 
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Meth, “arrested by North Bend Police 
Dept.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 4, 4:03 a.m., Central & 10th, 
“traffic stop,” 37-year old Andrew 
Thomas Wallace charged with two 
Douglas Co. SO warrants for FTA on 
Unlawful Possession Controlled Sub-
stance Schedule III, and FTA on Unlaw-
ful Possession of Meth. 

Burglaries 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 4, 11:58 a.m., 300 block 6th 
Ave., “burglary.”  At 4:15 p.m., 1300 
block Golden Ave., “burglary.” 

UEMV 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 4, 2:26 p.m., “unlawful entry 
into MV.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 4, 8:30 p.m., 1000 block New-
mark Ave., “result of criminal trespass,” 
41-year old Chad Lee Fondren arrested 

on NBPD warrant charging Violation of 
Restraining Order, “Fondren cited in lieu 
of custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 4, 9:36 p.m., 1000 block New-
mark Ave., “from traffic stop,” 35-year 
old Levi Doran Johnson arrested on 
CBPD warrant charging Unlawful Pos-
session of Meth, “cited in lieu of custo-
dy.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CQPD log 
for Dec. 4, 11:23 a.m., 100 block No. 
Adams St., “warrant service,” 37-year 
old Kevin King “cited in lieu of custody 
on warrants out of Eugene PD, Reed-
sport PD and Coos Co. SO.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CQPD log 
for Dec. 5, 9:24 p.m., 1300 block W. 
10th St., “result of suicidal subject,” 21-
year old Tristin Milo Fields arrested on 
Klamath Co. Jail warrant charging FTA 
on Theft III, “Fields cited in lieu of cus-
tody.” 

Dispute 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 5, 8:52 a.m., 1445 No. 
Bayshore Dr., Motel 6, “dispute,” 33-
year old Brian Naveen Dutt charged 
with Physical Harassment Domestic, 
“Dutt transported to Coos County Jail.” 

Mail Theft 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 6, 10:59 a.m., 600 block So. 
Main St., “theft of mail from mailbox.” 

Theft 
According to an entry 2051 Newmark 
Ave., Walmart, 23-year old Rebecca 
Lynn Henson charged with Theft II, 
“Henson cited in lieu of custody.” 

Business Burglary 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 6, 3:31 p.m., 2273 No. 
Bayshore Dr., Ace Hardware, 
“burglary.” 

Delivery 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 7, 1:22 p.m., 2800 block Myrtle 
St., “911 report, suspicious male hiding 
delivered boxes at neighbor’s house / 
officers respond, subject left area / boxes 
returned to owner at different address.” 

Prowling 
According to an entry on the NBPD lo 
for Dec. 7, 3:19 p.m., 2100 block Wall 
St., “suspicious subject around neigh-
bor’s house, left the area when RP con-
fronted him / info to officers / posted to 
local board.” 

UEMV 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 7, 9:26 a.m., 800 block Central 
Ave., “unlawful entry into MV.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 

for Dec. 7, 2:39 p.m., 100 block No. 
Schoneman, “civil service/warrant ser-
vice,” 32-year old Chad Duane Peters 
charged with Douglas Co. SO warrant 
for FTA on UUMV & Possession of 
Stolen Vehicle, “Peters cited in lieu of 
custody.” 

Shoplifter 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 7, 3:09 p.m., 2051 Newmark 
Ave., Walmart, 35-year old Jordan Mat-
thew Dixon charged with Theft II & 
Criminal Trespass I, “Dixon cited in lieu 
of custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 8, 7:56 p.m., 1600 block 
McPherson Ave., “911 report of verbal 
dispute at location / officers served valid 
CBPD warrant, subject was cited in lieu 
of custody,” 24-year old Deven J. Al-
bers, Coos Bay, charged with Assault IV 
& Harassment. 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 8, 4:05 a.m., 730 Newmark 
Ave., USPS, 49-year old Shad S. 
Ebinger charged with Criminal Trespass 
II, “cited in lieu of custody.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 8, 10:19 a.m., 149 So. 7th St., 
McKay’s, “shoplifter,” 49-year old Rob-
ert Shawn Liggett charged with Criminal 
Trespass I & Theft III, “Liggett cited in 
lieu of custody.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 8, 4:46 p.m., 1020 So. 1st St., 
Fred Meyer, 65-year old John Robert 
Bowen charged with Criminal Trespass I 
& Theft III, “Bowen cited in lieu of cus-
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Oregon Coast 
Police Agencies 

 

Coos Bay 
500 Central Ave. 

Coos Bay, OR  97420 
541-269-8911 

 

Coquille 
851 No. Central Blvd. 
Coquille, OR 97423 

541-396-2114 
 

Myrtle Point 
424 5th St. 

Myrtle Point, OR  97458 
541-572-2124 

 

Gold Beach Police 
29592 Ellensburg Ave. 

Gold  Beach, OR  97444 
541-247-7029 

 

Florence Police 
900 Greenwood St. 
Florence, OR  97439 

541-997-3515 
 

Lincoln City Police 
1503 SE East Devils Lake Rd. 

Lincoln City, OR  97367 
541-994-3636 

 

North Bend 
835 California Ave.   

North Bend, OR.  97459 
541-756-3161 

 

Bandon 
555 Hwy. 101 

Bandon, OR  97411 
541-347-2241 

 

Port Orford Police 
555 20th St. 

Port Orford, OR  97465 
541-332-3681 

 

Brookings Police  
898 Elk Dr. 

Brookings, OR  97415 
541-469-2163 

 

Reedsport Police  
451 Winchester Ave. 
Reedsport, Or  97467 

541-271-2100 
 

Newport Police 
169 SW Coast Hwy. 
Newport, OR  97365 

541-574-3348 
 
 



tody.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 8, 4:46 p.m., 1020 So. 1st St., 
Fred Meyer, 39-year old Leslie Threat 
Sumner charged with Criminal Trespass 
II, “Sumner cited in lieu of custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 8, 8:04 p.m., “warrant service 
by NBPD on CBPD warrant” charging 
24-year old Deven J. Albers with As-
sault IV & Harassment, “arrested by 
NBPD.” 

Warrants 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 9, 11:28 a.m., “CBPD served 
our 6 warrant on” 55-year old Troy Ad-
am Boyer, charging Criminal Trespass I, 
Theft III, FTA on Citation, Criminal 
Trespass II, Disorderly Conduct II X4, 
FTA on Citation, Criminal Trespass II, 
FTA on Citation. 

Warrants 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 9, 11:17 a.m., Newmark Ave., 
& Circle H Storage, “out with subject 
has warrants,” 23-year old Caleb Charles 
Moffett charged with Disorderly Con-
duct II, and 55-year old Troy Adam 
Boyer charged with two CBPD warrants 
for Criminal Trespass I and FTA on 
Criminal Citation; six NBPD warrants 
charging Criminal Trespass I & Theft 
III, FTA on Criminal Citation, Criminal 
Trespass II, four-counts Disorderly Con-
duct II, FTA on Criminal Citation, Crim-
inal Trespass II, and FTA on Criminal 
Citation, “both cited in lieu of custody.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 9, 2:47 p.m., 1100 block New-
mark Ave., 23-year old Caleb Moffett 
charged with Criminal Trespass II, 
“Moffett was cited in lieu of custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 9, 9:50 p.m., 200 block Holland 
St., “suspicious circumstances,” 39-year 
old Stephanie Kay Terry arrested on 
Multnomah Co. SO warrant charging 
two-counts of Identity Theft, “cited in 
lieu of custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 10, 11:04 a.m., “Douglas Coun-
ty SO served out warrant on” 25-year 
old Tanner Lawrence Sanders charging 
Felon in Possession of Restricted Weap-
on and Criminal Trespass II. 

Home Burglary 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 10, 1:25 p.m., 3500 block Ches-
ter St., “house broken into / report taken 
for Burglary I, Theft II & Criminal Mis-
chief II. 

Individuals 
Entries on the NBPD log for Dec. 10, 
involving individuals on the streets.   At 
11:32 a.m., 1300 block Virginia Ave., 
“male transient yelling & screaming / 
officers responded, subject was warned 
for DOC.  At 12:46 p.m., McCullough 
Bridge, “male subject yelling and shak-
ing fists on the McCullough Bridge / 
subject was given a courtesy ride to the 
North Side.”  At 12:50 p.m., Oak & 
Newmark, “male subject talking to him-
self swinging a knife around / officers 
responded, checked area UTL, GPA.”  
At 3:48 p.m., 1800 block Newmark St., 
“several transients in parking lot request 
them to be trespassed / officer respond-
ed, subjects were permanently trespassed 
from business and left area.”  At 10:55 
p.m., 1900 block Virginia Ave., 
“trespass request for DOC subject that 
left on foot from location, officer ATL 
area; UTL.” 

 

Unauthorized Use 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 10, 2:01 a.m., 400 block 4th 
Ave., “stolen vehicle,” 19-year old Kody 
M. Hamilton-Cochell charged with Hit 
& Run with Property Damage, UUMV, 
DUII, & Operating Without License, 
“cited in lieu of custody.” 

UEMV 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 10, 7:19 a.m., 1988 Newmark 
Ave., SWOCC, “report possible vehicle 
break in.” 

Indecent 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 10, 10:43 p.m., 100 block No. 
Wasson St., “indecent exposure.” 

Probation Violation 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 11 9:27 a.m., 465 Johannesen 
Ave., 34-year old Mark Eugene Hendrix 
charged with Probation Violation and 
cited for Criminal Trespass II, “Hendrix 
transported to Reedsport City Jail by 
Parole & Probation.   

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 11, 11:21 a.m., 1115 SE Jack-
son St., Linn County, “Linn County Jail 
served CBPD” warrant on 46-year old 
Michelle Day charging FTA on Resist-
ing Arrest, Interfering With Peace, Pa-
role Probation Officer, FTA on Theft II, 
FTA on FTA on Criminal Citation, FTA 
Theft II, FTA on FTA II.  “Day lodged 
Linn County Jail.” 

Harassment 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 11, 12:59 p.m., 700 block Tele-
graph Dr., “Domestic Harassment” 33-
year old Brian Naveen Dutt charged 
with Physical Harassment Domestic & 
Violation of Court Ordered of No Con-
tact Order. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 12, 7:37 p.m., 1360 Airport Ln., 
OSP, “warrant service,” 46-year old 
David Leslie Elbert arrested on CBPD 
warrant for FTA on Unlawful Posses-
sion of Meth, “served by OSP – Coos 
Bay.” 
 

What it is Like on the 
Streets 

Various entries on the CBPD log for 
Saturday, Dec. 12.  12:54 a.m., dispute, 
Motel 6, 1445 No. Bayshore Dr..  2:19 
a.m., 1775 Thompson Rd., BAH, 
“subject refusing to leave.”  8:38 a.m., 
810 Central Ave., Fast Mart, “disorderly 
female.”  9:26 a.m., Newmark & Wall, 
“male walking up & down the road yell-
ing.”  9:38 a.m., 500 Central Ave., 
“female yelling under City Hall.”  At 
12:45 p.m., Newmark & Marple, 
“disorderly conduct.”  2:12 p.m., 1020 
So. 1st St., Fred Meyer, “criminal tres-
pass.”  3 p.m., 825 So. 5th St., “mental 
subject.”  3:13 p.m., 500 Central Ave., 
“mental subject.”  4:06 p.m., 1400 block 
Newmark, “subject jumping into traf-
fic.”  4:19 p.m., 1175 Newmark Ave., 
Bay Burger Inn, “menacing.”  4:27 p.m., 
500 Central Ave., “mental subject.”  
4:38 p.m., 960 Arago Ave., “mental sub-
ject.”  5:55 p.m., 500 Central Ave., 
“mental subject.”  6:41 p.m., 130 No. 
Cammann St., McKay’s, “criminal tres-
pass.”  6:58 p.m., 500 Central Ave., 
“mental subject.”  7:50 p.m., 4th & An-
derson, “subject moving traffic cones 
around.”  8:54 p.m., LaClair St., 
“windows broken out of vehicle.” 

Before Sunrise in  
Coos Bay 

Various entries on the CBPD log for 
Sunday, Dec. 13, 12:29 a.m., 525 W. 
Anderson Ave., CB Public Library, 
“assault,” 1:16 a.m., 275 E. Johnson 
Ave., Edgewater Inn, “possible assault/
robbery.”  1:32 a.m., 1910 Ocean Blvd. 
Modern Floors, “broken windows at 
business.”  3:23 a.m., 200 block So. 
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Schoneman St., “stolen vehicle.”  3:33 
a.m., Hwy. 101 & Koos Bay Blvd., 
“disorderly conduct, male subject.”  5:10 
a.m., 1200 block No. Bayshore Dr., Star-
bucks, “subject sleeping in front of busi-
ness.”  5:53 a.m., 2640 Ocean Blvd., 
Umpqua Dairy, “rock thrown through 
business window.” 5:53 a.m., 2775 
Ocean Blvd., Franz Bread Outlet, “rock 
thrown through business window.”  6:58 
a.m., 1800 No. 28th Ct., Alder Acres 
Mobile Home Park, “criminal mischief.”   

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 13, 3:04 a.m., 500 block W. 
Anderson Ave., “result of follow up,” 38
-year old Kelly Allen Klepzig charged 
with Probation Violation & cited for 
False Info, also, CBPD warrants charg-
ing Unlawful Possession of Meth & 
Criminal Trespass II, and FTA on origi-
nal charge of Unlawful Possession of 
Meth, “arrested and transported to CCJ.” 

Unauthorized Use of  
Vehicle 

According to an entry on the CQPD log 
for Dec. 13, 3:59 a.m., 200 block W. 
Hwy. 42, “result of traffic stop,” 30-year 
old Ariel B. Adams charged with False 
Info to Police & UUV, “cited in lieu of 
custody and released.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CQPD log 
for Dec. 13, 1:44 p.m., E. 1st St., 40-year 
old Nathaniel G. Anderson charged with 
Criminal Trespass II, “cited in lieu of 
custody.” 

Package Theft 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 14, 800 block State St., “theft of 
package off porch / report taken.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CQPD log 
for Dec. 14, 4:57 p.m., Hwy. 42 mp 17, 
“result of traffic stop,” 41-year old Neva 
Mae McConnell arrested on Grants Pass 
Public Safety warrant charging FTA on 
Theft II, “McConnell cited in lieu of 
custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 14, 12:47 a.m., 3300 block 
Walnut Ave., “person stop,” 29-year old 
Kimberly Dawn Upchurch arrested on 
CCSO warrant charging Initiating False 
Report, “cited in lieu of custody.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 14, 9:02 a.m., 149 So. 7th St., 
McKay’s, 38-year old Melissa Louanne 
Lucas charged with Criminal Trespass 
II, “Lucas cited in lieu of custody.” 

Shoplifter 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 14, 7:45 p.m., 1020 So. 1st. St., 
Fred Meyer, 58-year old Celia Marlena 
Bridges charged with Theft III, “cited in 
lieu of custody.” 
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2017 Dodge Grand Caravan SXT Van  
White Knuckle Clear Coat 

Automatic 
Flex-fuel 

Pentastar 3.6L Flex Fuel V6 283hp 260ft. lbs. 
60,009 miles 

VIN:  2C4RDGCG5HR561793 
Stock #:  P3435 

 
Asking Price 

$16,995 
 

2016 Nissan Rogue SV Wagon  
Pearl White 
Automatic 
Gasoline 

2.5L I4 170hp 175ft. lbs. 
37,455 miles 

VIN:  KNMAT2MTXGP594187 
Stock #:  P3436 

 
Asking Price 

$15,995 
 
 

2012 Ford Flex Limited SUV  
Silver 

Automatic 
Gasoline 
3.5L V6 

108,110 miles 
VIN:  2FMGK5DCXCB002324 

Stock #:  P3432 
 

Asking Price 

$13,995 
 

 
https://www.jimvickautosales.com/view-inventory 

 

Jim Vick Auto Sales Oregon Dealer Lic. #6147  

https://www.jimvickautosales.com/vehicle-details/2017-dodge-grand-caravan-sxt-van-e1f9bb4379151143b7e110db31774a40
https://www.jimvickautosales.com/vehicle-details/2016-nissan-rogue-sv-wagon-8d6ebac9088353439ab8a43395cf40a2
https://www.jimvickautosales.com/vehicle-details/2012-ford-flex-limited-suv-bc66b5f32c11944e83a3a286a72d1be5


UEMV 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 15, 2100 block Newmark St., 
“UEMV, officer responded, report taken, 
will contact businesses to check for sur-
veillance.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 15, 2200 block McPherson 
Ave., “suspicious vehicle reported to 
have no plate or identifying emblems in 
a no parking zone, officers contacted 
occupant sleeping, issued cite” for 
CBPD warrant on 35-year old James 
Steven Spear, Coos Bay, charging Crim-
inal Driving While Suspended, “cited in 
lieu of custody.” 

Trailer Theft 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 15, 12:52 a.m., 1445 No. 
Bayshore Dr., Motel 6, “utility trailer 
taken from location, report taken for 
Theft I.” 

Tool Theft 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 15, 8:09 a.m., 100 block No. 7th 
St., “theft of tools from cargo trailer.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 15, 8:20 a.m., 1000 block New-
mark Ave., 27-year old Brianna Carol 
Huntley charged with Criminal Trespass 
II, “Huntley cited in lieu of custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 15, 9:05 a.m., “warrant ser-
vice,” 35-year old James Steven Spear 
arrested by NBPD on CBPD warrant 
charging Criminal Driving While Sus-
pended or Revoked, “Spear cited in lieu 
of custody.” 

Fraud 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 16, 2:47 p.m., 2200 block Ohio 
St., “report from citizen of theft of credit 
card from mailbox, used in amount of 
500, officer served valid Marion Co. SO 
warrant” on 32-year old Lacey Keenom, 
North Bend, charging Theft I, “cited in 
lieu of custody.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 16, 9:08 a.m., 149 So. 7th St., 
McKay’s, 32-year old Ashleigh Nicholle 
Irons charged with Criminal Trespass II, 
“Irons cited in lieu of custody.” 

Burglary 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 16, 2:47 p.m., 400 block So. 
Cammann St., “burglary.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 16, 2:55 p.m., 1020 So. 1st St., 
Fred Meyer, 31-year old James L Quin-
tana charged with Criminal Trespass I, 
Theft III & Resisting Arrest, “cited in 
lieu of custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 18, 2 a.m., 1500 block Sherman 
Ave., “OSP served valid NBPD war-
rant” on 45-year old James E. Fitzpat-
rick, North Bend, charging Unlawful 
Possession Meth. 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 18, 7:40 a.m., “Juul Insurance 
request 2 subjects camped on porch be 
trespassed / officer respond, had medical 
respond for one subject / both issued 
permanent trespass from location.” 

UEMV 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 18, 8:05 a.m., Safeway, “RP 
reported her vehicle entered yesterday 
while parked at location / stolen IPhone 
entered LEDS.” 

Disorderly 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 18, 10:56 a.m., 835 California 
Ave., “report of male transient who spit 
on RP’s truck and pounded on the win-
dows while driving in alley behind PD, 
unable to provide description / officer 
checked perimeter of PD, UTL.” 

Not Neighborly 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 18, 11:29 a.m., 2400 block Ev-
erett Ave., “report a neighbor hit the RP, 
ongoing problems / officers respond, 
report taken for Harassment, involved 
subjects instructed to avoid contact.” 

Firearm Theft 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 18, noon, 2400 block Montana 
Ave., “theft a firearm during gathering / 
report taken / RP will call back with 
serial number.” 

Rock Thrower 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 18, 12:41 p.m., 2300 block 
Tremont Ave., “report of subject throw-
ing bottles & chunks of grass onto high-
way / officer respond, Mill Security as-
sisted, subject warned for DOC and con-
tinued on foot.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 18, 12:55 p.m., “Newport PD 
served 3 valid NBPD warrants” on 66-
year old Brian J. Wills, North Bend, 
charging FTA 2nd Degree X2; Assault 
IV Domestic & Harassment.  

Brick Thrower 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 18, 1:41 p.m., Hwy. 101, 
“multiple reports of male throwing 
bricks and motorists on Hwy. 101 / of-
ficers contacted the subject, taken to 
BAH for evaluation.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 17, 7 a.m., 1000 block New-
mark Ave., “criminal trespass,” 22-year 
old Aubry William Jones charged with 

Probation Violation on Trespassing, 
“Jones cited in lieu of custody.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 17, 7:43 p.m., 1000 block New-
mark Ave., “criminal trespass,” 27-year 
old Brianna C. Huntley charged with 
Criminal Trespass II, “cited in lieu of 
custody.”  At 9:37 p.m., same location, 
Brianna Carol Huntley charged with 
Criminal Trespass II, “cited in lieu of 
custody.” 

Criminal Mischief 
According to an entry on the CQPD log 
for Dec. 18, 9:10 a.m., E. 1st St., Safe-
way Pharmacy, 31-year old Jason Doug-
las Bagley charged with Criminal Mis-
chief II, “Bagley cited in lieu of custo-
dy.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CQPD log 
for Dec. 18, 8:38 p.m., Hwy. 42S & 
Fishtrap Rd., 42-year old Tim E. Taylor 
charged with Curry County Probation 
warrant for Unlawful Use of Weapon, 
“Taylor was cited in lieu of custody.” 

Burglary 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 18, 3:58 p.m., 1100 block Cen-
tral Ave., “burglary.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 19, 7:39 p.m., 1900 block 
Channel St., “NB Medical, Medical & 
PD responded, served Washington Co. 
warrant & victim transported to BAH,” 
45-year old Michelle L. Smith, North 
Bend, arrested on Washington Co. war-
rant charging FTA on Assault IV Do-
mestic, Harassment, “cited in lieu of 
custody due to COVID-19.” 

Probation Violation 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 20, 1400 block W. Airport 
Way, 30-year old Matthew T. Garner, 
North Bend, arrested on “Parole Officer 
Detainer for out of County incident more 
than a violation, Subject transported to 
CCJ.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CQPD log 
for Dec. 19, 11:15 a.m., E. 1st St., Safe-
way Pharmacy, 31-year old Jason Doug-
las Bagley charged with Criminal Tres-
pass II, Criminal Mischief III & Theft 
III, “Bagley cited in lieu of custody.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 19, 8:19 a.m., 1000 block New-
mark Ave, 27-year old Brianna Carol 
Huntley charged with Criminal Trespass 
II, “Huntley cited in lieu of custody.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 19, 10:04 a.m., 1000 block 
Newmark Ave., 23-year old Caleb 
Charles Moffett charged with Criminal 
Trespass II, “Moffett cited in lieu of 

custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD lot 
for Dec. 19, 4:53 p.m., 411 W. 8th St. 
Medford PD, “warrant service,” Ed Ste-
phen Branton arrested on two CBPD 
warrants, “Branton was cited in lieu of 
custody.”   

 

Oregon Prisons & Jails 
 

Federal prisons:   
Federal Correctional Institution, Sher-

idan (1,350 medium security, 480 
minimum security). 

State prisons:   
    Coffee Creek Correctional Facility, 

Wilsonville (1,685 inmate capacity) 
    Columbia River Correctional Insti-

tution, Portland (595 ic) 
    Deer Ridge Correctional Institu-

tion, Madras (1,867 ic) 
    Eastern Oregon Correctional Insti-

tution, Pendleton (1,659 ic) 
    Mill Creek Correctional Facility, 

Salem (240 ic) 
    Oregon State Correctional Institu-

tion, Salem (880 ic) 
    Oregon State Penitentiary, Salem 

(2,194 ic) 
    Powder River Correctional Facili-

ty, Baker City (366 ic) 
    Santiam Correctional Institution, 

Salem (440 ic) 
    Shutter Creek Correctional Insti-

tution, North Bend (260 ic) 
    South Fork Forest Camp, Tilla-

mook (200 ic) 
    Snake River Correctional Institu-

tion, Ontario (3,050 ic) 
    Two Rivers Correctional Institu-

tion, Umatilla (1,878 ic) 
    Warner Creek Correctional Facili-

ty, Lakeview (496 ic) 

Youth correctional facilities 
Male 

    Eastern Oregon Youth Correction-
al Facility, Burns (50 beds) 

    Hillcrest Youth Correctional Facil-
ity, Salem (180 beds) 

    MacLaren Youth Correctional Fa-
cility, Woodburn (186 beds) 

    North Coast Youth Correctional 
Facility Warrenton (50 beds) 

    Rogue Valley Youth Correctional 
Facility, Grants Pass (100 beds) 

    Tillamook Youth Correctional Fa-
cility, Tillamook County (50 beds) 

Female 
    Oak Creek Youth Correctional 

Facility, Albany (75 beds) 
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Disorderly 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 20, 3:22 a.m., 1300 block 
Ocean Blvd., “disorderly conduct,” 46-
year old Christopher Allan Fiester 
charged with Disorderly Conduct II, 
“cited in lieu of custody.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 20, 7:27 a.m., 1775 Thompson 
Rd., BAH, “criminal trespass,” 46-year 
old Christopher Allan Fiester charged 
with Criminal Trespass II, “Fiester cited 
in lieu of custody.” 

Counterfeit 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 20, 3:39 p.m., 1075 Newmark 
Ave., 7-Eleven, “counterfeit money.” 

Probation Violation 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 21, 6 a.m., Ocean & Highland, 
“from traffic stop,” 40-year old Christo-
pher Daniel Hernandez charged with 
Probation Violation, “transported to 
CCJ.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 21, 6:45 a.m., 1100 block New-
mark Ave., “result of threats,” 30-year 
old Eithen Nicholas Nordholm charged 
with Criminal Trespass II, “Nordholm 
cited in lieu of custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 21, 12:26 p.m., 250 No. Baxter 
St., “warrant service by CCSO on CBPD 
warrant” charging 56-year old Kevin 
James Waldron charged with Unlawful 
Possession of Meth, “Waldron cited in 
lieu of custody.” 

Mail Thefts 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 22, 2:55 a.m., 1200 block 
Crocker Ave., “open mailboxes, possible 
mail theft.”  At 7:20 a.m., 3400 block 
Vine Ave., “theft of mail.”  At 9:01 a.m., 
1900 block Timberline Dr., “theft of 
mail.” 
 

UEMV 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 22, 10:49 a.m., 1100 block So. 
2nd St., “vehicle window broken and 
item taken.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 22, 2:39 p.m., Coos County 
Jail, Coquille, “warrant service,” 28-year 
old Jessica Lee Scott served three CBPD 
warrants charging FTA on Unlawful 
Possession of Meth & Theft II, FTA II 
& FTA II, “served by Coos County 
Jail.” 

Burglary 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 22, 5:08 p.m., 1900 block New-
mark Ave., “burglary.” 

DUII 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 22, 10:55 p.m., 1000 block 
Newmark Ave., “result of assist OSP 
with traffic stop,” 19-year old Carlos B. 
Gonzalez charged with DUII, “cited in 
lieu of custody and released.” 

UEMV 
According to an entry on the CQPD log 
for Dec. 22, 8:07 a.m., 1400 block Knott 
St., “unlawful entry in to MV.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 23, 2:21 a.m., 1000 block New-
mark Ave., “result of subject refusing to 
leave business,” 27-year old Brianna 
Carol Huntley charged with Criminal 
Trespass II, “cited in lieu of custody and 
released.” 

Trailer 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 23, 8:01 a.m., 900 block So. 
Broadway, “stolen travel trailer.” 

Burglary 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 23, 2 p.m., 900 block So. 8th St., 
“burglary.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 23, 4:47 p.m., 250 No. Baxter 
St., CCSO, “warrant service on” 51-year 

old George Hobbs, “Coos County S/O 
served warrant out of Coos Bay for 2 
counts Driving While Suspended or Re-
voked.” 

Shoplifter 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 23, 5:03 p.m., 1020 So. 1st St., 
Fred Meyer, “shoplifter,” 54-year old 
Midge Litwiler charged with Theft II, 
“cited in lieu of custody.” 

Mailboxes 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 24, 7:01 a.m., Edgewood Dr. & 
Vista Dr., “report of mailboxes open in 
neighborhood when RP was on a walk, 
UTL any suspects / officer respond, 
UTL any mail, confirmed boxes open.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 24, 3:06 p.m., “CCSO served 
valid NBPD warrant” on Daniel Allen 
Cowan charging Burglary II, Criminal 
Trespass II, & Unlawful Possession of 
Meth. 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CQPD log 
for Dec. 24, 5:26 p.m., 600 block No. 
Central Blvd., “criminal trespass,”31-
year old James Luis Quintana charged 
with Criminal Trespass II, “Quintana 
was cited in lieu of custody.” 

Theft 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 24, 7:40 a.m., 1300 block Da-
kota Ave., “theft from vehicle.” 

Mailboxes 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 24, 10:30 a.m., 100 block D St., 
“signs of several mailboxes entered, pile 
of mail located in front of location.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 25, 1:21 a.m., 1300 block Vir-
ginia Ave., “NBPD served valid CBPD 
warrant” on 22-year old Nicholas A. 
Campbell, Coos Bay, charging Theft II, 
“subject cited in lieu of custody due to 
COVID-19 issued” citation and warned 
for Trespass.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 25, 12:38 a.m., 1297 Ocean 
Blvd., Three Rivers Casino, “warrant 
service,” 38-year old Kermit Gaston 
arrested on CCSO warrant for Contempt 
of Court, “Gaston was cited in lieu of 
custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 25, 12:42 p.m., 900 block So. 
Broadway, “out with subject at Por-
ter’s,” Michael Emory Dunn arrested on 
three CBPD warrants charging Probation 
Violation on Unlawful Use Weapon, 
Felon in Possession Firearm; Indictment 
for Unlawful Possession Meth, Criminal 
Mischief II; Indictment for Criminal 
Mischief II; NBPD warrant for FTA 

Dangerous Drugs.  Cited in lieu of cus-
tody. 

UEMV 
According to an entry on the CQPD log 
for Dec. 25, 9:31 a.m., Fishtrap Rd. & 
Hwy. 42 Bridge, “suspicious vehicle,” 
21-year old Tristin Milo Fields charged 
with DWS Misdemeanor, Felon in Pos-
session of Restricted Weapon, UUV, 
Probation Violation, “Fields transported 
to CCJ.” 

Mail Theft 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 26, 9:22 a.m., 1500 block Iowa 
Ave., “located several pieces of mail.” 

Dispute 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 26, 1:39 p.m., 100 block Kruse 
Ave., “dispute,” 29-year old Brian Alan 
Sell charged with Domestic Harassment, 
Criminal Mischief II, Resisting Arrest, 
“Sell transported to CCJ.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 26, 5:01 p.m., 2051 Newmark 
Ave., Walmart, “criminal trespass,” 27-
year old Jacob Matthew Rhyner charged 
with Criminal Trespass II, “Rhyner cited 
in lieu of custody.” 

DUII 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 26, 7:33 p.m., 1600 block Mar-
garetta St., “result of request for subject 
to be trespassed,” 58-year old Carl Rob-
ert Gerisch charged with DUII, “cited in 
lieu of custody and released.” 

Elude 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 26, 11:17 p.m., Hwy. 101 & 
Bassett Hyland, “result of traffic stop,” 
34-year old Eundra Lewis Williams 
charged with Elude, Attempt to Elude on 
Foot & Reckless Driving, also CCSO 
warrant charging Contempt of Court, 
“cited in lieu of custody and released.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 27, 12:57 a.m., “Cottage Grove 
PD served valid NBPD warrant” on 51-
year old Michael R. Dean, Cottage 
Grove, charging Probation Violation on 
Possession of Meth. 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 27, 7:55 a.m., 1200 block New-
mark Ave., “follow up,” 30-year old 
Eithen Nordholm charged with Criminal 
Trespass II, “Nordholm was cited in lieu 
of custody.” 

UEMV 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 27, 1:41 p.m., 1600 block No. 
14th St., “unlawful entry into MV.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 27, 4:27 p.m., 101 NW A St., 
“warrant service by Grants Pass PD on 
CBPD warrant,” charging 54-year old 
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Bayside Coffee 
Charleston 

Small batch, fresh-roasted coffee for retail and 
mail order. Purchase coffee and loose leaf teas in 

our shop or from our website. 
 

www.baysidecoffeeshop.com 
63340 Boat Basin Rd, 

541 260-3742 

WINTER 
HOURS 7:00 

AM – 3:00 PM 



Donnie Wayne Snow charged with Theft 
II, “Snow cited in lieu of custody by 
Grants Pass PD.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 27, 11:57 p.m., 400 block 4th 
Ave., “suicidal subject,” 33-year old 
Joseph William Pace served Douglas 
Co. SO warrant charging Failure to Ap-
pear on DWS charge, “cited in lieu of 
custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 28, 2:55 p.m., “CBPD served 
NBPD valid warrant” on 24-year old 
Alejandra Salcedo-Lozeau, North Bend, 
charging Probation Violation on Theft I 
charge. 

Counterfeit 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 28, 3:41 p.m., 2400 block 

Tremont Ave., “report of counterfeit bill 
at location / officer respond and seized 
item.” 

Warrant Service 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 28, 5:41 a.m., “located wanted 
subject, by NBPD, on 2 CBPD war-
rants” charging 56-year old Joseph Allen 
Boyd with FT on DOC II, and FTA on 
Menacing & Criminal Trespassing II, 
“arrested by NBPD.” 

Attempted Burglary 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 28, 10:23 a.m., Central & 12th, 
Allysa Marie Wedrick charged with 
Criminal Mischief II and Attempted 
Burglary II, “cited in lieu of custody.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 28, 2:30 p.m., 2051 Newmark 
Ave., Walmart, “subject previously tres-
passed is in the store,” Alejandra 
Salcedo-Lozeau arrested on two CBPD 
warrants charging FTA on Theft II & 
Criminal Trespass & FTA II, also NBPD 
warrant for Probation Violation on Theft 
I, “cited in lieu of custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for Dec. 28, 4:13 p.m., 1400 block No. 
Bayshore Dr., “warrant service,” 34-year 
old Mathew Moore charged with Proba-
tion Violation & Contempt of Court, 
“Moore was cited in lieu of custody.” 

Counterfeit 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for Dec. 29, 12:44 p.m., 2400 block 
Tremont Ave., “seized 2 counterfeit bills 
at location.” 
 
 

Regional  
 

Fatal Shooting,  
Josephine Co. 

On Monday, December 14, 2020 at 6:52 
A.M., Josephine County Sheriff's Depu-
ties and Troopers responded to the report 
of a shooting at 200 Corporate way near 
Merlin in Josephine County. Upon arri-
val, Kurt Krauss (56), of Grants Pass, 
was found deceased on scene.  The in-
vestigation was turned over to the Jose-
phine County Major Crime Team. Ore-
gon State Police (OSP) is the lead inves-
tigating agency and is being assisted by 
the Josephine County Sheriff's Office, 
Grants Pass Department of Public Safe-
ty, and the Josephine County District 
Attorney's Office. The investigation is 
active and ongoing.  OSP is requesting 
anyone with information about the inci-
dent to contact the OSP Southern Com-
mand Center at 541-664-4600 or *OSP 
from a mobile device and reference OSP 
Case #SP20-347133. 
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Miller's at the Cove  
Sports Bar & Grill 

 

Oyster Cove Square  
63346 Boat Basin Road , Charleston, Oregon 97420  

(541) 808-2404    
OPEN DAILY AT 11 AM  - Child Friendly ‘til 9 p.m. 

 

 

DAILY SPECIALS:   
Hand-Dipped Fish & Chips; Fish Tacos; Hand-Pattied Burgers   

Free WI-FI access during business hours 
HAPPY HOUR 7 DAYS A WEEK FROM 4PM - 6PM 

 

 

www.millersatthecove.rocks 

People’s Choice 
Awards 

Winners  
‘Bite of the Bay’ 

“Best in Show” 
“Best Bite” 

Brookings 
801 Chetco 
(541) 469-5391 
 
Coquille 
484 N. Central 
(541) 396-3145 
 
Coos Bay 
579 S. Broadway 
(541) 267-3163 
 
North Bend 
3025 Broadway 
(541) 756-2091 
 
 

Reedsport 
174 N. 16th 
(541) 271-3601 
 
Florence 
4325 Hwy. 101, North 
(541) 997-7178 
 
Newport 
550 E. Olive St. 
(541) 265-6604 
 
Lincoln City 
1025 SW Hwy. 101 
(541) 994-3676 


