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Hwy. 101 Fatalities 
CCSO release - On 04-22-21 at about 
8:00 am, the Coos County Dispatch re-
ceived multiple reports of a red 
Mitsubishi eclipse bearing California 
license plate 4NDF245 being driven 
dangerously.  Reports indicated the vehi-
cle travelling in the Bandon area, and 
included unlawful u-turns on the high-
way, excessive speeds and near colli-
sions with other vehicles.  At about 8:17 
am, the vehicle was involved in a crash 
that tragically resulted in multiple fatali-
ties on Highway 101 near mile marker 
247.  The matter is under investigation 
by multiple agencies.  Anyone with in-
formation regarding the red Mitsubishi 
Eclipse, who saw the vehicle between 
the hours of 7:00 and 8:20 and in the 
areas of Langlois to the intersection of 
Highway 101 and Highway 42 is asked 
to call the Coos County Dispatch non-
emergency number at 541-396-2106.  
Please leave your name and a good con-
tact number for investigating officers to 
return your call for a brief interview.  
Additional information may help piece 
together the events leading up to the 
crash. 

Hwy. 101 Multiple  
Death Update 

CCSO release - On 04-22-21, starting at 
about 7:15 am, police began receiving 
reports in Port Orford of a red 
Mitsubishi Eclipse being driven by an 
adult male later identified as 32 year old 
Cory M Orsenico.   Over the following 

hour, Orsenico was reported multiple 
times for increasingly dangerous driv-
ing, including speeding, swerving in and 
out of lanes, passing on corners, making 
sudden u-turns, cutting off vehicles in-
cluding semi-trucks, speeding through 
the school zone in Bandon at over 60 
MPH and running red lights without 
slowing.  Police from several agencies 
were attempting to locate Orsenico, as 
he was endangering people with his 
reckless driving.  At mile marker 247 on 
Highway 101 (near the Belloni Boys 
ranch), officers from the Oregon State 

Police and Bandon Department located 
Orsenico.  Orsenico was north bound on 
the highway, and an OSP trooper south-
bound.  When the Trooper turned his 
vehicle to follow Orsenico, there was a 
minor collision before Orsenico again 
sped off, now heading south-bound.   
Investigating officers have reason to 
believe that Orsenico travelled from the 
slow lane of the three lane highway to 
the fast lane, then crossed the double 
yellow line before intentionally colliding 
with the a vehicle in the opposing lane, 
containing 54 year old Dawn Adams and 
78 year old Jeffrey Adams, both of Ban-
don.  All three involved people were 
declared deceased on scene. This matter 
is still under investigation by several 
agencies.  We have received calls with 
information regarding the red Eclipse, 
which has assisted in completing a time-
line of events leading to the tragic crash.  
Further information is requested; if you 
witnessed the red eclipse during this 
timeframe, please call 541-396-2106 and 
leave your name and a good contact 
number.  Helpful information would 
include any contact with Orsenico in the 
last three days, video footage of Orseni-
co or the red Mitsubishi Eclipse or any 
other witness information at any time.  
Orsenico was reportedly arrested on 
March 10th in Orick, CA for Exhibiting a 
Deadly Weapon other than a Firearm, 
Vandalism and Probation Violation.     

North Bend Male 
Charged with Sexually 

Exploiting a Minor 
PORTLAND, Ore.—Acting U.S. Attor-
ney Scott Erik Asphaug announced 
Tuesday, April 20 that a North Bend, 
Oregon, man has been charged with sex-
ually exploiting a minor female victim.  
On April 15, 2021, a federal grand jury 
in Eugene returned a three-count indict-
ment charging Shannon Stacey Weather-

bee, 47, with sexual exploitation of chil-
dren.  According to the indictment, be-
ginning around July 2017, Weatherbee is 
alleged to have knowingly coerced a 
minor female to engage in sexually ex-
plicit conduct for the purpose of produc-
ing a visual depiction of such conduct. 
These visual depictions were transmitted 
online.  On April 16, 2021, investigators 
arrested Weatherbee while executing a 
search warrant on his North Bend resi-
dence.  Weatherbee made his initial ap-
pearance in federal court today before a 
U.S. Magistrate Judge. He was ar-
raigned, pleaded not guilty, and ordered 
detained pending a jury trial scheduled 
to begin on June 22, 2021.  This case is 
being investigated by the FBI with assis-
tance from the North Bend Police De-
partment. It is being prosecuted by Jef-
frey S. Sweet, Assistant U.S. Attorney 
for the District of Oregon.  Anyone who 
has information about possible crimes 
committed by Weatherbee, or the physi-
cal or online exploitation of any chil-
dren, are encouraged to call the FBI at 
(503) 224-4181 or submit a tip online at 
tips.fbi.gov.  If a child discloses an inci-
dent that did happen to him or her, or 
that they observed happen to someone 
else, the parent should not ask the child 
detailed questions about the incident. 
Instead, please contact your local law 
enforcement agency or the FBI immedi-
ately.  This case was brought as part of 
Project Safe Childhood, a nationwide 
initiative launched in May 2006 by the 

Coos County Cops, May 2021, page 2 

Coos  County  
Cops 

is published by: 

Jarvis Communications  
POB 1454 Coos Bay, OR  97420.  

(541) 290-9365 
We welcome your advertising, 
comments, ideas, photos, Our 

deadline for next month’s 
publication is always the 20th.  

You can email:   
matthewjjarvis@yahoo.com 

Front Cover 
If you find something like 

this in the Forest, stay 
away.  It’s a pipe bomb.  

An OSP bomb squad 
from Southern Oregon 
responded to the Elliott 
State Forest to render 
this homemade device 
safe.  Story on Page 5. 

Vehicle involved in Hwy. 101 Fatalities south of Coos Bay. 

We Can Get 
You There 



Department of Justice to combat the 
growing epidemic of child sexual ex-
ploitation and abuse. For more infor-
mation about Project Safe Childhood, 
please visit www.justice.gov/psc.  An 
indictment is only an accusation of a 
crime, and a defendant is presumed in-
nocent unless and until proven guilty. 

Recovered Stolen  
Vehicle & Drug Arrest 

CBPD release - On 04/08/2021, at ap-
proximately 9:41a.m., the Coos Bay 
Police Department located a stolen vehi-
cle on Highway 42 near Central Avenue 
in Coquille. The Coos Bay Officer was 
leaving the Courthouse and returning to 
the City of Coos Bay when he observed 
the stolen vehicle pass by him. The sto-
len vehicle report was filed with the 
Coos Bay Police Department the day 
before.  The stolen vehicle was de-
scribed as a 2006 Mazda MZ3, blue in 
color with California license plates. The 
vehicle had been stolen out of the Em-
pire area in Coos Bay.  The Coos Bay 
Police Officer was able to stop the vehi-
cle and make contact with the male driv-
er and a female passenger, the male driv-
er was identified as 32-year-old Aaron 
Lott, of Coos Bay.  Subsequent to the 
investigation, a commercial amount of 
what is suspected to be (see photo to the 
left) methamphetamine, scales and pack-

aging materials were seized.  Lott was 
arrested and charged with Unlawful Pos-
session of Methamphetamine, Delivery 
of a Controlled Substance, two counts of 
Felon in Possession of a Restricted 
Weapon, Possession of a Stolen Vehicle, 
and a Probation Violation. 

Person Fatally Struck  
in Parking Lot 

CBPD release - On 04/20/2021, at 1024 
hours, the Coos Bay Police Department 
dispatch center received a 911 call re-
porting a vehicle struck a person in the 
public parking lot on the southeast side 
of the intersection at Commercial Ave. 
and N. 3rd St.  Medical personnel and 
law enforcement were dispatched to the 
scene.  Officers arrived on scene at ap-
proximately 1027 hours.  The victim, 20
-year-old Raven English, was pro-
nounced dead at the scene.  The driver of 
the vehicle remained on scene and coop-
erated with the investigation.  Witnesses 
told officers that English had been lay-
ing in the parking lot and had been en-
couraged to move a short time before the 
incident.  The driver of the vehicle said 
they had not seen English and drove 
over her.  The driver, who was trauma-
tized from the incident, was later trans-
ported to Bay Area Hospital.  The Coos 
County Crash Team was notified and 
representatives from the Oregon State 
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Police, Coquille Police Department, 
Coos County District Attorney’s Office, 
and the Coos County Medical Examin-
er’s Office responded to the scene to 
assist.  The crash was investigated by the 
Coos Bay Police Department.   

Vehicle versus  
Pedestrian Crash 

CBPD release - On 04/15/2021, at 1029 
hours, the Coos Bay Police Department 
dispatch center received a 911 call re-
porting a vehicle struck a pedestrian on 
Koos Bay Blvd. near Thompson Rd.  
Medical personnel and law enforcement 
were dispatched to the scene.  Officers 
arrived on scene at approximately 1034 
hours.  The pedestrian was evaluated by 
medical personnel was transported to 
Bay Area Hospital by Bay Cities Ambu-
lance.  The driver and passenger of the 
vehicle that struck the pedestrian re-
mained on scene and cooperated with 
the investigation.  The Coos County 
Crash Team was activated and represent-
atives from Oregon State Police, Coos 
County Sheriff’s Office, North Bend 
Police Department and the Coos County 
District Attorney’s Office responded to 

the scene to assist.    Mast Bros Towing 
Company arrived on scene to assist in 
the removal of the vehicle.  The crash is 
still under investigation and is being 
conducted by the Coos Bay Police De-
partment.   

NBPD report 
As provided to the North Bend City 
Council April 27, 2021 from City Ad-
ministrator David Milliron:  Responded 
to 594 calls for service for the two 
weeks ending April 22, 2021, which 
included:  22 criminal trespassing com-
plaints; Nine Department of Human Ser-
vices referrals (referral from D.H.S. to 
N.B.P.D. for alleged neglect/abuse of 
children); 22 disorderly conduct or dis-
turbance complaints; Two suicidal sub-
jects; Two assaults; One burglary; One 
death investigation; 20 mental health 
related calls; 78 reported suspicious per-
sons or vehicles; 20 welfare checks; 27 
warrants served; 15 driving complaints. 
 

 
Coos Co. 

 
Bandon Assault 

CCSO release - On April 5, 2021 at ap-
proximately 04:16 am, Coos County 
Deputies received a report from a female 
that her boyfriend, 67 year old Michael 
B. Currie of Bandon assaulted her in the 
home they shared.  Deputies responded 
to the scene and located the victim. She 
was seated in a car outside the residence 
wearing only a pair of pants, shoes, and 
a robe. She had obvious wounds and 
blood covering her face.  Mr. Currie was 
contacted and it was discovered he was 
under the influence of alcohol. The inci-
dent was investigated, and Mr. Currie 
was taken into custody. It was also dis-
covered Mr. Currie had a firearm in the 
house. There was an active stalking pro-
tective order against Mr. Currie, prohib-
iting him from owning any firearms.  
The exact situation that led to Mr. Currie 
possessing this firearm is still under in-
vestigation by the Coos County Sheriff’s 
Office. The gun was seized from the 
residence.  Mr. Currie was transported to 
the Coos County Jail where he was 

lodged on the charges of Assault IV 
(Domestic), Strangulation (Domestic), 
Menacing (Domestic), and Unlawful 
Possession of a Firearm.   

VRO Lakeside 
CCSO release - On April 6th, 2021, at 
approximately 01:08 AM, the Coos 
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County Sheriff’s Office received a report 
that 29 year old Nathaniel Savage was 
outside of a residence located on Rugh 
Lane in Lakeside. Deputies were noti-
fied that Nathaniel Savage had an active 
Restraining Order for one of the occu-
pants of the residence.  Deputies were 
able to arrest Nathaniel Savage without 
incident. Nathaniel was transported to 

the Coos County Jail, where he was 
booked and lodged on the charge of Vio-
lation of a Restraining Order. 

Assault Lakeside 
CCSO release - On Friday April 2, 2021, 
at about 6:56 am, the Coos County Sher-
iff’s Office responded to an assault on 
Devore Arm Road in Lakeside.  The 
victim had called Coos County Dispatch 

and reported her husband, Mr. Kevin 
Bradley White, who is 41 years of age 
had strangled and punched her while she 
was in her bed.  Upon the Deputies arri-
val, they found Kevin had assaulted and 
injured the caller in the presence of their 
minor child.  Kevin was transported to 
the Coos County Jail, where he was 
lodged on the charges of Assault 4 Do-

mestic in the Presences of a Minor Child 
and Domestic Strangulation. 

Explosive Device, Elliott 
State Forest 

CCSO release - On April 11, 2021, the 
Coos County Sheriff’s Office received a 
report of a possible explosive device 
near mile post 2 on the 4000 line into the 
Elliott State Forest. The caller was in the 

area recreating with family, when they 
located a device that resembled a pipe 
bomb.  Deputies were dispatched to the 
area and arrived at about 1230 hours. 
Deputies located the area and the device. 
The device appeared to be a live explo-
sive device. Deputies contacted Oregon 
State Police Explosive Unit and shared 
information and pictures of the device. 
The detectives from OSP Explosives 
Unit also believed the device to be a live 
explosive.  OSP Explosive Unit was 
dispatched to the area from Central 
Point. Deputies secured the area until 
they could arrive. OSP members arrived 
on scene at about 1630 hours. OSP Ex-
plosive Unit destroyed the explosive 
device and rendered the area safe.  The 
Coos County Sheriff’s Office would like 
to remind anyone finding a similar or 
suspicious device to leave it in place and 
call the police.  Improvised devices can 
be dangerous to move and come in many 
different shapes and sizes. 

Assault Charge, Bandon 
CCSO release - On Saturday April 10, 
2021, at about 10:54 AM, Coos County 
Dispatch received a report of an assault, 
at 56568 Christopher Road in Bandon. 
The caller reported that 40 year old Josh-
ua Dylan Rice was on drugs and had hit 
her with a club or a stick. Due to Depu-
ties being out of the area, the Coos 
County Sheriff’s Office requested assis-
tance from the Bandon Police Depart-
ment.  Upon the Bandon Police Depart-
ment's arrival, The Officer observed a 
male with a large stick run into the 
woods near the residence.  Deputies ar-
rived and spoke with the Caller, who did 
have injuries and stated she had been hit 
with a large hardwood stick.  A K-9 was 
requested to track the suspect.  K-9 Ra-
ven and Deputy Boswell arrived and 
started tracking Joshua. After a consider-

able distance, Joshua was located back 
on Christopher Road, near the residence. 
After a short foot pursuit and an alterca-
tion with Raven and Deputy Boswell, 
Joshua was taken into custody.  Joshua 
was transported to the Hospital and then 
to the Coos County Jail, where he was 
booked into the jail on the charges of 
Assault 2 Domestic, Unlawful Use of a 
Weapon, Resisting Arrest and Interfer-
ing with a Law-enforcement Animal. 

Stolen Vehicle & Meth 
CCSO release - On April 12, 2021 at 
approximately 10:46 pm, two Coos 
County Sheriff’s Office Reserve Depu-
ties working patrol in the Barview area 
initiated a traffic stop on a vehicle on 
Wallace Road near Robinson Lane.  
During the course of the traffic stop, the 
involved vehicle was found to be a vehi-
cle reported stolen from Coos Bay.  The 
operator of the vehicle, Jerad Slagle was 
in possession of a criminal amount of 
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suspected methamphetamine as well as 
over $800 in US Currency.  The suspect-
ed methamphetamine and US Currency 
were seized and Slagle was referred to 
the District Attorney’s Office for Unlaw-
ful Use of a Motor Vehicle, and Crimi-
nal Unlawful Possession of Metham-
phetamine. 

Hwy. 241 Fatal, Coos 
River Hwy. 

OSP release - On Monday, March 29, 
2021 at approximately 4:00 P.M., Ore-
gon State Police Troopers and emergen-
cy personnel responded to Hwy 241 
(Coos River Hwy) near milepost 11 for 
signs a vehicle had left Hwy 241 and 
entered the river.  Emergency personnel 
located a Chevrolet Camaro submerged 
in the river.  Darious Oaks (72) of Coos 
Bay was located inside the vehicle de-
ceased.  He had been reported missing 
on March 26, 2021.  OSP was assisted 
by the Bandon Fire Department Dive 
Team, Millington Fire Department, and 
ODOT. 

 
Oregon Coast 

 
Central Coast Felon 
Sentenced to Prison 

over Meth 
EUGENE, Ore.—A Lincoln City, Ore-
gon man with multiple felony convic-
tions was sentenced to federal prison 
today for distributing methamphetamine 
in and around Lincoln City, announced 
Acting U.S. Attorney Scott Erik As-
phaug.  Jerad Joseph White, 39, was 
sentenced to 100 months in federal pris-
on and 5 years’ supervised release.  Ac-
cording to court documents, on March 
12, 2018, White and an accomplice, Pa-
tricia Rose Hendrick, 25, of Lincoln 
City, Oregon, arrived in a vehicle to the 
parking lot of the Lincoln City Outlets. 
As had been previously arranged, White 
sold three ounces of methamphetamine 
to an undercover agent for $900.  On 
December 12, 2018, a federal grand jury 
in Eugene returned a two-count indict-
ment charging White and Hedrick with 
conspiring to possess with intent to dis-
tribute methamphetamine and posses-
sion with intent to distribute metham-
phetamine.  By December 2020, White 
and Hendrick had both pleaded guilty to 
possession with intent to distribute 
methamphetamine. On October 29, 
2020, Hendrick was sentenced to time 
served in prison and five years’ super-
vised release.  This case was investigat-
ed by the Bureau of Alcohol, Tobacco, 
Firearms, and Explosives; the Lincoln 
City Police Department; and the Tilla-
mook County Sheriff’s Office. It was 
prosecuted by Nathan J. Lichvarcik, 
Assistant U.S. Attorney for the District 

of Oregon.  This case was brought as 
part of Project Safe Neighborhoods 
(PSN). PSN is the centerpiece of the 
Department of Justice’s violent crime 
reduction efforts. PSN is an evidence-
based program proven to be effective at 
reducing violent crime. Through PSN, a 
broad spectrum of stakeholders work 
together to identify the most pressing 
violent crime problems in the communi-
ty and develop comprehensive solutions 
to address them. As part of this strategy, 
PSN focuses enforcement efforts on the 
most violent offenders and partners with 
locally based prevention and reentry 
programs for lasting reductions in crime. 

Hwy. 101 Fatal,  
Tillamook Co. 

On Saturday, April 17, 2021 at approxi-
mately 11:51 P.M., Oregon State Police 
Troopers and emergency personnel re-
sponded to the report of a pedestrian that 
had been struck on Hwy 101 near mile 
post Z49.  Preliminary investigation re-
vealed a pedestrian, Quinten Hoptowit 
(23) of Warm Springs, was laying in the 
roadway when he was struck by 
a northbound vehicle.  The vehicle de-
scribed as a dark color crew cab pickup 
with a short box, open bed, and inopera-
tive passenger side tail light - left the 
scene.  Hoptowit sustained fatal injuries 
and was pronounced deceased.  OSP 
was assisted by Tillamook County Sher-

iff’s Office, Rockaway Beach Fire De-
partment, Rockaway Beach Police De-
partment and ODOT. 

 
USCG 

 
Oregon Coast Guard 
cutter returns home  
following Eastern  

Pacific law  
enforcement patrol 

USCG release - ASTORIA, Ore. — The 
Coast Guard Cutter Alert (WMEC 630) 
returned home to Astoria Wednesday, 
April 7 following a 63-day counterdrug 
patrol in the Eastern Pacific Ocean. 
Working in conjunction with different 
Coast Guard and Mexican law enforce-
ment agencies, Alert’s crew’s disrupted 
more than 2,100 pounds of cocaine, val-
ued at over $41 million wholesale, from 
entering the United States.  The Oregon-
based cutter and crew patrolled interna-
tional waters off the coast of Mexico and 
the United States-Mexico Maritime 
Boundary Line, enforcing international 
laws and treaties throughout their de-
ployment and disrupting the flow of ille-
gal narcotics and migrant smuggling.  
While on patrol, a maritime patrol air-

craft spotted a suspected smuggling ves-
sel. Alert’s crews launched both cutter 
small boats and pursued the vessel until 
it ran out of fuel. The case was trans-
ferred to Mexican law enforcement offi-
cials from the Secretaría de Marina 
(SEMAR).  Through the collaborative 
and international team effort, the smug-
glers were successfully apprehended, 
and 1,600 pounds of illegal narcotics 
seized by Mexican Law Enforcement.  
Within 48 hours, Alert’s crew identified 
another law enforcement case for inter-
diction and changed course to intercept 
the suspected smuggling vessel. After a 
multi-hour pursuit, the crew successfully 
interdicted approximately 550 pounds of 
cocaine and apprehended six suspected 
narco-traffickers for prosecution in the 
United States.  Numerous U.S. agencies 
from the Departments of Defense, Jus-
tice and Homeland Security cooperated 
in the effort to combat transnational or-
ganized crime. The Coast Guard, Navy, 
Customs and Border Protection, FBI, 
Drug Enforcement Administration, and 
Immigration and Customs Enforcement, 
along with allied and international part-
ner agencies, play a role in counter-drug 
operations.  Alert’s crew transferred the 
seized narcotics and suspected drug traf-
fickers to the Department of Justice, via 
Coast Guard Station San Diego March 1 
before steaming north to complete their 
three-week Tailored Ship Training As-
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sessment (TSTA), a bi-annual assess-
ment designed to evaluate the cutter’s 
training teams and operational readiness.  
“Once again, the crew of Alert was able 
to overcome the challenges of the 
COVID-19 pandemic and equipment 
failures on a 50 year old ship to execute 
a wide range of Coast Guard missions 
from the US-Canada Border to the Mex-
ico-Guatemala border over a two month 
period,” said Cmdr. Tyson Scofield, 
Alert’s commanding officer. “Overall, 
Coast Guard Cutter Alert successfully 
completed a variety of operations 
through the combined effort of every 

member of the crew.”  While patrolling 
the Eastern Pacific, Alert’s watchstand-
ers identified a sea turtle entangled in 
fishing debris. The cutter maneuvered 
into position and launched its small boat 
to help the endangered sea animal, ulti-
mately setting the sea turtle free from the 
entwined debris. Marine environmental 
protection is a statutory mission of the 
Coast Guard and every year approxi-
mately 300 sea turtles are saved by the 
Coast Guard.  “Marine life has always 
had a special place in my heart. When 
the opportunity to save a turtle arose, I 
was beyond excited to help,” said Petty 

Officer Third Class Timothy Waters 
who was aboard the small board to help 
free the entangled sea turtle. “I am hon-
ored to have done something so small 
that contributes to something much larg-
er than me.” 

USCG Assists with  
Meth Bust 

SEATTLE — The Coast Guard assisted 
U.S. Customs and Border Protection 
agents with the seizure of a significant 
amount of methamphetamine west of 
Port Angeles during a joint interagency 
operation.  After receiving information 
that suspicious bags were observed near 
the beach on Apr. 11, a Border Patrol 
agent arrived and deployed his K-9 part-
ner. The Border Patrol K-9 led the agent 
to multiple bags and alerted to the pres-
ence of narcotics. The bags contained 
342 pounds of methamphetamine worth 
nearly $1.7 million.  Agents seized the 
contraband and further coordinated with 
all partner agencies such as the U.S. 
Coast Guard, Homeland Security Inves-
tigations, the Olympic Peninsula Narcot-
ics Enforcement Team, the Federal Bu-
reau of Investigation, CBP’s Air and 
Marine Operations, Clallam County 
Sheriff’s Office, and the Royal Canadian 
Mounted Police.  “This seizure high-
lights the great work the United States 
Border Patrol conducts with its U.S. and 
Canadian law enforcement partners.” 
said Chief Patrol Agent David S. BeMil-
ler.  “Trans-national criminal organiza-
tions capitalizing on this vulnerable area 
by smuggling narcotics are a danger to 
the community.  By focusing on border 
security, we are enhancing national se-
curity.”  Coast Guard assets and crews 
that contributed to the effort were:  

Coast Guard Sector Puget Sound; Coast 
Guard Cutter Blue Shark crew; Coast 
Guard Cutter Adelie crew; Coast Guard 
Station Port Angeles boatcrews; Coast 
Guard Air Station Port Angeles air-
crews.  "I am incredibly proud of our 
United States Coast Guard team working 
in conjunction with both our U.S. and 
Canadian law enforcement partners to 
secure the maritime border,” said Rear 
Adm. Anthony Vogt, commander, 13th 
Coast Guard District. “The operations of 
trans-national criminal organizations are 
on-going regardless of the COVID pan-
demic. The women and men of the Unit-
ed States Coast Guard will continue to 
protect the communities we serve and 
disrupt these illegal activities taking 
place in the maritime domain.”  

 
Douglas Co. 

 
DUII Crash Douglas Co. 

DILLARD, Ore. - A Roseburg man was 
cited Tuesday night following an injury 
DUII accident in Dillard.   On March 30, 
2021, at 9:20 pm, 9-1-1 dispatchers be-
gan receiving reports of a single vehicle 
crash in the 9000-block of Old Highway 
99 South near Dillard. When deputies 
arrived on scene, they found a 2007 
Toyota Tacoma in a ditch. The driver, 35 
year-old Jesse Lee Gardner of Roseburg, 
had been traveling south on Old High-
way 99, when he drifted off of the road-
way and into a ditch coming to rest 
against a culvert.  Fire and EMS crews 
extricated a female passenger, 46 year-
old Amber Taylor of Eugene, from the 
pickup and transported her to Mercy 
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Medical Center where she was evaluated 
for her serious injuries. Gardner was also 
transported to Mercy Medical Center by 
ambulance where he was treated. Depu-
ties conducted a follow up investigation 
and arrested Gardner for Driving Under 
the Influence of Intoxicants, Reckless 
Driving, Reckless Endangering and As-
sault. Due to his injuries and condition, 
deputies cited and released Gardner at 
the hospital. 

Meth Arrest,  
Douglas Co. 

On April 6th, 2021, detectives with the 
Douglas Interagency Narcotics Team 
(DINT) arrested 60 year old Robert Paul 
Muniain of Oakdale, California, for drug 
crimes related to large quantities of 
methamphetamine.  DINT detectives 
were following Muniain as part of an 

ongoing drug investigation, and with the 
help of the Douglas County Sheriff's 
Office, attempted a traffic stop on Mu-
niain as he was driving Northbound on I
-5 near Myrtle Creek.  Muniain slowed, 
but refused to stop initially, exiting the 
freeway in Myrtle Creek.  Muniain con-
tinued, traveling into the city of Myrtle 
Creek and as he was crossing the bridge 
over the South Umpqua River he threw a 
bag out of the vehicle window into the 
river below.  After throwing the item out 

the window Muniain complied and 
stopped the vehicle.  A DINT detective, 
fearing Muniain had thrown drugs into 
the river, scrambled down the river bank 
and saw the bag floating down the riv-
er.  The detective dove into the water 

and swam to the bag which was still 
floating when he got to it.  He retrieved 
the bag and continued swimming to the 
opposite side of the river.  The bag con-
tained approximately 472 grams 
of methamphetamine, which is more 
than 1 pound.  That is a very large 
amount of methamphetamine which is 
not a personal use amount.  For context, 
the typical addict would use only ap-
proximately one gram per day, on aver-
age.  The detective emerged very wet 
and cold, but otherwise unin-
jured.  Muniain was arrested and lodged 
at the Douglas County Jail on charges of 
Unlawful Possession and Unlawful De-
livery of Methamphetamine.  The inves-
tigation is continuing and more charges 
are pending. 

Gardiner FEMA Site 
A female who reportedly showed up at 
the gate to the old Gardiner Mill Site 

with a gun prompted the Federal Emer-
gency Management Agency (FEMA) to 
hold a news conference Friday to ex-
plain what is going on at the location 
with the news trailer being brought in 
and uniformed security at each entrance.  

Lots of speculation by the residents of 
the small unincorporated community in 
Western Douglas County led to rumors 
and the concern by the woman who de-
cided to investigate on her own.  Toney 
Raines, an Emergency Management 
Program Specialist with FEMA, says 
they are opening up a new staging area 
for individuals and families displaced by 
last Summer’s wildfires.  Grey single-
wide trailers have been brought into the 
abandoned site and placed in groups 
around the property.  The Gardiner site 
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reportedly replaces a similar location at 
the Jackson County Expo Center at Cen-
tral Point north of Medford.   

Douglas Co. SO Line of 
Duty Death 

DOUGLAS COUNTY, Ore. - Sheriff 
John Hanlin is saddened to announce the 
line-of-duty death of retired Deputy 
Stanley "Allen" Burdic from duty-
related wounds suffered in 1980.  In 
October 1976, Allen Burdic was hired 

by the Canyonville Police Department 
where he served until July 1979 when he 
accepted a Deputy Sheriff position with 
the Douglas County Sheriff's Office.  On 
August 12, 1980, Deputy Burdic re-
sponded to a reported shooting at the 
Nutshell Tavern in Myrtle Creek. Some-
time in the early morning hours of Au-
gust 13, Deputy Burdic located the sus-
pect at a gravel turnout north of the Myr-
tle Creek Bridge near Interstate 5. The 
suspect opened fire on Deputy Burdic, 
striking him twice. The suspect then 
stole the deputy’s patrol car. As the sus-
pect left in the stolen patrol car, he ran 
over Deputy Burdic’s legs.  Deputy Bur-
dic sustained serious injuries from the 
gunshot wounds, which prevented his 
return to his position as a deputy. He 
medically retired from the Sheriff's Of-
fice in 1982.  He briefly returned to the 
Canyonville Police Department as a Po-
lice Officer from July 1984 to November 
1985.  Deputy Burdic passed away at his 

home on March 11, 2021 from compli-
cations of the injuries he sustained in the 
line of duty working for the Douglas 
County Sheriff's Office in 1980.  
"Deputy Burdic's sacrifice while in ser-
vice to the citizens of Douglas County, 
no matter the span of time between the 
shooting and his death, cannot go un-
mentioned. We will honor him, his fami-
ly and his memory and never forget what 
happened to this deputy on August 13, 
1980," Sheriff Hanlin said.  Deputy Bur-
dic's memorial service is scheduled for 
Saturday, April 17, 2021, at 2:00 p.m. at 
the Tri-City Baptist Church. Deputy 
Burdic will be afforded law enforcement 
honors at the service.  Deputy Burdic's 
Family and the Douglas County Sheriff's 
Office are being assisted by the Oregon 
Fallen Badge Foundation. Anyone wish-
ing to make financial contributions to 
support the Burdic family may do so 
through the Oregon Fallen Badge Foun-
dation. 

Winston Fatal 
WINSTON, Ore. - On Tuesday, April 
13, 2021, shortly before 11:30 pm, 9-1-1 
dispatchers received a report of a single 
vehicle crash in the 5000-block of Willis 
Creek Road in Winston.  When deputies 
arrived, they located a 1990's pickup 
which had been traveling northeast be-
fore leaving the roadway and striking a 
tree in a small ravine. The vehicle be-
came engulfed in flames which also 
started a small grass fire. Deputies locat-
ed one occupant inside of the vehicle, 
who was declared deceased at the scene. 
Speed is believed to be a contributing 
factor in the crash.  The Douglas County 
Medical Examiner's Office is investigat-
ing the death and attempting to positive-
ly identify the occupant. Next of kin 
notification is pending. 

Sex Crime Charge 
Douglas Co. 

MYRTLE CREEK, OR - A Myrtle 
Creek man is in custody on sex abuse 
charges following an investigation.  On 

Monday, April 5, 2021, deputies were 
dispatched to a juvenile female reporting 
sex abuse which occurred in Douglas 
County. Detectives took over the investi-
gation. On April 20, 2021, the suspect, 
50 year-old Floyd Donald Jenkins of 
Myrtle Creek was arrested. He was 
lodged at the Douglas County Jail on the 
following charges:  Sex Abuse I; Sex 
Abuse III.  The juvenile was known to 
Jenkins. 

Douglas Co. Fatality 
ROSEBURG, Ore. - A three vehicle 
crash Monday evening March 29 
claimed the life of a Roseburg man.  At 

4:49 p.m., 911 dispatchers began receiv-
ing reports of a three vehicle crash in the 
3100 block of Highway 99 South near 
the Green District. Deputies arrived on 
scene and learned a 1997 Ford Crown 
Victoria, driven by an adult male, had 
been traveling north on Highway 
99 when it drifted into the oncoming 
lane and sideswiped a southbound 2007 
Saturn driven by 72 year-old Colleen 
Bendan of Winston, before colliding 
head-on with a 2021 Jeep Renegade op-
erated by 65 year-old William Metcalf 
of Roseburg.  The male driver, a Rose-
burg resident, of the Ford Crown Victo-
ria, whose name is being withheld pend-
ing next of kin notification, was pro-
nounced deceased at the scene. A pas-
senger in the Ford Crown Victoria, 31 
year-old Winston resident Elizabeth Ann 
Calvillo-Hawelu, was transported to 
Mercy Medical Center by ambulance. 
Metcalf was also transported by ambu-
lance to the hospital with non-life threat-
ening injuries. Bendan sought medical 
attention at the hospital by private vehi-
cle.  The roadway was closed in all di-
rection for approximately 2.5 
hours.  **UPDATE 03/30/2021 11:45 
AM** ROSEBURG, Ore. - The Doug-
las County Medical Examiner's Office 
has identified the deceased driver of the 
fatal vehicle crash Monday night south 
of Roseburg.  The driver of the Ford 
Crown Victoria has been identified as 43 
year-old Roseburg resident Kyle Allen 
Northern. Northern was pronounced 
deceased at the scene.  Next of kin has 
been notified.  

Douglas Co. Pursuit 
ROSEBURG, Ore. - A short vehicle 
pursuit Wednesday afternoon landed two 
in the Douglas County Jail.  On Wednes-
day, April 29, 2021, around 1:00 PM, a 
deputy attempted to stop a stolen 2020 
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Nissan Altima sedan in the area of Ma-
ple Street in Roseburg. The driver of the 

stolen vehicle stopped momentarily be-
fore driving away from the traffic stop. 

The deputy pursued the vehicle to the 
area of Goedeck Avenue and Old Mel-
rose Road where a passenger side tire 
failed and the vehicle came to a stop.  
The driver, 35 year-old Nicole Megan 
Yates of Roseburg, and her passenger, 
32 year-old Scott Ryan Hadley of Rose-
burg were taken into custody and lodged 
at the Douglas County Jail.  Yates was 
charged with Attempting to Elude Police 
- Vehicle, Reckless Driving, Reckless 
Endangering, Possession of a Stolen 
Vehicle and Unlawful Use of a Motor 
Vehicle.  Hadley was charged with Pos-
session of a Stolen Vehicle. He was also 
cited and released for possession of a 
violation amount of methamphetamine.  

 
Police Logs 

 
Warrant 

According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for March 29, 250 No. Baxter St., Co-

quille, CCSO, “warrant service,” 36-year 
old Richard Joseph Moniz charged with 
Theft II, “arrested by CCSO on Coos 
Bay PD warrant.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for March 29, 10:22 a.m., 29821 El-
lensburg Ave., Gold Beach, Curry Co. 
SO, “warrant service,” 32-year old Joel 
Charles Jones charged with six-counts 
Identity Theft, Unlawful Possession of 
Methamphetamine, Unauthorized Use of 
Vehicle, Attempt to Elude Police-
Felony, Attempt to Elude Police-
Misdemeanor, Reckless Driving & 
Recklessly Endanger Another Person.  
“Arrested by Curry County SO on Coos 
Bay PD warrant.” 

Burglary 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for March 29, 1:36 p.m., 1400 block 
Newmark Ave., “burglary.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for March 29, 3:25 p.m., 200 block No. 
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Broadway, “criminal trespass,” 73-year 
old Roy Ralph Fernandez charged with 
Criminal Trespass II, “Fernandez cited 
in lieu of custody.” 

UEMV 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for March 30, 2:40 p.m., 1313 No. 
Bayshore Dr., Red Lion, “unlawful entry 
into MV.” 

Illegal Camping 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for March 30, 3:30 p.m., 3400 block 
Lindberg Ave, “illegal camping,” 56-
year old Donald Lee Woodring charged 
with Parole Violation on Possession of 
Methamphetamine, “cited in lieu of cus-
tody.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for March 30, 6:30 p.m., 2051 Newmark 
Ave., Walmart, “criminal trespass,” 48-
year old Deanna Faye Solinger charged 
with Harassment & Criminal Trespass 
II, “Solinger cited in lieu of custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for March 30, 9:17 p.m., 680 Fir Ave., 
Douglas Co. SO, Roseburg, “warrant 
service by Douglas Co. SO on CBPD 
warrant” charging 46-year old Clarice 
Renee White with FTA on Resisting 
Arrest & Disorderly Conduct II, “White 
cited in lieu of custody.” 

DUII 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 

for March 31, 9:04 a.m., Wasson & 
Newmark, “result of traffic stop,” 33-
year old Jesse Lee Cantrell charged with 
DUII, “Cantrell cited in lieu of custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for March 31, 0:04 a.m., Wasson & 
Newmark, “result of traffic stop,” 41-
year old Jennifer Lynn Bradley arrested 
on CCSO warrant charging Parole Vio-
lation on Unlawful Possession of Meth, 
“Bradley (aka Griswold) cited in lieu of 
custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for March 31, 10:09 a.m., 1111 SW 2nd 
Ave., Portland PD, “Portland Police out 
with wanted subject,” 30-year old Ste-
ven Michael Tooke arrested on CBPD 
warrant charging Criminal Trespass I. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for March 31, 11:49 a.m., 50 E. Central 
Ave., 38-year old Michael Emory Dunn 
arrested on CBPD warrants charging 
FTA on Criminal Mischief II, FTA on 
PCS Meth, Criminal Mischief II, Proba-
tion Violation on Unlawful Use Weapon 
and Felon in Possession of Firearm, and 
five-counts of Criminal Mischief II, 
“Dunn cited in lieu of custody.” 

UEMV 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for March 31, 6:34 p.m., 2nd & Market, 
“unlawful entry into MV.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for March 31, 10:36 p.m., 100 block No. 
Schoneman, “criminal trespass,” 23-year 
old Caleb Charles Moffett charged with 
Probation Violation on Possession of 
Meth charge, “cited in lieu of custody.” 

Suspicious 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for March 31, 11:21 p.m., 100 block No. 
Schoneman, “suspicious circumstances 
at location,” 23-year old Caleb Charles 
Moffett charged with Criminal Trespass 
II at the Empire Car Wash, “cited in lieu 
of custody.”  And, 39-year old Melissa 
Louanne Lucas charged with Criminal 
Trespass at the Empire Car Wash, “cited 
in lieu of custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 1, 1:09 a.m., E. Anderson & 
So. Bayshore, “out at location with sub-
jects in pavilion,” 36-year old Jeremy 
Michael Alexander arrested on three 
Grants Pass PD warrants charging FTA 
on two-counts of Theft I, FTA on Crimi-
nal Mischief II, & FTA on Escape III, 
“cited in lieu of custody.” 

UEMV 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 1, 9:03 a.m., 200 block So. 
Broadway, “vehicle broken into and 
tools taken.” 

Burglary 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 1, 9:14 a.m., 1400 block Ven-
tana Ct., “park manager found door 
kicked in at residence.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 1, 1:23 p.m., 100 block Nor-
man Ave., “warrant service,” 53-year 
old Peter Paul Miley arrested on CBPD 
warrant charging Unlawful Sexual Pene-
tration in the First Degree and Sex 
Abuse in the First Degree, “Miley 
lodged at CCJ.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 2, 7:17 a.m., 1001 N. Bayshore 
Dr., Super 8, “result of disorderly sub-
ject,” 48-year old Deanna F. Solinger 
charged with Criminal Trespass II, 
“cited in lieu of custody and released” 

Shoplifter 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 2, 4:57 p.m., 1020 So. 1st St., 
Fred Meyer, “shoplifter,” 58-year old 
Norman L. Kohl charged with Theft III, 
“cited in lieu of custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 2, 11:02 p.m., 300 block So. 
Broadway, “out on foot,” 39-year old 
Joshua Michael Buster Mote arrested on 
CBPD warrant charging FTA on Resist-
ing Arrest, Interfering with Peace/Parole 
& Probation Officer & Harassment, 
“Mote cited in lieu of custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 3, 1:14 p.m., 1100 block New-
mark Ave., “warrant service as result of 
traffic stop,” 31-year old Caleb Robert 
Anderson arrested on Douglas Co. SO 
warrant charging FTA on Strangulation, 
“cited in lieu of custody and released.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 3, 2:09 p.m., 1020 So. 1st St., 
Fred Meyer, “criminal trespass,” 31-year 

old Britny Lynn Seratt charged with 
Theft III, “Seratt cited in lieu of custo-
dy.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 3, 4:47 p.m., 1020 So. 1st St., 
Fred Meyer, “criminal trespass,” 41-year 
old Kelly M. Bolger and 41-year old 
Jacob M. Baumgardnder, both charged 
with Criminal Trespass, “both cited in 
lieu of custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CQPD log 
for April 3, 2:25 a.m., Hwy. 42, mp 9, 
“warrant service by CQPD on Douglas 
Co. SO warrant” on 37-year old Fred 
Jonathan Smalley charging FTA on 
Traffic Offense, additionally charged 
with DWS, “Smalley cited in lieu of 
custody.” 

Burglary 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 4, 10:02 a.m., 200 block No. 
Broadway, “burglary.” 

Arrest 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 5, 6:56 a.m., 1000 block No. 
Front St., “out with one – follow up,” 39
-year old William Leon Nasworthy 
charged with Assault II & Reckless En-
dangering, “transported to CCJ.” 

Indecent 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 5, 6:56 a.m., 500 Central Ave., 
“subject urinating in front of City Hall.”  
At 1:22 p.m., Lindberg & 35th, 
“urinating in public.” 

Burglary 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 5, 10:11 a.m., 600 block No. 
Broadway, “building entered and item 
taken.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 6, 1:04 a.m., “Brookings PD 
out with subject we have warrant for,” 
38-year old Ryan David Lile arrested on 
CBPD warrant charging Theft II, “cited 
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in lieu of custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 6, 1:37 a.m., 101 W. 5th Ave., 
Lane Co. Jail, Eugene, “received info 
subject lodged at location, we hold war-
rant for,” 40-year old Allyson Daun 
Thompson arrested on CBPD warrant 
charging Giving False Info to Peace Of-
ficer for Citation or Arrest on a Warrant, 
Theft II & Theft III. 

Assault 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 6, 6:04 a.m., 700 block 9th 
Ave., “vehicle off the road behind the 
Pepsi Plant,” 34-year old David Orr 
charged with Assault IV Domestic, 
Strangulation and Reckless Endanger-
ing. 

Burglary 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 6, 8:26 a.m., 100 block Inger-
soll Ave., “reporting mushroom buying 
business was entered and possible prod-

uct taken.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 6, 12:40 p.m., 1100 block So. 
1st St., “subject at location being disrup-
tive,” 43-year old Meagan Nicole Harper 
arrested on CCSO warrant charging 
Contempt of Court – VRO, “cited in lieu 
of custody.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 6, 1:28 p.m., 2051 Newmark 
Ave., Walmart, “subject previously tres-
passed at location causing problems,” 48
-year old Deanna Solinger charged with 
Criminal Trespass II, Attempted Assault 
on Police Officer and Probation Viola-
tion, “transported to CCJ.” 

UEMV 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 6, 9:10 p.m., 1700 block 
Thompson Rd., “unlawful entry into 
MV.” 

DWS 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 6, 10:20 p.m., 1000 block No. 
Bayshore Dr., “from traffic stop,” 30-
year old Darren Emil Carlson Jr. charged 
with DWS Misdemeanor, “cited in lieu 
of custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CQPD log 
for April 7, 9:22 a.m., 900 block E. 5th 
St., “disturbance,” 43-year old John Wil-
liam Crawford arrested on Marion Co. 
SO warrant charging FTA on UUMV & 
Possession of Meth.  “Cited in lieu of 
custody.” 

Package Theft 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 7, 7:21 a.m., 1100 block Elrod 
Ave., “theft of package.” 

Shoplifter 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 7, 9:53 a.m., 1020 So. 1st St., 
Fred Meyer, “shoplifter in custody,” 71-
year old Janet Medrano charged with 
Theft II, “cited in lieu of custody.” 

DWS 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 7, 11:02 a.m., Newmark & 
Chester, “traffic stop resulting in arrest,” 
36-year old Douglas Huntley charged 
with DWS-Misdemeanor, “cited in lieu 
of custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 7, 4:20 p.m., 200 block Hol-
land St., “warrant service,” 22-year old 
Aubry William Jones arrested on Curry 
Co. SO warrants charging Probation 
Violation on Menacing & Criminal Mis-
chief II, PV on Assault IV & Harass-
ment, & PV on Criminal Trespass I, 
“cited in lieu of custody.” 

Arrest 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 7, 6:02 p.m., 500 block W. 

Anderson, “possible theft suspect,” 33-
year old Thomas J. Phillips charged with 
Mail Theft, Theft I & Theft II, “cited in 
lieu of custody.” 

Dispute 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 8, 2:20 p.m., 1445 No. 
Bayshore Dr. Motel 6, “result of dis-
pute,” 19-year old Autumn L. Yar-
brough charged with MIP-Consumption, 
“released on citation.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 8, 4:19 a.m., 787 W. 8th St., 
Medford, “located wanted subject by 
Jackson Co. SO on CBPD warrant” 
charging 69-year old Stephen Alan 
Branton with FTA on Criminal Trespass 
I X2 and Theft II.  “Arrested by Jackson 
Co. SO.” 

Burglary 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 8, 6:44 a.m., 972 Ingersoll 
Ave., Marshfield HS, “burglary/criminal 
mischief.” 

Recovered Stolen Vehi-
cle 

According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 8, 9:41 a.m., Hwy. 42 & Cen-
tral, “traffic stop,” 32-year old Aaron C. 
Lott, charged with Probation Violation, 
“transported to Reedsport Jail.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 9, 2:04 a.m., 1000 block New-
mark Ave., “result of trespass at busi-
ness,” 23-year old Caleb Charles Moffett 
charged with Criminal Trespass II x2, 
“cited in lieu of custody and released.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 9, 9:15 a.m., Salmon & 
Woodridge, “out with trailer at loca-
tion,” 47-year old Dale Edward Malin Jr. 
arrested on Oregon State Parole Board 
warrant charging Parole Violation, 
“transported to CCJ.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 9, 11:36 a.m., 1700 block 
Thompson Rd., “subject wanting to talk 

to officer, upset she is being transported 
to hospital by family,” 44-year old Merli 
Flores Bell arrested on CBPD warrant 
charging FTA on two-counts Improper 
Use of Emergency Reporting System, 
“cited in lieu of custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 9, 2:47 p.m., So. 1st St. & Elrod 
Ave., “possibly out with wanted sub-
ject,” 60-year old Robert Dean Balch 
arrested on two NBPD warrant charging 
FTA on Criminal Trespass and FTA on 
Criminal Cite, “cited in lieu of custody.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 9, 4:57 p.m., 1020 So. 1st St. 
Fred Meyer, “criminal trespass,” 36-year 
old Vanessa Lee Evans charged with 
Unlawful Possession of Meth & Theft II. 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 9, 5:52 p.m., 400 block So. 4th 
St., “criminal trespass,” 29-year old Ma-
thue Lee Trent Meighan charged with 
Criminal Trespass II. 

VRO 
According to an entry on the CQPD log 
for April 9, 6:16 p.m., 600 block E. 8th 
St., 37-year old Nicholas Braque Sucec 
charged with Violation of Restraining 
Order, “Sucec lodged at CCJ.” 

Suspicious 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 10, 2:54 a.m., 400 block 9th 
Ave., “female standing in the road near 
TNT Market/domestic dispute at loca-
tion,” 39-year old Mary Dyan Abraham 
charged with Assault IV-Domestic & 
Harassment, “transported to Coos Co. 

Coos County Cops, May 2021, page 12 

Curry County Courthouse 
29821 Ellensburg Ave. 
Gold Beach, OR 97444 
Telephone: 541.247.4511 
 
Coos County Courthouse 
250 N. Baxter 
Coquille, OR 97423 
Telephone: 541.396.7500 
 
Douglas County Courthouse 
1036 SE Douglas St. 
Roseburg, OR 97470 
Telephone: 541.957.2471 
 
Lane County Courthouse 
125 E. 8th Ave. 
Eugene, OR 97401 
Telephone: 541.682.4020 
 
Lincoln County Courthouse 
225 W. Olive St. 
Newport, OR 97365 
Telephone: 541.265.4236 
 
Tillamook County Courthouse 
201 Laurel Avenue 
Tillamook, OR 97141 
Telephone: 503.842.2596 
 
Clatsop County Courthouse 
749 Commercial St. 
Astoria, OR 97103 
Telephone: 503.325.8555 

Oregon Coast 
Courthouses  

We Sell, Service & Install:  Wayne Dalton, Amarr,  
Northwest Door, Overhead & CHI 

 

(541) 269-5143 Toll Free (800) 537-7381 
625 H St., Coos Bay, Oregon 97420 

CCB#175813 

Coos, Curry, 
Douglas, 

Lane,  
Lincoln,  

Linn & Ben-
ton counties 
since 1979. 

Advertising rates are 
affordable, and we 
reach Reedsport to 

Myrtle Point. 
Call (541) 290-9365 for 

more information. 



Jail.” 

DWS 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 10, 4:22 p.m., 3200 block 
Ocean Blvd., “traffic stop resulting in 
arrest,” 31-year old Zacherie Vincent 
Prescott charged with DWS-
Misdemeanor, “cited in lieu of custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 10, 4:43 p.m., 2051 Newmark 
Ave., Walmart, “result of traffic stop,” 
27-year old Benjamin Kolton Remy ar-
rested on CBPD warrant charging Fail-
ure to Perform the Duties of a Driver to 
Injured Persons, 2-counts Reckless Driv-
ing, Recklessly Endangering Another 
Person and Failure to Appear on a Crim-
inal Citation; CCSO warrant charging 
Probation Violation on Possession of 
Meth & Felon in Possession of a Re-
stricted Weapon charges, “Remy cited in 
lieu of custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for March 26, 12:13 p.m., 1700 block 
Sherman Ave., 50-year old Curtis Tar-
box arrested on NBPD warrant charging 
Probation Violation on Possession of 
Meth, “subject was transported to CCJ, 

he was also permanently trespassed.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for March 26, 4:24 p.m., “CCSO served 
NBPD valid warrant” on 34-year old 
Crystal Dawn Bolen, Coos Bay, charg-
ing Burglary II, Criminal Trespass II. 

Bicycle Stop 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for March 26, 5:52 p.m., 3300 block 
Broadway, 42-year old Christopher 
Shawn Carter “cited and released fol-
lowing a traffic stop on a bicycle.”  Re-
ferred to DA’s Office for Attempt to 
Elude on Bicycle and Reckless Endan-
gering. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for March 26, 6:23 p.m., Newmark & 
Cedar, 30-year old Jessica S. Dixon, 
Coos Bay, arrested on CBPD warrant 
charging Probation Violation on Posses-
sion of Meth, FTA I, “PO authorized 
detainer & CCJ will lodged, subject 
transported to CCJ.” 

DUII 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for March 27, 12:50 a.m., Commercial 
& Ash, 26-year old Maria I. Bounds, 
North Bend, cited for DUII-Alcohol 

(BAC 0.15) issued citation for VBR, 
Violation of Speed Limit 64/35.” 

Suspicious 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for March 27, 7:07 p.m., 2000 block 
Inland Dr., “report of suspicious subject 
in bushes doing in appropriate things, 
officer checked bushes behind property 
& located wanted subject,” 29-year old 
Craig W. Hyatt, North Bend, charged 
with Placing Offensive Substances in 
Waters, on Highways, or other Property, 
warned for Trespass II, “cited in lieu of 
custody.” 

DWS 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for March 27, 8:40 p.m., Newmark & 
Edgewood, 27-year old Nicholas A. 
Corral, North Bend, charged with Con-
tempt of Court, cited for DWS Violation 
& Failure of Previous Violation to File 
Insurance, warned for VBR & Failure to 
Signal, “driver drove vehicle back to his 
house.” 

Indecent 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for March 29, 1:27 p.m., 3400 block Fir 
St., “report of 2 subjects having sex in a 
vehicle/officers responded, subjects 
were warned for Public Indecency, there 

were advised to move vehicle,” or it will 
be towed. 

Disorderly 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for March 30, 5:32 a.m., Grant & 
Lakeshore, 35-year old Christine Carter 
“referred to DA’s Office for Disorderly 
Conduct & Resisting.” 

Counterfeit 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for March 30, 4:23 p.m., 1800 block 
Newmark St., “report of counterfeit bill / 
officer responded, bill was seized, no 
suspects.” 

Assault 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for March 31, 6:01 a.m., 2500 block 
State St., 21-year old David Bull taken 
into custody on charges of Assault IV/
Domestic, Menacing, Rape III, Sex 
Abuse III, Attempt Assault Police Of-
ficer, Resisting Arrest, & Escape II, 
“subject was transported to CCJ.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for April 1, 7:31 p.m., McDaniel & 
Bayview, “traffic stop, NBPD served 
valid CCSO warrant” on 62-year old 
Kelly L. Reynolds, North Bend, charg-
ing DUII, cited for DWS, Failure of Pre-
vious Violation to File Insurance, Driv-
ing Uninsured, “had a passenger who 
had a license & drive vehicle.” 

Stolen Bikes 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for April 3, 10:09 a.m., 1503 Virginia 
Ave., “theft of bicycles from back of 
truck while staying at Quality Inn, vic-
tims came to station to make report, of-
ficer contacted RP “report taken.” 

Shoplifter 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for April 3, 11:13 a.m., 1735 Virginia 
Ave., Safeway, “report of shoplift that 
left in vehicle, value $123.09, officer 
respond / report taken.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for April 3, 4:24 p.m., Oak & 16th, 
“several reports of female yelling and 
acting erratic, officers contacted subject 
and served valid Linn Co. warrant” on 
35-year old Christine Grace Carter, 
Junction City, charging FTA II, “issued 
citation.” 

Disturbance 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for April 6, 10:14 a.m., 2700 block 
Broadway Ave., “report of dispute male 
& female / officers responded, advised 
verbal only,” 27-year old Jacob Rhyner 
cited and “released for a Theft that oc-
curred at Big 5 Sporting Goods,” cited 
for Theft III.  

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for April 7, 4:15 p.m., Clark & Sherman, 
“report of male on bicycle kicking dog 

                        Coos County Cops, May 2021, page 13 

 

Oregon Coast Sheriff’s Offices  
& Oregon State Police  

Command Centers 

Gold Beach OSP Worksite 
28200 Hunter Ck. 

Gold Beach, OR  97444 
541-247-6641 

 

Florence OSP Worksite 
4480 Hwy. 101, Bldg. E 

Florence, OR  97439 
541-997-9635 

 
 

Curry Co. Sheriff 
29808 Colvin St. 

Gold Beach, OR  97444 
541-247-3242 

 

Coos Co. Sheriff 
250 N. Baxter 

Coquille, OR  97423 
541-396-7800 

 
 

OSP Coos Bay Area Command 
1360 Airport Lane 

North Bend, OR  97459 
541-888-2677 

 

OSP Newport Area Command 
52 NE 73rd St. 

Newport, OR  97365 
541-265-5354 

Douglas Co. Sheriff 
680 Fir Ave. 

681 Reedsport, OR  97467 
541-271-4802 

 

Lane Co. Sheriff 
125 E. 8th Ave. 

Eugene, OR  97401 
541-682-4150 

Lincoln Co. Sheriff 
225 W. Olive St., #206, Newport, OR  97365 

541-265-4139 



that is collapsing / officers located sub-
ject, UTL injuries on the animal, served 
CBPD valid warrant” on 35-year old 
Levi Johnson, Florence, charging FTA 
on Unlawful Possession Meth, “cited in 
lieu of custody, warned to register the 
animal and have the right vaccinations 
for that.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for April 7, 5:18 p.m., “CCSO served 
valid NBPD warrant” on 47-year old 
Daniel Cowan, Coos Bay, charging FTA 
on Burglary II, Criminal Trespass II & 
Unlawful Possession of Meth.  “Issued 
court date.” 

Generator Theft 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for April 9, 9:52 a.m., 1500 block Vir-
ginia Ave., “theft of generator while 
parked at location overnight, unknown 
suspect, info to officer.” 

DWS 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for April 9, 11:54 p.m., 1500 block Vir-
ginia Ave., 30-year old Kandyce A. Cer-
vantes, North Bend, charged with DWS 
Misdemeanor, “cited in lieu of custody 
due to COVID-19.”   

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for April 10, 12:19 a.m., Sherman & 
Connecticut, “traffic stop, operator cited 
for RPPD warrants,” Jordan D. 
Jungwirth arrested on RPPD warrants 
charging FTA on Burglary II, Theft I, 
Criminal Mischief II, FTA on Theft I. 

DUII 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for April 10, 3:42 a.m., Thompson & 
No. 19th, 38-year old Donald E. Harvey, 
Coos Bay, cited for DUII (BAC 0.17), 
“vehicle secured on scene, warned for 
Unsignal Right Turn & Exhibition of 
Speed. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for April 10, 10:03 a.m., 2800 block Oak 
St., “report of female locking self in 
bathrooms at park and throwing papers 
with blood on them / officers respond 
and contacted the subject,” 48-year old 
Cathleen Renee Huff, Medford, “warrant 
service in lieu of custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for April 11, 11:46 p.m., “Douglas 
County Jail served valid NBPD war-
rants” on 26-year old Jordan M. Ed-
wards, Reedsport, charging Attempted 
UUV & Theft II, also, FTA on Criminal 
Citation, Theft II, Unlawful Possession 
of Meth. 

Narcotics Investigation 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 13, 12:10 a.m., 700 block So. 
Broadway, “result of traffic stop,” 61-
year old Leanna Kathleen Guerra and 58
-year old Marlan Kent Meek both 
charged with Unlawful Possession of 
Meth and Unlawful Delivery of Meth.  
“Meek & Guerra cited in lieu of custo-
dy.” 

Shoplifter 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 13, 4:07 a.m., 1000 block 
Newmark Ave., “result of trespass,” 20-
year old Raven Adriel English charged 
with Theft III, “cited in lieu of custody 
and released.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 13, 4:47 a.m., 101 W. 5th Ave., 
Lane Co. Jail, Eugene, “warrant service 
by Lane Co. Jail on CBPD warrant,” 
charging 53-year old Tyler Gene Dendy 
with Unlawful Possession of Meth, 
“warrant served by Lane Co. Jail.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 13, 6:49 a.m., 250 No. Baxter 
St., Coquille, CCSO, “CCSO served 
CBPD warrant” on Christopher Adam 
West charging FTA on Unlawful Pos-
session of Meth, “subject lodged CCJ.” 

Trailer Theft 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 13, 12:48 p.m., 1100 block So. 
Broadway, “theft of trailer.” 

Disorderly 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 13, 1:16 p.m., 1200 block 
Newmark Ave., “assist with dispute,” 22
-year old Faith M. Alvarado charged 
with Disorderly Conduct II, “cited in 
lieu of custody.” 

 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 13, 7:45 p.m., 2051 Newmark 
Ave., Walmart, “disorderly subject/
criminal trespass,” 50-year old Randy 
Earl Morgan charged with Criminal 
Trespass II, “Morgan cited in lieu of 
custody.” 

Tool Box Theft 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 14, 7:24 a.m., No. 6th St., Mo-
tel 6, Theft of tool boxes from bed of 
work trucks.” 

Bike Theft 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 14, 8 a.m., Terrace Motel, 
“theft of bike.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 14, 9:16 a.m., 100 block So. 
Broadway St., “subject back at loca-
tion,” 73-year old Roy Fernandez 
charged with Criminal Trespass II, 
“cited in lieu of custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 14, 3:09 p.m., 1600 block 
Ocean Blvd., “warrant service,” 24-year 
old Arthur Michael Jones arrested on 
CBPD warrant charging Assault IV Do-
mestic, 2 counts Strangulation Domestic, 
Menacing Domestic, 2 counts Reckless-
ly Endangering Another Person, Harass-
ment and Unauthorized Use of a Motor 
Vehicle, “Jones lodged at CCJ.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 14, 7:19 p.m., 2700 block 
Woodland Dr., “result criminal tres-
pass,” 41-year old Aaron Douglas 
Vonzell arrested on Douglas Co. warrant 
charging FTA on Criminal Trespass II 
and Theft III, “Vonzell transported to 
Reedsport City Jail by Oregon State Po-
lice.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CQPD log 
for April 15, 2:42 p.m., 800 block E. 5th 
St., 26-year old Jordan Michael Edwards 
charged with Criminal Trespass II, 
“Edwards was cited in lieu of custody.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CQPD log 
for April 15, 9:01 p.m., Sturdivant Park, 

“trespass at location,” 46-year old Kori 
Nicole Tonnesenn charged with Crimi-
nal Trespass II, Interfering with Peace 
Officer & Resisting Arrest, “transported 
to Coos Co. Jail.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 15, 12:37 a.m., 100 block 
Kruse Ave., “follow up,” 35-year old 
James Steven Spear arrested on CBPD 
warrant for Criminal Driving While Sus-
pended or Revoked, also Criminal Mis-
chief II twice, “Spear cited in lieu of 
custody.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 15, 10:49 a.m., 200 block No. 
Broadway, “result of subject refusing to 
leave business,” 73-year old Roy Ralph 
Fernandez charged with Criminal Tres-
pass II & Harassment, “cited in lieu of 
custody and released.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 15, 1:08 a.m., 100 block NW 
5th St., Corvallis PD, “warrant service by 
Corvallis Pd, on CBPD warrant,” charg-
ing 34-year old Mellissa Ann Cornett 
with Unlawful Possession of Meth, At-
tempted Assault of a Public Safety Of-
ficer, Resisting Arrest and Criminal 
Trespass II, “arrested by Corvallis PD.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 16, 12:19 a.m., Dallas, Oregon, 
“warrant service by Dallas PD” on Ka-
ren Latisha Nealeigh charging Criminal 
Mischief in the 3rd Degree. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 16, 1:35 a.m., Coburg, Oregon, 
“Coburg PD is out with subject now,” 28
-year old Caleb William Burns arrested 
on CBPD warrant charging Probation 
Violation on Unlawful Possession of 
Meth. 

DWS 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 16, 4:37 a.m., So. Bayshore Dr. 
& Anderson Ave., “from traffic stop,” 
56-year old David Allen Callender 
charged with DWS-Misdemeanor, “cited 
in lieu of custody.” 
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Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 16, 1:02 p.m., 200 block No. 
Broadway, “subject previously tres-
passed back out at location threatening 
staff & employees,” 73-year old Roy 
Ralph Fernandez charged with Criminal 
Trespass II, “cited in lieu of custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 16, 6:44 p.m., So. Em;pire & 
Wisconsin, “traffic stop /warrant ser-
vice,” 42-year old Brian Ray Williams 
arrested on Douglas Co. SO warrant 
charging Probation Violation on original 
charge of Failure to Comply, “Williams 
cited in lieu of custody.” 

DWS 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 16, 7:16 p.m., So. Empire & 
Noble, “traffic stop/driving while sus-
pended,” 28-year old Skyler Keith Wal-
drop charged with Driving While Sus-
pended – Misdemeanor, “Waldrop cited 
in lieu of custody.” 

Knife 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 16, 10:58 a.m., Coalbank 
Slough Bridge, “threatened with a 
knife.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CQPD log 
for April 17, 8:25 p.m., 800 block No. 
Folsom St., “result of criminal trespass,” 
21-year old Christian D. Hollcroft 
charged with Criminal Trespass II, 
“cited in lieu of custody and released.” 

Disorderly 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 17, 11:10 a.m., 1100 block 
Newmark, “disorderly conduct,” 22-year 
old Auston William Benavidez charged 
with Disorderly Conduct II, “Benavidez 
cited in lieu of custody.” 

Shoplifter 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 17, 1:47 p.m., 100 block No. 
Cammann St., “shoplifter,” 22-year old 
Austin William Benavidez charged with 
Criminal Trespass I & Theft III, 

“Benavidez cited in lieu of custody.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 17, 1:59 p.m., 2051 Newmark 
Ave., Walmart, “criminal trespass,” 27-
year old Jacob M. Rhyner charged with 
Criminal Trespass I, “cited in lieu of 
custody and released.”  Also, 28-year 
old Jessica L. McLaughlin arrested on 
warrants out of Linn Co. SO charging 
Probation Violation on FTA II and FTA 
on Giving False Info, UUV, Criminal 
Mischief II, FTA on PCS Meth & Theft 
III, FTA on Theft III and Giving False 
Info, Criminal Trespass I, FTA on Cita-
tion, and FTA on FTA on PCS Meth, 
FTA on Citation, FTA on Possession 
Stolen Vehicle and FTA on Possession 
Stolen Vehicle.  Corvallis PD warrant 
for FTA on Possession Stolen Vehicle & 
Unlawful Possession Meth, “cited and 
released on warrants.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 17, 6:20 p.m., 400 block 5th St., 
MPPD, “warrant service,” 62-year old 
Freddie W. Wilson arrested by Myrtle 
Point PD on Coquille PD warrant charg-
ing DUII, Criminal Driving While Sus-
pended or Revoked & Reckless Driving. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 17, 11:31 p.m., Elrod & 7th St., 
“warrant service on 2 NBPD warrants by 
CBPD, as result of traffic stop,” 41-year 
old Chad Lee Fondren arrested on 
NBPD warrant charging FTA on Crimi-
nal Citation, and second warrant charg-
ing Contempt of Court & VRO, “cited in 
lieu of custody and released.” 

Fight 
According to an entry on the CQPD log 

for April 18, 3:45 p.m., 5th & Elliott, 
“fight” 21-year old Christian Dimitri 
Hollcroft charged with Disorderly Con-
duct II & Misuse of 911, “Hollcroft cited 
in lieu of custody.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 18, 3:19 a.m., 1000 block 
Newmark Ave., “result of trespass,” 20-
year old Raven Adriel English charged 
with Criminal Trespass II, “cited in lieu 
of custody and released.” 

Burglary 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 18, 3 p.m., 200 block So. Em-
pire Blvd., “burglary.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 18, 5:25 p.m., “warrant ser-
vice,” 47-year old Shaun Cole Nix ar-
rested on Douglas Co. SO warrant 
charging FTA on Failure to Register as a 
Sex Offender, “Nix cited in lieu of cus-
tody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 19, 6:30 p.m., 500 block 2nd 
St., “warrant service,” 73-year old Roy 
Ralph Fernandez charged with Harass-
ment II & two-counts Recklessly Endan-
gering Another Person. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 19, 800 block Central Ave, 
“warrant service,” 57-year old Joseph 
Allen Boyd arrested on CBPD warrant 
charging FTA on Menacing, Criminal 
Trespass II, FTA on Disorderly Conduct 
II, CCSO warrant for FTA on Criminal 
Trespass I, Theft III & FTA on Criminal 
Citation, “Boyd cited in lieu of custody.” 
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Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 20, 1:33 a.m., 1900 block 
Newmark Ave., “suspicious subject,” 30
-year old Eithen Nicholas Nordholm 
charged with Criminal Trespass II, 
“Nordholm cited in lieu of custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for April 13, “Eugene PD served valid 
NBPD warrant” on 58-year old Melanie 
R. Ziemendorf, Eugene, charging Proba-
tion Violation on Unlawful Use of 
Weapon. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for April 14, 5:56 a.m., 27-year old Per-
ry Dwight Simpson “taken into custody 
by Oregon Department of Corrections 
on our warrant” charging ID Theft & 
Fraudulent Use of Credit Card. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for April 15, 2080 Public Square Ct., 
“Nexdor reported suspicious subject 
possibly doing drugs in vehicle parked 
outside, officers contacted the occupant, 
served Douglas Co. SO valid warrant” 
on 29-year old Korey Button, Coos Bay, 
issued Canyonville Justice warrant 
charging Probation Violation for Con-
tempt of Court. 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for April 16, 2:39 a.m., 43-year old 
Katrina V. O’Neal, North Bend, charged 
with Possession Meth, Resisting Arrest, 
“cited in lieu of custody due to COVID-
19 .” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for April 17, “CBPD served 2 valid 
NBPD warrants” on 41-year old Chad L. 

Fondren, North Bend, charging FTA on 
Criminal Citation, Contempt of Court, 
VRO, “subject cited in lieu of custody 
due to COVID-19.” 

Dispute 
According to an entry on the CQPD log 
for April 20, 10:11 a.m., No. Elliott & 
No. 10th, “result of dispute,” 37-year old 
Nicholas B. Sucec charged with Reck-
less Endangerment x2 count, Criminal 
Mischief I & Menacing x2 counts, 
“arrested and transported to CCJ.” 

UEMV 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 20, 7:51 a.m., 1313 No. 
Bayshore Dr., Red Lion Inn, “unlawful 
entry into MV.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 20, 11:16 p.m., 400 block No. 
Bayshore Dr., “warrant service,” 43-year 
old Brenda M. Latimer arrested on 
CCSO warrant charging Contempt of 
Court – Child Support & Contempt of 
Court – Child Support, “Latimer cited in 
lieu of custody.” 

UEMV 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 21, 8:32 a.m., 800 block 9th 
Ave., “theft from vehicle.” 

Burglary 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 21, 4:10 p.m., 1100 block 
Newmark Ave., “reporting break-in of 
several units over the past 2 months.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 21, 4:37 p.m., Curtis & 9th Ct., 
“traffic stop resulting in warrant arrest,” 
62-year old Kelly Lee Reynolds arrested 
on Douglas Co. warrant charging FTA 
on DWS, “cited in lieu of custody.” 

 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for April 14, 5:56 a.m., 27-year old Per-
ry Dwight Simpson “taken into custody 
by Oregon Department of Corrections 
on our warrant” charging ID Theft & 
Fraudulent Use of Credit Card. 

UEMV 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for April 19, 7:58 a.m., 3100 block Pine 
St., “vehicle entered and items taken 
sometime over night / report taken.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for April 21, 1:01 a.m., “Benton Co. SO 
served valid NBPD warrant’ on 24-year 
old Alfredo Garcia-Gomez, Harrisburg, 
charging FTA on DUII. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the NBPD log 
for April 21, 7:03 p.m., “Curry Co. SO 
served valid NBPD warrant” on 32-year 
old Joel C. Jones III, transient, charging 
Resisting Arrest X2, Escape III X2, 
Criminal Trespass II, Interfering with 
Law Enforcement Animal, Escape II, 
“cited in lieu of custody due to COVID-
19.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 22, 7:18 a.m., So. Broadway, 
“criminal trespass,” 73-year old Roy 
Ralph Fernandez charged with Criminal 
Trespass II, “Fernandez was cited in lieu 
of custody.” 

Theft of Services 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 22, 8:55 a.m., 300 block So. 2nd 
St., “theft of services,” 38-year old Mi-
chael E. Dunn charged with Probation 
Violation Detainer, CBPD warrants 
charging Probation Violation on Unlaw-
ful Use of Weapon & Felon in Posses-
sion of Weapon, Unlawful Possession of 
Meth & Criminal Mischief II, Criminal 
Mischief II, FTA on Criminal Citation, 
and five-counts of Criminal Mischief II, 
“lodged at Coos County Jail.” 

Coalbank Slough Bridge 
According to an entry on the Coos Bay 
Police log for April 22, 8 p.m., Coalbank 
Slough Bridge, “reporting dispute under 
bridge, subject punched female.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 22, 11:12 p.m., “warrant ser-
vice by CBPD on CCSO warrant,” 
charging 35-year old Kristin N. Rexine 
with Contempt of Court, “cited in lieu of 
custody and released.” 

Generator Theft 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 22, 11:12 p.m., 1800 block 
Thomas Ave., “theft of generator.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 22, 11:24 p.m., 101 NW A St., 
Grants Pass PD, “Grants Pass PD out 
with wanted subject confirming war-
rant,” 54-year old Donnie Wayne Snow 
charged with Theft II on CBPD war-
rant.” 

Reckless Driving 
According to an entry on the CQPD log 
for April 23, 4:17 p.m., Hwy. 42 & Lee 
Valley Rd., “reckless driving,” 20-year 
old Gage Dubuc charged with Reckless 
Driving, “Dubuc was cited in lieu of 
custody.” 

Arrest 
According to an entry on the CQPD log 
for April 23, 7:42 p.m., Hwy. 42 & Fin-
ley Lp., “traffic stop resulting in arrest,” 
40-year old Stephanie Kay Alvarado 
charged with Using Anothers License, 
ID Theft, Fail to Carry & Present, Carry-
ing Concealed Weapon, Felon Posses-
sion of Weapon and Probation Violation.  
“Transported to CCJ.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CQPD log 
for April 24, 9:18 p.m., Hwy. 42, mp 15, 
“out with one,” 42-year old Nichola Fan-
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drem arrested on CBPD warrant charg-
ing Criminal Driving – Misdemeanor, 
“cited in lieu of custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 23, 1:12 p.m., Newmark & 
Norman, “dispute,” 33-year old Mark 
Anthony Dixon “was cited in lieu of 
custody on a North Bend PD warrant.” 

DWS 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 23, 5:35 p.m., 8th & Hemlock, 
“result of traffic stop,” 30-year old 
Kandyce Arlene Cervantes charged with 
DWS-Misdemeanor, “Cervantes cited in 
lieu of custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 23, 6:09 p.m., 1020 So. 1st St. 
Fred Meyer, “criminal trespass,” 36-year 
old Brandon Grahm Ross Lee, “cited in 
lieu of custody on warrants out of Coos 
Bay Police, Coos County S/O and Rose-
burg Police, “Lee was cited on new 
charge of Criminal Trespass II.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 23, 6:49 p.m., 10001 No. 
Bayshore Dr., Super 8 Motel, “criminal 
trespass,” 36-year old Jennifer Lynn 
Sanchez charged with Criminal Trespass 
II, “Sanchez cited in lieu of custody.” 

Burglary 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 23, 7:03 p.m., 700 block So. 4th 
St., “burglary.” 

DUII 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 23, 8:32 p.m., Newmark & 
Wallace, “result of traffic stop,” 52-year 
old Anthony Vince Quintel arrested on 
Douglas Co. warrant charging FTA on 
Harassment, additionally charged with 
DUII, “Quintel cited in lieu of custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 24, 12:49 a.m., 1000 block So. 
1st St., “traffic stop resulting in warrant 
arrest,” 30-year old Terry Lee Thurman 
arrested on NBPD warrant charging 
FTA on nine-counts of ID Theft, eight-
counts Theft I, one-count Theft II, “cite 
in lieu of custody.” 

DWS 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 24, 2:23 a.m., Libby Ln. & 
Clover Dr., “traffic stop resulting in ar-
rest,” 28-year old Charles Kaunner Jack-
son charged with DWS Misdemeanor, 
“cite in lieu of custody.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 24, 1:51 p.m., 200 block So. 
Broadway, “criminal trespass,” 29-year 
old Mathue Lee Trent Meighan charged 
with Criminal Trespass II, “Meighan 
cited in lieu of custody.”  At 4:05 p.m., 
same location, same suspect, same 
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charge and “cited in lieu of custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 24, 2 p.m., Lockhart & Front, 
“warrant service,’ 33-year old Sophia 
Nicole Romero “was cited in lieu of 
custody on a Coos Bay warrant charg-
ing” two-counts Criminal Miscief 2nd 
Degree and one-count Criminal Trespass 
1st Degree. 

Hit & Run 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 24, 3:29 p.m., Newmark & Bay 
Burger Inn, “hit & run accident,” 44-
year old Robert Audley Frost III charged 
with Hit & Run, “Frost cited in lieu of 
custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 24, 4:39 p.m., Maryland & 
Schoneman, “warrant service,” 34-year 
old Amanda Pence “was cited in lieu of 
custody on NBPD warrant charging As-
sault 3, Fail to Perform Duties of Driver, 
DUII, Reckless Driving, Reckless En-
danger Another Person, Unlawful Pos-
session Meth & Unlawful Possession 
Heroin.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 24, 5:15 p.m., Bayshore & 
Myrtle, “CBPD served CBPD” warrant 
on 34-year old Antonio Flores charging 
Theft II and Theft III, “Flores cited in 
lieu of custody.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 24, 5:35 p.m., 500 block So. 
Broadway, “criminal trespass,” 52-year 
old Lee Huckabee charged with Crimi-
nal Trespass 2nd Degree. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 24, 6:29 p.m., 250 No. Baxter 
St., Coquille, CCSO, “warrant service,” 
40-year old Janet Austin-Lincoln 
charged with Probation Violation on 
Unlawful Possession of Meth charge. 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 24, 11:19 p.m., 1000 block 
Newmark Ave., “located wanted sub-
ject,” 44-year old Lisa Marie Fridley 
arrested on NBPD warrant charging Pro-
bation Violation on Possession of Meth 
charge and Attempt to Commit Class A 
Misdemeanor, “cited in lieu of custody.” 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 25, 12:39 a.m., 1400 block 
Ocean Blvd., “shots fired from some-
body in the bushes behind location – 
possible burglary,” 40-year old Jeffery 
Allen Socia charged with Criminal Tres-
pass I, Criminal Trespass II & Criminal 
Mischief II.  “Socia cited in lieu of cus-
tody.” 

 

Criminal Trespass 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 25, 2:52 p.m., 400 block So. 4th 
St, Mathue Meighan charged with Crim-
inal Trespass II. 

UEMV 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 25, 2:01 p.m., 300 block So. 
Marple St., “report UEMV.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 25, 6:50 p.m., 300 block So. 
Broadway, “warrant service,” 39-year 
old Joshua Michael Buster Mote charged 
with Interfering with a Peace Officer or 
Parole and Probation Officer, “Mote 
cited in lieu of custody.” 

Disorderly/Mental 
Fourteen entries on the CBPD log for 
Monday, April 26 involving disorderly 
or mental individuals:  8:03 a.m., Salm-
on & Y Marina; 9:09 a.m., 1200 New-
mark Ave., Nancy Devereaux Center; 
9:52 a.m., 1200 block Newmark Ave.; 
10:11 a.m., Wallace & Graham Dodge; 
11:22 a.m., 500 block So. 4th St.; 11:58 
a.m., 500 Central Ave.; 12:01 p.m., 900 
block Arago Ave.; 12:31 p.m., 100 block 
No. 4th St., 3:52 p.m., 500 block Com-
mercial Ave.; 4:04 p.m., 500 Central 
Ave.; 7:44 p.m., 784 W. Central Ave., 
CB Liquor Store; 8:44 p.m., 500 Central 
Ave.; 10:24 p.m., 900 block Arago Ave. 

Disorderly 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 26, 2:37 p.m., 8th & Anderson, 
“disorderly conduct/criminal mischief,” 
39-year old Melissa Louanne Lucas 
charged with Disorderly Conduct II, 
“Lucas cited in lieu of conduct.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 26, 4:38 p.m., 1700 block 
Newmark Ave. “warrant service by 
CBPD on CCSO warrant” charging 41-
year old Randy Zacpal with FTA on 
PCS Meth charge, additional charge of 
PCS Meth, “Zacpal cited in lieu of cus-
tody.” 

Mental Subject Calls 
Entries on the CBPD log for April 27 
involving Mental Subjects calls:  7:19 
a.m., 730 Newmark Ave., USPS, 
“subject hitting trash can and building 
with pipe.” 7:55 a.m., Newmark & Cam-
mann, “mental subject in roadway.”  
9:01 a.m., 1155 Newmark Ave., Free-
dom Laundry, “problems with mental 
subject.”  1:04 p.m., 311 So. Broadway, 
Leaf’s, “suspicious female yelling at 
traffic and refusing to leave.”  1:57 p.m., 
Empire Boat Ramp, “mental subject.”  
6:07 p.m., Newmark & Morrison, 
“mental subject.”  6:50 p.m., 900 block 
Arago Ave., “mental subject.”   

Disorderly Conduct 
Calls 

Entries on the CBPD log for April 27 

involving Disorderly Conduct calls:  
11:39 a.m., 1200 Newmark Ave., Nancy 
Devereux Center, “subject in roadway.”  
11:38 a.m., Newmark & Ocean 
“disorderly conduct.”  12:19 p.m., 3400 
block Vine Ave., “male yelling & 
screaming threats.”  1:57 p.m., 1200 
Newmark Ave., Nancy Devereux Cen-
ter, “disorderly conduct.”  3:42 p.m., 
Newmark & Fir, “out with subject in the 
roadway.”  3:48 p.m., 1200 Newmark 
Ave., Nancy Devereux Center, 
“disorderly conduct.”  7:42 p.m., 700 
block W. Central Ave., “male urinating 
in cardboard bin.”  9:27 p.m., Newmark 
& Morrison, “out with subject in the 
roadway.”  9:56 p.m., Morrison & New-
mark, “subject in the roadway.”   

Burglary 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 27, 10:15 a.m., 1000 block So. 
5th St., “theft of tools and keys occurred 
over the weekend.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 27, 3:13 p.m., 250 No. Baxter 
St., Coquille, “warrant service by CCSO 
on CBPD warrant” charging 30-year old 
Jordan Robert Siemer with Burglary II, 
Theft III & FTA on Criminal Citation, 
“Seimer cited in lieu of custody.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 27, 4:42 p.m., Isthmus Hts. 
Cutoff, “traffic stop/warrant service,” 59
-year old Richard William Cook arrested 
on CBPD warrant charging Probation 
Violation on original charge of Posses-
sion of Meth, “Cook was cited in lieu of 
custody.” 

Counterfeit 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 27, 8:04 p.m., 1001 No. 
Bayshore Dr., Super 8 Motel, 
“counterfeit money.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 27, 11:16 a.m., Coos River 
Hwy. & Chandler Bridge, “warrant ser-
vice on” 23-year old Jacob Alvin Latta 
with Probation Violation on FTA First 
Degree, Unlawful Possession Meth, Es-
cape III, Interfering, Additional citation 
for DWS Violation & Unlawful Posses-
sion Meth, “Latta cited in lieu of custo-
dy.” 

DUII 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 28, 1:49 a.m., Newmark & 
Pine, “result of traffic stop,” 56-year old 
Diana Mary Bass charged with DUII, 
“cited in lieu of custody and released.” 

Burglary 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 28, 4:14 a.m., 285 block So. 
Broadway, Old World Antiques, “break 
in to business as result of alarm activa-
tion.” 

 

Tool Theft 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 28, 8:04 a.m., 1000 block No. 
Bayshore Dr., “theft of tools from vehi-
cle.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 28, 8:19 a.m., 600 block Cen-
tral Ave., “dispute,” 28-year old Jacob 

Oregon Prisons & Jails 
 

Federal prisons:   
Federal Correctional Institution, Sher-

idan (1,350 medium security, 480 
minimum security). 

State prisons:   
    Coffee Creek Correctional Facility, 

Wilsonville (1,685 inmate capacity) 
    Columbia River Correctional Insti-

tution, Portland (595 ic) 
    Deer Ridge Correctional Institu-

tion, Madras (1,867 ic) 
    Eastern Oregon Correctional Insti-

tution, Pendleton (1,659 ic) 
    Mill Creek Correctional Facility, 

Salem (240 ic) 
    Oregon State Correctional Institu-

tion, Salem (880 ic) 
    Oregon State Penitentiary, Salem 

(2,194 ic) 
    Powder River Correctional Facili-

ty, Baker City (366 ic) 
    Santiam Correctional Institution, 

Salem (440 ic) 
    Shutter Creek Correctional Insti-

tution, North Bend (260 ic) 
    South Fork Forest Camp, Tilla-

mook (200 ic) 
    Snake River Correctional Institu-

tion, Ontario (3,050 ic) 
    Two Rivers Correctional Institu-

tion, Umatilla (1,878 ic) 
    Warner Creek Correctional Facili-

ty, Lakeview (496 ic) 

Youth correctional facilities 
Male 

    Eastern Oregon Youth Correction-
al Facility, Burns (50 beds) 

    Hillcrest Youth Correctional Facil-
ity, Salem (180 beds) 

    MacLaren Youth Correctional Fa-
cility, Woodburn (186 beds) 

    North Coast Youth Correctional 
Facility Warrenton (50 beds) 

    Rogue Valley Youth Correctional 
Facility, Grants Pass (100 beds) 

    Tillamook Youth Correctional Fa-
cility, Tillamook County (50 beds) 

Female 
    Oak Creek Youth Correctional 

Facility, Albany (75 beds) 
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Ryan Rodriguez arrested on Multnomah 
Co. warrant charging Harassment, As-
sault IV & Disorderly Conduct II, 
“Rodriguez cited in lieu of custody.” 

Tool Theft 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 28, 11:02 a.m., 1200 block No. 
Bayshore Dr., “theft of tools from job 
site.” 

Warrant 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 28, 11:46 a.m., 500 block So. 
4th St., “traffic stop resulting in warrant 
arrest,” 29-year old Ashley Rose Oaks 
arrested on Deschutes Co. warrant 
charging FTA on Aggravated Theft I, 
Aggravated ID Theft & Computer 
Crime, “cited in lieu of custody.” 

Shoplifters 
According to an entry on the CBPD log 
for April 28, 12:26 p.m., 1020 So. 1st St., 
Fred Meyer, “shoplifter got away with 
merchandise.”  At 3:03 p.m., 1020 So. 
1st St., Fred Meyer, “2 shoplifters at lo-
cation – fled from security.” 

Horse Trailer 
According to an entry on the CQPD log 
for April 28, 5:11 p.m., 300 block No. 
Central Blvd., “theft of horse trailer.” 
 
 

Regional  
 

Shots Fired in Cottage 
Grove 

On 4/6/21 at about 10:00 pm, the Lane 
County Sheriff’s Office responded to the 
39000 block of Row River Road.  Initial 
calls to 911 reported a medical emergen-
cy at the location.  Before medics ar-
rived, additional calls were made to 911 
reporting an active dispute with shots 
fired.  Deputies responded with assis-
tance from Oregon State Police and Cot-
tage Grove Police.  Everyone involved 
was cooperative with responding law 
enforcement officers.  No one was shot 
during the incident, however, two of the 
four victims were transported by ambu-

lance for non-life threatening inju-
ries.  One of the victims was also experi-
encing an unrelated medical issue that 
started before the dispute.  The involved 
persons were known to each other, and 
there is no ongoing threat to the commu-
nity.  Warren Lee Colbert, 54 years old, 
was arrested and lodged at the Lane 
County Jail on multiple charges includ-
ing:  Attempted Assault 1 x2; Unlawful 
Use of a Weapon x3; Assault 4 APA 
Misdemeanor x2; Assault 4 Misdemean-
or; Strangulation APA; Menacing APA 
x3; Menacing; Reckless Endangering 
x3. 

Lane Co. Shooting 
On Friday, April 16, 2021 at about 
10:05pm, the Lane County Sheriff’s 
Office received multiple reports of gun-
shots and a gunshot victim from the 
29000 block of Kelso Street in Eu-
gene.  The Sheriff’s Office, with the 
assistance of Oregon State and Eugene 
Police, responded to the location. A vic-
tim was found with gunshot wounds, 
transported to the hospital and is current-
ly in stable condition.The victim is a 
male 56 years old from Eugene.  The 
suspect fled the scene prior to law en-
forcement arriving. The suspect is iden-
tified as 55 year old Darren Lee 
Woods.  The shooting is believed to be 
related to an ongoing feud between the 
involved.  Woods is a white male, about 
5’11” tall and 165 pounds with grey hair 
and green eyes.  He was last seen driving 
a white 1998 Dodge 1500 bearing Ore-
gon license plate 125MEA.  The truck 
has a sticker across the back window 
with black lettering.  The wheels on the 
truck were described to be chrome and 
the truck is lifted and “sporty.”  The 
involved firearm remains outstanding so 
Woods should be considered armed and 
dangerous.  If anyone sees Woods please 
call 911.  If anyone knows any other 
relevant information, please call the 
sheriff’s office 541-682-4141.should be 
considered armed and dangerous.  If 
anyone sees Woods please call 911.  If 
anyone knows any other relevant infor-
mation, please call the sheriff’s office 

541-682-4141. 

Lane Co. Shooting  
Update 

UPDATE: Lane County Sheriff's Office 
is still attempting to locate shooting sus-
pect Darren Lee Woods, 55.  In addition 
to the 1998 Dodge 1500 Woods was last 
seen driving, LCSO has confirmed that 
Woods is also associated with a white 
1985 Pace Arrow motorhome with 
brown stripes and Oregon license plate 
MH103752.  Please contact the LCSO at 
541-682-4141 if you have information 
regarding this vehicle.  On Friday, April 
16, 2021 at about 10:05pm, the Lane 
County Sheriff’s Office received multi-
ple reports of gunshots and a gunshot 
victim from the 29000 block of Kelso 
Street in Eugene.  The Sheriff’s Office, 
with the assistance of Oregon State and 
Eugene Police, responded to the loca-
tion. A victim was found with gunshot 
wounds, transported to the hospital and 
is currently in stable condition.The vic-
tim is a male 56 years old from Eu-
gene.  The suspect fled the scene prior to 
law enforcement arriving. The suspect is 
identified as 55 year old Darren Lee 
Woods.  The shooting is believed to be 
related to an ongoing feud between the 
involved.  Woods is a white male, about 
5’11” tall and 165 pounds with grey hair 
and green eyes.  He was last seen driving 
a white 1998 Dodge 1500 bearing Ore-
gon license plate 125MEA.  The truck 
has a sticker across the back window 
with black lettering.  The wheels on the 
truck were described to be chrome and 
the truck is lifted and “sporty.”  The 
involved firearm remains outstanding so 
Woods should be considered armed and 
dangerous.  If anyone sees Woods please 
call 911.  If anyone knows any other 
relevant information, please call the 
sheriff’s office 541-682-4141. 

Lane Co. Pursuit 
On 04/26/21 at about 9:00pm, Deputies 
received a report of a suspicious male, 
later identified as 51 year old Terry Al-
bert Conner, attempting to pay for gas 
with multiple credit cards at the Jasper 
Store.  The caller reported that Conner 
then left without paying for the gas and 
provided a license plate for Conner’s 
car, which returned as stolen out of 
Multnomah County. Deputies were in 
the area and located the vehicle on Jas-
per Park Road, at which point they at-
tempted a traffic stop.  Conner refused to 
stop and drove off at high speed, during 
which time he drove through residential 
yards and crashed through fencing.  
Deputies pursued Conner back onto 
Parkway Road to Jasper Road. Spring-
field Police use Spike Strips at Jasper 
Road and Bob Straub Parkway that safe-
ly deflated one of the stolen vehicles 
tires.  Conner continued to refuse to stop 
and accelerated towards Main Street in 
Springfield.  As the pursuit continued, 
Conner stopped the stolen vehicle near 

other stopped motorists at two different 
locations and began to exit the vehicle as 
though he was going to try and take (car 
jack) the other motorist’s car.  As depu-
ties saw this they aggressively moved up 
to Conner, at which point he sped away 
and continued the pursuit.  Based on this 
behavior, when Deputies had an oppor-
tunity to safely do so, they used their 
vehicles to push the stolen vehicle Con-
ner was operating off the road and pin 
him in, effectively stopping the pur-
suit.  Conner initially refused to exit the 
now stopped vehicle, however was even-
tually taken into custody.   In addition to 
a Federal Warrant for Counterfeiting, 
Conner was lodged at the Lane County 
Jail on new  charges of: Attempting to 
Elude a Police Officer, Failure to Per-
form Duties of a Driver, Possession of a 
Stolen Vehicle, Reckless Endangering 
x5, Criminal Mischief 1 x4, Criminal 
Mischief 2, False Information to a Police 
Officer, Reckless Driving, Theft of Ser-
vices, and Theft 2. 

Shots Fired in Eugene 
On 4/27/20201 at 12:05pm the Lane 
County Sheriff’s Office was called to the 
1300 block of N. Park Avenue in Eu-
gene for the report that a male, identified 
as 48 year old Daniel Wayne Wilkinson 
of Eugene, had killed a family dog dur-
ing a mental health crisis.  It was report-
ed by family members that Wilkinson 
was making delusional comments, shot 
the dog, and then barricaded himself in a 
bedroom when confronted by fami-
ly.  Wilkinson was reported to have sev-
eral firearms inside the bedroom.  Wil-
kinson was further reported to have a 
violent history while armed with a fire-
arm.  Deputies arrived on scene and 
learned that there was no home phone, 
Wilkinson did not have a cell phone, and 
there was no way to contact him without 
putting themselves in danger. An armor 
rescue vehicle was called to the scene to 
utilize the loudspeaker and establish 
communication with Wilkinson.  Kelly 
Middle School was one block to the 
north. Contact was made with the school 
and surrounding residence advising them 
of the possible threat.  With the aid of 
that Rescue vehicle’s loudspeaker depu-
ties were able to convince Wilkinson to 
surrender peacefully to law enforcement. 
Several firearms were recovered at the 
scene.  He was taken into custody at 
1:34 pm and lodged at the Lane County 
Jail for the crimes of Unlawful Use of a 
Weapon and Animal Abuse-1. 
There is no ongoing threat to the public 
at this time.     

Former Weyco  
Accountant Sentenced 

EUGENE, Ore.—Susan Tranberg, 62, of 
Eugene, Oregon, was sentenced to feder-
al prison today for defrauding her former 
employer, the Weyerhaeuser Company, 
out of more than $4.5 million, an-
nounced Acting U.S. Attorney Scott 
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Erik Asphaug.  Tranberg was sentenced 
to 57 months in federal prison and three 
years’ supervised release.  According to 
court documents, beginning as early as 

June 2004 and continuing to January 
2019, Tranberg defrauded Weyerhaeuser 
out of more than $4.5 million by submit-
ting fraudulent invoices for payment to a 

fake vendor she created. Tranberg had 
worked for Weyerhaeuser in Springfield, 
Oregon in various positions for more 
than 40 years. A financial analysis deter-
mined that the vast majority of the mon-
ey was used to fund a lavish lifestyle of 
expensive dinners, vacations, six-figure 
wedding expenses, and shopping sprees.  
At some point in or before June 2004, 
Tranberg created a fake timber contract 
between the company and a vendor she 
named after her mother, who was una-
ware of the scheme. Over the next 10 
years, Tranberg would use her positions 
in the company’s accounting and finance 
departments to request cashier’s checks, 
which she then cashed into her own 
bank account. During this time period, 
Tranberg requested and received more 
than $2.6 million.  In June 2014, Weyer-
haeuser transitioned to a new payment 
processing system. To continue her 
scheme, Tranberg set up a fake vendor 
account in the new system and attached 
a letter purportedly from her mother 
describing the documentation provided 
to set up the account. This documenta-
tion included a Form SSA-1099 Social 
Security Statement and a forged Form W
-9 Request for Taxpayer Identification 
Number and Certification. At the time 
Tranberg sent the letter and documenta-
tion, Tranberg’s mother had been de-
ceased for five years.  After setting up 
the fake vendor account, Tranberg con-
tinued her scheme by forging col-

leagues’ signatures on check requests 
and using her colleagues’ computer log-
in credentials without authorization to 
create requests and approve fraudulent 
payments. All requested cashier’s checks 
were sent via private or commercial in-
terstate carrier directly to Tranberg. Dur-
ing these final five years, ending in Jan-
uary 2019, Tranberg requested and re-
ceived nearly $1.9 million.  On January 
29, 2020, Tranberg was charged by su-
perseding criminal information with 
mail fraud, aggravated identity theft, and 
tax evasion. On January 30, 2020, she 
waived indictment and pleaded guilty to 
all three charges.  During sentencing, 
U.S. District Court Judge Michael J. 
McShane also ordered Tranberg to pay 
more than $5.3 million in restitution, to 
include $775,984 to Weyerhaeuser, 
$3,805,223 to the Crime Victims Fund, 
and $807,033 to the IRS.  
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Miller's at the Cove  
Sports Bar & Grill 

 

Oyster Cove Square  
63346 Boat Basin Road , Charleston, Oregon 97420  

(541) 808-2404    
OPEN AGAIN—CALL AHEAD FOR RESERVATIONS 

 

 

DAILY SPECIALS:   
Hand-Dipped Fish & Chips; Fish Tacos; Hand-Pattied Burgers   

Free WI-FI access during business hours 
HAPPY HOUR 7 DAYS A WEEK FROM 4PM - 6PM 

 

 

www.millersatthecove.rocks 

People’s Choice 
Awards 

Winners  
‘Bite of the Bay’ 

“Best in Show” 
“Best Bite” 

Brookings 
801 Chetco 
(541) 469-5391 
 
Coquille 
484 N. Central 
(541) 396-3145 
 
Coos Bay 
579 S. Broadway 
(541) 267-3163 
 
North Bend 
3025 Broadway 
(541) 756-2091 
 
 

Reedsport 
174 N. 16th 
(541) 271-3601 
 
Florence 
4325 Hwy. 101, North 
(541) 997-7178 
 
Newport 
550 E. Olive St. 
(541) 265-6604 
 
Lincoln City 
1025 SW Hwy. 101 
(541) 994-3676 


